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Background:
The COVID-19 pandemic and the current war in Ukraine have
presented opportunities to increase national leadership on
mental health, including support health and care workers.
Member States across the region have worked closely with the
WHO to strengthen their policy levers to support the mental
health and occupational safety policies for the workforce at
various levels including government, organization and local
service levels. To complement these policies, the WHO will
launch the WHO Global Health and Care Compact at the
Seventy-fifth World Health Assembly in May 2022.
Methods:
The WHO has convened Member States to discuss the policy
levers that can support the mental health of health and care
workers. These include online multistakeholder webinar series,
national policy dialogs, ministerial discussions during the
Regional Committee, preparatory consultations for the World
Health Assembly to discuss priority areas and policy. More
recently with the crisis in Ukraine, the WHO has been working
closely with the UN Interagency Steering Committee (IASC)
Reference Group on Mental Health and Psychosocial Support
in Emergency Settings rolling out services for refugees,
including health workers in these settings.
Results:
A number of important policy recommendations are emerging
from this work: (1) strengthening national and political
leadership; (2) adopting stepped approaches; (3) facilitating
collaboration across professions, sectors and levels of syste for
more effective responses; (4) strengthening capacity and
expertise; (5) monitoring effectiveness for continuous
improvement; (6) ensuring acceptability and accessibility.
Conclusions:
Promoting health and well-being and mental health support to
the health and care workforce has become a key priority for
health systems to enable sustainable national health work-
forces. WHO will prioritize country support on this area and
the development of regional guidance.
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Background:
This study considers some of the effective governance tools
that have been utilised to mobilise, redeploy and repurpose the
health workforce during the COVID-19 pandemic to create
surge capacity, protect workforce health and wellbeing and
ensure effective implementation of vaccination programmes.
Methods:
Data were systematically extracted from the Observatory/
WHO Europe/European Commission Health System and
Response Monitor, covering the period from March 2020 to
May 2021 with a focus on four dimensions of health workforce
governance: national/regional government policies; legislation;
regulation; the role and remit of employers and management.

Results:
A wide-range of governance actions across all levels were
required to ensure the health workforce could provide effective
pandemic responses. Creating surge capacity, for example,
often required adoption of emergency legislation to facilitate
exceptional hiring procedures and the changing of (re-
)registration requirements, as well as additional training and
development of new competencies among other actions.
Putting in place physical and mental health support meanwhile
required defining infection control policies, monitoring PPE
supply and distribution, ensuring access to free mental health
support, and implementation of breaks. Some countries also
allowed ‘‘new’’ types of workers to vaccinate; online or in
person training; adjustments to payment mechanisms; and
creating new supervision requirements.
Conclusions:
Pandemic responses have broken up sclerotic governance
structures which have hampered past health workforce
development and reform, new training programmes have
been rapidly developed, leadership roles have been delegated to
a wider-range of health professionals than before and
monitoring systems that provide more rapid data on staffing
levels have been put into place. Learning from and evaluating
these changes will be important to help inform future
pandemic responses.
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Background:
The COVID-19 pandemic revealed the importance of the
health workforce for health system resilience. This study aims
to explore whether and how healthcare system in Europe have
responded to new emergent needs and transformed their
health workforce policies.
Methods:
A qualitative comparative approach is applied, based on multi-
level governance theory and a rapid assessment of three areas
of health workforce policy: mental health, gender equality, and
public health competencies. We consider two years of the
pandemic with a focus on recent waves, October 2021-January
2022. Denmark, Germany, Portugal, Romania and Switzerland
are selected for comparison, representing different health
systems, health workforce conditions and COVID-19 indica-
tors in the European Union and European Economic Area.
Results:
Across countries the pandemic has highlighted mental health
needs, persisting gender inequalities and demand for public
health competencies. Our comparison reveals similar weak-
nesses and governance gaps. (1) Mental health needs of
healthcare workers are increasingly recognised (more strongly
in Denmark and less in Romania with the other countries
clustering in-between); however, health workers’ perceptions
are not used as guidance and effective programmes are lacking.
(2) The situation is worst in relation to gender equality goals
that are largely ignored in pandemic policy and recovery plans.

15th European Public Health Conference 2022 iii21


