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Most COVID-19-related deaths occurred in older adults,
however to date, evidence on determinants of SARS-CoV-2
infection in this population is limited and mostly based on case
series without a comparison group. A telephone-based cross-
sectional study was conducted in November 2020 on a
representative sample of 4,400 people aged �65 years from
the Italian region of Lombardy. We determined the prevalence
of participants reporting a SARS-CoV-2 infection in the period
between the onset of the pandemic and the time of the
interview. To investigate the determinants of the infection, we
estimated odds ratios (OR) and their corresponding 95%
confidence intervals (CI) thorough unconditional multiple
logistic models. We further evaluated if the infection was a
determinant of a worsening in mental health wellbeing.
Overall, 4.9% of participants reported a history of SARS-
CoV-2 infection. No significant relationship between sex and
infection was observed. SARS-CoV-2 infection was less
frequently reported in subjects aged �70 (OR = 0.55; 95%
0.41-0.74) compared to 65-69 years. We didn’t observe any
trend after 70 years of age. Participants reporting at least one
chronic condition had a lower infection rate compared to
healthy subjects (OR = 0.68 95% CI: 0.49-0.93). Separated/
divorced subjects more frequently reported infection than
married/cohabiting ones (OR = 2.33 95% CI: 1.29-4.20). Self-
reported history of SARS-CoV-2 infection resulted being a
determinant of an increase in depressive symptoms
(OR = 1.57; 95% CI: 1.17-2.10). In this large study - among
the few assessing the determinants of SARS-CoV-2 infection in
a representative sample of older adults -, the prevalence of a
history of infection in November 2020 approached 5%. We
found that persons aged 70 and above and those with chronic
conditions, thus individuals with likely less social interactions,
were less frequently exposed to SARS-CoV-2 infection.
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The COVID-19 pandemic strongly impacted older people, not
only in terms of clinical outcome but also in care provision.
Investigating trends of changes in healthcare services access
among older subjects during the pandemic, along with
studying potential determinants, is of utmost interest to
identify the most at-risk individuals. We used data from LOST
in Lombardia, a cross-sectional study conducted on a
representative sample of 4,400 older adults (aged 65 or
more) in autumn 2020. Data were collected about lifestyles,
mental health, and access to healthcare services before and
during the pandemic. To investigate potential determinants of
changes in healthcare access, we presented prevalence ratios

(PRs) estimated through multivariable log-binomial regression
models. Twenty-one per cent of the participants increased
telephone contacts with general practitioner (GP), 9.6%
specialist visits for a fee, while 22.4% decreased GP visits,
7.5% ED access, 6% hospitalisations, 12.3% outpatient visits,
9.1% diagnostic exams. The prevalence of the cancellation or
delay of medical appointments by the patient’s decision was
23.8%, with higher proportions among men, among indivi-
duals aged 75 or over as compared to those aged 65-74, and
among individuals with a higher self-reported economic status
(p-value<0.05). People with comorbidities more frequently
cancelled or postponed visits, reduced ED access or hospita-
lisations. Moreover, individuals with worsened mental health
status showed a higher prevalence to cancel or delay visits and
to reduce ED access. The decrease in healthcare provision and
consultations could result in mortality and morbidity excess.
Our results should inform targeted intervention to bridge the
gaps and overcome the health inequalities that the pandemic
has deepened. Exploring the underlying reasons and determi-
nants for healthcare avoiding or delaying among the most
vulnerable groups is crucial for epidemic preparedness and
planning future interventions.
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Background:
Healthcare delivery reorganization during the COVID-19
emergency may have had a significant impact on access to
care for older adults with chronic conditions.
Methods:
We investigated such impact among all adults with chronic
conditions aged �65 years, identified through the electronic
health databases of two local health agencies - ATS Brianza and
ATS Bergamo - from the Lombardy region, Italy. We
considered hospitalizations for 2020 compared to the average
2017-2019 and quantified differences using rate ratios (RRs).
Results:
Overall, in 2017-2019 there were a mean of 374,855 older
adults with �1 chronic condition per year in the two ATS and
405,371 in 2020. Hospitalizations significantly decreased from
84,624 (225.8/1000) in 2017-2019 to 78,345 (193.3/1000) in
2020 (RR 0.86). Declines were reported in individuals with
many chronic conditions and for most Major Diagnostic
Categories, except for diseases of the respiratory system. The
strongest reductions were observed in hospitalizations for
individuals with active tumours, particularly for surgical ones.
Hospitalization rates increased in individuals with diabetes,
likely due to COVID-19-related diseases.
Conclusions:
Although determinants of the decrease in demand and supply
for care among chronic older adults are to be further explored,
this raises awareness on their impacts on chronic patients’
health in the medium and long run.
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