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Abstract
Dopaminergic neurons in the ventral mesencephalon (the
ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex) are known for
their role in a multitude of behaviors, including cognition,
reward, addiction and voluntary movement. Dysfunctions of
these neurons are the underlying cause of various neuropsy-
chiatric disorders, such as depression, addiction and
schizophrenia. In addition, Parkinson’s disease (PD), which is
the second most common degenerative disease in developed
countries, is characterized by the degeneration of dopaminergic
neurons, leading to the core motor symptoms of the disease.
However, only a subset of dopaminergic neurons in the ventral
mesencephalon is highly vulnerable to the disease process.
Indeed, research over several decades revealed that the

neurons in the ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex
do not form a homogeneous group with respect to anatomy,
physiology, function, molecular identity or vulnerability/dys-
function in different diseases. Here, we review how the concept
of dopaminergic neuron diversity, assisted by the advent and
application of new technologies, evolved and was refined over
time and how it shaped our understanding of PD pathogenesis.
Understanding this diversity of neurons in the ventral mesen-
cephalic dopaminergic complex at all levels is imperative for the
development of new and more selective drugs for both PD and
various other neuropsychiatric diseases.
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Parkinson’s disease, single-cell analysis.
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One of the most studied neurotransmitter systems in
neuroscience is the dopaminergic system. This strong interest
is based on the involvement of dopaminergic circuits in a
multitude of neurological and psychiatric diseases, including

Parkinson’s disease (PD), Huntington’s disease and both
schizophrenia and addiction. The association of dopaminer-
gic neurons with these diseases highlights their role in the
control and maintenance of proper motor and cognitive
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functions, reinforcement, learning and motivational aspects
of the healthy brain. The most prominent dopaminergic
neurons in the brain are arguably those of the ventral
mesencephalon. The death of these neurons is the hallmark
of PD and is associated with severe motor dysfunction.
Therefore, it is not surprising that the understanding of the
function and biology of these neurons is highly important in
terms of developing new therapeutic avenues to treat this
currently incurable disease. Understanding the function and
biology of neurons, however, starts with understanding the
details of their neuroanatomy before their molecular charac-
teristics can be considered. Thus, we will first review the
neuroanatomy of the dopaminergic system in the brain. This
review is written in a historical context to show that it is only
through the continuous and parallel development of new
technologies that we obtain more insights and a progressively
refined understanding of the brain circuitries involved in
diseases, for example, PD. Indeed, the discovery and
functional characterization of the dopaminergic system is a
key example of this process of discovery, in that each
technological innovation deepened and advanced our knowl-
edge of this system. These technological advancements first
allowed the subdivision of the regions and neurons within the
ventral mesencephalon according to their cytoarchitectonic
features. This advance was followed by the discovery of the
neurochemical identity of the neurons in this region and,
subsequently, descriptions of interneuronal connectivity and
the location of these neurons in larger circuits. In addition,
with the advent of the field of genetics and thus genetic
technologies, further in-depth characterizations were made
with respect to the role of dopaminergic neurons in distinct
behaviors and their molecular identities. Because of the high
interest in the dopaminergic system and its importance in
both PD and other neuropsychiatric diseases, a vast amount
of literature has already been produced. Thus, we will not be
able to acknowledge all of the important work that has been
performed by hundreds of investigators in this field. We are
therefore forced to select distinct historical and scientific
hallmarks; a selection that is, of course, influenced by our
own understanding of history and science. Below, we will
briefly discuss the discovery and nature of the following four
layers of complexity of midbrain (mesencephalic) dopamin-
ergic neurons: cytoarchitectonics, neurochemistry, connec-
tome and molecular identity, as well as the significance of
each of these layers to PD.

Neuroanatomy of the ventral mesencephalic
dopaminergic neurons

Discovery of the substantia nigra and its relationship with

Parkinson’s disease

In 1786, Felix Vicq d’Azyr published the description of a
structure termed the ‘locus niger crurum cerebri’ (Vicq
d’Azyr 1786). It was later discovered that the dark

appearance of this structure, which allowed its recognition
without microscopic staining techniques, is because of the
exceptionally high content of melanin in its cells. Five years
later, Samuel Paul von Soemmering (1791) again described
this dark structure; hence, it was also termed the ‘Ganglion of
Soemmering’ or substantia nigra Soemmeringi. Thereafter,
several neuroscience pioneers, using simple staining meth-
ods, such as Nissl staining and staining with gold and
potassium chloride, described the substantia nigra (SN) as
being located in the midbrain tegmentum. Specifically, the
SN was described as being ventral to the red nucleus,
between the cerebral peduncles and the medial lemniscus
(Burdach 1822; Forel 1877, 1907; Meynert 1884; Sano 1910;
Edinger 1911; Gray 1918) (Fig. 1). These pioneers had
already discovered three hallmarks of the SN: first, that it is
similarly organized in all vertebrates (Luys 1865; Sano 1910;
Edinger 1911); second, that the pigmentation of the cells in
the SN is obvious in humans (Luys 1865; Forel 1877) and
third, that the SN is composed of an upper, cell-dense layer
and a lower, cell-sparse layer (Mingazzini 1889; Ramon y
Cajal 1899–1904, Sano 1910), called the substantia nigra
pars compacta (SNc) and the substantia nigra pars reticularis
(SNr) respectively. In addition, a third group of cells in the
rostral–lateral portion of the SN were cytoarchitectonically
demarcated and termed the substantia nigra pars lateralis
(Huber et al. 1943; Ma 1989).
The history of the discovery of the substantia nigra in the

ventral mesencephalon is connected with the discovery of the
neuropathological symptoms of PD (reviewed in Parent and
Parent 2010). Still, the symptoms of PD, specifically tremor,
have been known since ancient times. These symptoms were,
for example, described in the ancient Indian medical system,
Ayurveda, under the name of Kampavata (reviewed in
Manyam 1990), and in western culture by Galen 175 AD
(Sider and McVaugh 1979). It was not until 1690 that a
Hungarian physician Ferenc P�apai P�ariz reported the occur-
rence of all four cardinal symptoms of PD: tremor,

Fig. 1 Location of the substantia nigra, ventral to the red nucleus and
dorsal to the cerebral peduncles, as depicted in Gray’s (1918)
anatomy. Source: http://www.wikimd.org/wiki/index.php/The_Mid-brain_

or_Mesencephalon; downloaded January 28, 2016.
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bradykinesia, rigor and postural instability (reviewed in
Bereczki 2010) in a Hungarian medical text (P�ariz 1690). A
similar description was then given by James Parkinson over
100 years later in 1817 in his famous ‘Essay on Shaking
Palsy’, (Parkinson J. An Essay on the Shaking Palsy.
Whittingham and Rowland for Sherwood, Neely, and Jones;
London). Approximately 60 years later, the condition was
recognized as a medical entity by Jean-Martin Charcot, who
named it after James Parkinson (Charcot 1892; Goetz 1986).
Blocq, Marinesco and Brissaud discovered in 1892 and 1893
that lesions in the substantia nigra are associated with PD
(Blocq and Marinesco 1892; Brissaud 1893). The seminal
work of Constantin Tr�etiakoff in 1919 supported this view
through the analysis of the SN in 54 brains, nine of which were
from patients with PD. In all nine brains, Tr�etiakoff reported
the distinct loss of the pigmented neurons in the SN, the
presence of neuronal deposits (which he named corps de
Lewy, referring to their first description in the dorsal nucleus of
the vagus nerve by Lewy 1912) and the presence of
inflammatory infiltrations (Tr�etiakoff 1919). All of these
characteristics are currently regarded as the major neuropatho-
logical hallmarks of PD. Neglecting these findings, neu-
roanatomists still focused on the striatum as the primary site of
the pathophysiology of PD. Then, in 1938, Hassler confirmed
the findings of Tr�etiakoff concomitantly with the observation
that the striatum in PD patients is neuroanatomically largely
unaltered (Hassler 1938), thus shifting the neuropathological
origin of the disease from the striatum to the SN.

The dopaminergic nature of the neurons in the ventral
mesencephalon

From 1938 onward the ‘neuroanatomical history’ of the SN
is intimately intermingled with the history of the discovery of
the brain’s dopaminergic system. Again, these advances were
only possible because of the innovation of novel neuro-
chemical techniques that enabled researchers to study
chemical compounds, for example, catecholamines, in tissues
(Bertler et al. 1958). Carlsson showed in his groundbreaking
work (in which a conventional experimental approach was
used) that the administration of the dopamine precursor L-
3,4-dihydroxyphenylalanine to mice and rabbits reversed
catalepsy. In this study, the catalepsy was induced by
treatment with reserpine, resulting in the depletion of
catecholamines (Carlsson et al. 1957). This reversal was
accompanied by the restoration of dopamine levels in the
brain (Carlsson et al. 1958). Thus, between 1958 and 1960,
Carlsson formed the hypothesis that dopamine was a
neurotransmitter in the brain and that there might exist a
link between catecholamines and movement disorders
(Carlsson 1959). This view was substantiated by the findings
of Ehringer and Hornykiewitcz (1960), who showed that
dopamine is depleted in the striatum of PD patients.
Hornykiewitcz’s (1963) subsequent finding that dopamine
is also depleted in the SN led him to the speculation that the

loss of the neurons in the SN is responsible for the loss of
dopamine in the brain/striatum of PD patients (reviewed in
Hornykiewitcz 1992; Lees et al. 2015).
In parallel to these neurochemical technologies implicating

dopamine in the pathophysiology of PD, the application of
another similarly powerful technology by Carlsson and
colleagues revealed the presence of catecholaminergic neu-
ronal groups in the brain (Carlsson et al. 1962; Falck et al.
1962). In this technology, monoamines are condensed using
the formaldehyde vapor, forming an intense fluorophore.
Using this technique Dahlstr€om and Fuxe (1964) published
their seminal paper detailing the different catecholaminergic
cell groups in the medulla oblongata up to the hypothalamus,
naming them as cell groups A1–A12. Cell groups A13–A17
are located more rostrally, up to the olfactory bulb (A16) and
include the retina (A17). The three adrenalin-containing
groups (C1–C3) in the brainstem were described later
following the advent of the newly emerging immunohisto-
chemical techniques. These nowadays indispensable tech-
niques have been used to determine the localization of
tyrosine hydroxylase (TH), the rate-limiting enzyme in the
synthesis of catecholamines. In combination with immuno-
histochemical detection of additional enzymes involved in
catecholaminergic synthesis, distinctions could be made
between adrenergic, noradrenergic and dopaminergic neu-
rons. Thus, in the mammalian brain, nine dopaminergic cell
groups can be distinguished (A8–A16, excluding the
dopaminergic neurons in the retina) (H€okfelt et al. 1984;
Bj€orklund and Dunnett 2007). The nomenclature of the
catecholaminergic system that was established in rodents has
been retained (in addition to classical neuroanatomical
descriptions) and is used across species. Even though the
number of catecholaminergic neurons in the different groups
varies between species, the basic architecture remains the
same. Thus, the A1–A17 nomenclature is specifically useful
when analyzing and comparing the system across species and
development. Of the nine dopaminergic cell groups, A8–A10
are located in the ventral mesencephalon. As mentioned
earlier, these groups are not confined to single anatomical
structures but are distributed across structural boundaries and
even represent a continuum (reviewed in Bentivoglio and
Morelli 2005). However, primary anatomical foci can be
named as follows: cells of the A8 group are primarily found
in the retrorubral field, and A9 cells are located in the SNc,
with some dense aggregation of dopaminergic cells also
found in the SNr. A10 cells are located in the ventral
tegmental area (VTA). This region is cytoarchitectonically
difficult to demarcate and was first described by Tsai (1925);
thus, the VTA was originally termed the ‘ventral tegmental
area of Tsai’. Extending medially from the VTA, dopamin-
ergic neurons are found in midline structures, such as the
central linear nucleus. Whereas the SN (primarily A9 cells)
received a great deal of attention because of its selective
degeneration in PD (see below), the VTA (primarily A10

© 2016 The Authors. Journal of Neurochemistry published by John Wiley & Sons Ltd on behalf of
International Society for Neurochemistry, J. Neurochem. (2016) 139 (Suppl. 1), 8--26

10 D. M. Vogt Weisenhorn et al.



cells) drew its share of attention since it was found to play
important roles in different neuropsychiatric diseases. This
understanding was based on the distinct connectomes of
these two regions (see below).
It must be emphasized that the A8–A10 nomenclature

relates exclusively to dopaminergic neurons in the ventral
mesencephalon, whereas the anatomical nomenclature SN
and VTA also includes other neurons with distinct neuro-
transmitter identities. In addition, the borders are fluid
between dopaminergic cell groups. For this reason, they
are collectively referred to as the ‘ventral mesencephalic
dopaminergic complex’, as suggested by Yetnikoff et al.
(2014). Quantitatively, the ventral mesencephalic dopamin-
ergic complex encompasses 20.000–30.000 neurons in
rodents, 160.000–320.000 in monkeys and 400.000–
600.000 neurons in humans. This wide range reflects the
increasing complexity of this system in primates (German
and Manaye 1993; Nelson et al. 1996; Lewis et al. 1998;
Bentivoglio and Morelli 2005). In rodents, the number of
dopaminergic neurons in the SN are equivalent to the number
in the VTA (50 : 50). In contrast, in monkeys and humans,
the number of dopaminergic neurons in the SN outnumbers
those in the VTA (reviewed in Brichta and Greengard 2014).
It must be kept in mind that these numbers are only average
values for each species. In addition, genetic background is
known to affect the number of dopaminergic neurons in the
SN. Actually, the number of dopaminergic neurons in the SN
differs by up to 33% between inbred mouse strains (Baker
et al. 1980; Muthane et al. 1994). This fact is, unfortunately,
often neglected when analyzing animal models of PD.
Thus, even though the overall architecture of the ventral

mesencephalic complex does not differ across species
boundaries, there exists a quantitative difference with respect
to dopaminergic neurons located in the different regions.
Specifically, there were considerably fewer dopaminergic
neurons found in the ventrolateral aspect of the SNc of rats
than in primates (Hardman et al. 2002). In primates (and
rats), these ventrally located dopaminergic neurons are
fingerlike extensions of islands into the SNr and, in humans,
have been named nigrosomes (Damier et al. 1999a,b). This
is of special interest in light of the selective degeneration of
dopaminergic neurons in PD, since it has been shown (in
Hassler 1938) that in humans, neurons which are most
affected during the course of the disease are found in the
ventrolateral aspect of the SNc, that is, in the nigrosomes
(Hassler 1938; Damier et al. 1999b; Braak et al. 2003;
Kordower et al. 2013). In contrast, neurons in the VTA and
in the dorsal aspect of the SNc are relatively spared by the
disease process. Thus, these studies gave early hints of a
selective vulnerability among neuronal subpopulations
(dopaminergic) in the SNc with respect to the disease
process. Interestingly, the ventral tier of dopaminergic
neurons succumbing to cell death during PD in humans are
now molecularly defined as not expressing the potentially

neuroprotective calcium-binding protein calbindin-D28K
(Damier et al. 1999a,b). In mouse, this molecular identity
is observed in the dorsal aspect of the SN (SNCD) and a tiny
dopaminergic population in the caudal–ventral aspect of the
SN (SNCV), as described by Fu et al. (2012) (Fig. 2). Thus,
the mouse SNCD and the SNCV represent the homologous
region to the ventral tier in rats and primates. In contrast, the
lateral aspect of the VTA in mouse [specifically parabrachial
pigmented nucleus (PBP)] is homologous to the dorsal tier in
rats and humans. Thus, in a surprisingly large number of
studies in the mouse, this aspect of the VTA (PBP) has been
erroneously delineated as the dorsal tier of the SNc.
However, for the translation of findings into primates and
humans, the correct neuroanatomical assignment of
dopaminergic neurons to either the VTA or the SNc (or a
subregion thereof) is extremely important when analyzing the
number of dopaminergic neurons in genetic and toxin-
induced PD mouse models.
Another issue that must be addressed is the dependency of

the extent of dopaminergic neuron loss on disease duration.
Earlier studies claimed that the number of neurons lost
increases with disease duration (Fearnley and Lees 1991;
Greffard et al. 2006; Parkkinen et al. 2011). However, these
studies suffered from either a small amount of patient
material and/or the counting of neurons in single sections and
not using stereological counting methods. This latter tech-
nique was not previously available, and imprecise estima-
tions of neuronal numbers often resulted. The first study
using unbiased stereological counting was performed by Ma
et al. (1997), confirming previous analysis. Still, this study
lacked appropriate numbers of brain samples from patients
with a long disease duration. Thus, the statistical analyses
were confounded by outliers. It was only in 2013 that a study
was performed of brains from 17 patients, with the disease
duration ranging from 1 to 22 years after the initial diagnosis
(Kordower et al. 2013). This study again showed that TH-
positive cells are missing in the ventral tier of the SNc;
however, in this case, the number of missing neurons was not
correlated with disease duration. This neuroanatomical
finding – if confirmed – raises the provocative hypothesis
that dopaminergic neurons succumb to cell death during the
early course of the disease and that ‘clinical deterioration
after this time might represent a loss of compensatory
mechanisms or degeneration of non-dopaminergic neurons’
(Nandhagopal et al. 2011; Kordower et al. 2013). Thus, in
this case, the introduction of a new neuroanatomical method
(unbiased stereological counting) does not immediately
extend our knowledge of the disease but rather raises
questions about the previously accepted assertion, namely,
the correlation between dopaminergic loss and disease
duration. Further studies testing the aforementioned provoca-
tive hypothesis are warranted, especially in light of longitu-
dinal clinical imaging data. These analyses use dopamine
binding in the striatum as a surrogate marker for loss of
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dopaminergic neurons in the SNc and show a decline of
dopamine binding of 3–5% per year.
Taken together, early research on PD (i.e., from the

beginning of the 20th century onward) had revealed a
specific, selective vulnerability of neurons in the ventrolateral
aspect of the SNc. These reports were later confirmed by
studies using modern neuroanatomical techniques, showing
that this loss primarily affects dopaminergic neurons. These
findings hint strongly toward a diversity among the neurons
in the ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex. The
questions to be solved were: What is the underlying cause of
this diversity? Do these neurons project to different target

regions? Do they receive distinct inputs and/or are they
molecularly distinct?

Efferents and afferents of the ventral mesencephalon

Efferent projections
Even though the substantia nigra per se had been identified
and its association with PD was proven, its connections
within the brain remained a mystery until 1970 (reviewed in
Hattori 1993). Early reports from 1895 to 1901, primarily
based on lesion studies and subsequent identification of
retrogradely degenerating regions, predicted that the cells in

(a)

(b)

(c)

Fig. 2 TH-positive neurons are shown in the murine ventral mesen-

cephalic dopaminergic complex, from rostral to intermediate to caudal (a–
c). Neuroanatomically distinct regions are defined according to Fu et al.
(2012), in which the parabrachial pigmented nucleus (PBP), belonging to

the ventral tegmental area (VTA), is clearly demarcated from the

substantia nigra pars compacta (SNc), especially the substantia nigra
compact dorsal tier (SNCD). Histological sections aremirror imagesof the
colored sketches to indicate the bilateral organization of the complex.
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the ventral mesencephalon project to the cerebral cortex and
the striatum (Monakow 1895; Holmes 1901). Nevertheless,
the discussion on the projections of the ventral mesen-
cephalic neurons remained a matter of debate, even when
silver methods for the impregnation of degenerating axons
and axonal endings had been established. This method,
developed by Nauta and Gygax (1954), enabled experi-
menters to trace fiber connections in the brain. However, it
turned out that the method used ‘suppressed, [. . .], the
staining of the finer terminal ramifications’ (Nauta 1993).
Only a technological improvement of this method developed
by Fink and Heimer in (1967) enabled Moore (1970) to
unambiguously prove the projection of the ventral mesen-
cephalic neurons to the striatum. This finding was to be
expected since about 5 years before – by combining lesion
studies and the histofluorescence method – mainly Anden
et al. (1964) showed that after experimentally destroying the
SN, catecholamine fluorescence was missing in the ipsilateral
striatum. This result proved that the source of dopamine in
the striatum was the dopaminergic neuron population in the
ventral mesencephalon that projects through the median
forebrain bundle (Moore and Heller 1967).
Thereafter, a further breakthrough in neuroanatomical

techniques, the neuroanatomical tracing technology, in
combination with immunohistochemical studies led to the
beginning of the modern era of neuroanatomy. These
technologies allowed a refinement of the projection pattern
of the ventral mesencephalon. After the seminal works of
LaVail and LaVail (1972) (which described retrograde
labeling) and Cowan et al. (1972) (anterograde labeling), a
multitude of neuronal tracers were applied to reveal the
efferent and afferent connections of the dopaminergic
neurons in the ventral mesencephalon.
These studies formed the basis for the highly oversimpli-

fied view that neurons in the ventral mesencephalic
dopaminergic complex project to the dorsal and ventral
striatum and the cortex. These projections are referred to as
the meso(nigro-)striatal (to the dorsal striatum), mesolimbic
(to the ventral striatum, and e.g., the amygdala) and
mesocortical (to different cortical areas) pathways respec-
tively (Bentivoglio and Morelli 2005; Bj€orklund and Dunnett
2007). The mesostriatal pathway was described as being
primarily composed by efferents of the A9 group, thus the
SN, whereas the latter two were generally described as
projecting from the A10 group, thus the VTA. However,
Fallon and colleagues elegantly showed in 1978 that distinct
dopaminergic target areas in the cortex receive (i) input from
dopaminergic neurons of the A9 group in their lateral
aspects, (ii) input from the A10 group in their medial aspects
and (iii) input from both between their medial and lateral
aspects (Fallon and Moore 1978a,b; Fallon et al. 1978).
Thus, there exists an extensive overlap between the target
regions of SN and VTA neurons. The ‘oversimplification’ of
the description of these efferent systems was because

neurons of the A9 group indeed primarily project to the
dorsal striatum (caudate nucleus and putamen, or motor
striatum) and to a lesser extent to the ventral striatum
(nucleus accumbens and olfactory tubercle, or limbic stria-
tum) and cortical structures. In contrast, the reverse holds
true for the A10 group, which is primarily located in the
VTA. Thus, for heuristic reasons, it is still valid to
distinguish between these three efferent pathways that arise
from the ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex.
In summary, the major projection areas of A10 and A9

neurons, that is, the VTA and SNc, respectively, can be
briefly summarized as follows (reviewed in Haber 2014;
Bentivoglio and Morelli 2005; Joel and Weiner 2000)
(Fig. 3): (i) dopaminergic neurons of the dorsal medial
aspect of the ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex,
that is, VTA neurons (A10), primarily project to the
ventromedial striatum, including the nucleus accumbens
(the ‘limbic region’ of the striatum), limbic cortical fields and
the amygdala; (ii) neurons in the ventral portion of the
complex project to the septum; (iii) dopaminergic neurons in
the dorsolateral aspect of the VTA (falsely regarded as the
‘dorsal tier’ of the SNc in mice – see above; Reyes et al.
2012; Fu et al. 2012) primarily project to the central striatum
(the ‘association region’ of the striatum); (iv) neurons
projecting to the dorsal striatum (the ‘motor region’ of the
striatum, primarily encompassing the putamen) are located
predominantly in the SNc (the ventral tier of the SNc in
primates, and the SNc in mice); (v) neurons in the substantia
nigra pars lateralis project to the amygdala. Thus, regarding
the projections to the striatum a specific medial to lateral,
anterior to posterior and inverted dorsal to ventral topogra-
phy exists (Pan et al. 2010; Fallon and Moore 1978b;
reviewed in Joel and Weiner 2000; Haber 2014). However,
although a topography is present, due to the fact that
individual dopaminergic neurons have widespread striatal
projections, a considerable overlap in projection targets exist
(Parent and Parent 2006).
In addition to this regional spatial organization, the

nigrostriatal projection also largely respects the compart-
mentalization of the striatum, defined by the patch/striosome
and matrix compartments. These two compartments are
defined by their differential neurochemical composition (e.g.,
higher expression in patch/striosomes of substance P) and
their differential cortical input and striatofugal output
organization (Crittenden and Graybiel 2011). Until approx-
imately 10 years ago, it was thought that the projections of
the dorsolateral aspect of the VTA terminate solely in the
matrix of the striatum and that the projections from the SNc
terminate solely in the patch/striosome compartment (for
review, see Bentivoglio and Morelli 2005). Thereafter, using
juxtacellular labeling and single-cell tracing, this oversim-
plified view had to be revised in the sense that single
dopaminergic neurons of the ventral mesencephalon inner-
vated both striosome and matrix compartments. However,
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each neuron’s arborization still tends to favor one of these
compartments (Matsuda et al. 2009). The functional signif-
icance of these compartments was long unknown, but they
were thought to serve different aspects of motor activity and
behavior. This view was substantiated by an elegant study
implicating a prefronto-striosomal circuit specifically in cost–
benefit decisions (Friedman et al. 2015) in rats. In addition,
cost–benefit decisions in primates have been suggested to be
governed by a similar prefronto-striosomal circuit (Amemori
and Graybiel 2012). As this report was limited to the analysis
of the cortical input to the dorsomedial striatum, it might not
fully describe striosomal functions. Specifically, it would be
interesting to relate these function(s) to the afferents from the
ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex, as has been
reported recently by Brimblecombe and Cragg (2015). These
authors showed that neuropeptide substance P – expressed at
high levels in the striosomes – modulates DA transmission in
this compartment. Thus, although single dopaminergic
neurons do not respect all neuroanatomically defined
boundaries within the striatum, DA transmission is governed
by these boundaries. This fact may have significant impli-
cations for the function of the respective neuronal circuits
and, thus, behavioral and/or pathological outcomes.
Taken together, these previous results indicate that

anatomically distinct subsets of dopaminergic neurons within
the A9–A10 groups (i.e., the SN and the VTA respectively)
project to specific brain regions, adding a further level of
diversity with respect to the functionality to dopaminergic
neurons. The projections are topographically organized and
the topography is conserved across species. Thus, within the
ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex, neurons are
distinguished based on their projection pattern(s). This raises
the question of whether distinct sets of dopaminergic neurons
are defined not only by their anatomical location and efferent

projections, but also by their afferent projections, that is, their
innervation.

Afferent connections
With respect to the innervation of neurons in the ventral
mesencephalic dopaminergic complex, specifically the VTA,
widespread input from cortical regions, the striatum, the
globus pallidus, thalamus, subthalamic nucleus, superior
colliculus, raphe nuclei and some brainstem nuclei is firmly
established (Geisler and Zahm 2005; as reviewed in Oades
and Halliday 1987; Yetnikoff et al. 2014). Of special interest
in this respect is the reciprocal connection between the ventral
mesencephalic dopaminergic complex and the striatum. The
ventral striatum projects to the VTA, and dopaminergic
neurons in the VTA project to the ventral striatum. However,
because of their widespread terminal fields (see above), these
latter projections also innervate the associative striatum. In
turn, associative striatum neurons project back to the more
dorsal aspect of the SNc and in part to the ventral aspect of the
SNc. Neurons in the ventral aspect of the SNc project back to
the dorsal striatum. In this way, a lateral spiraling of striato-
nigral-striatal connectivity is established, which is hypothe-
sized to be the underlying substrate for the development of
drug addiction, progressing from reward states to habitual
states, that is, motor habits (Haber et al. 2000).
It also must be mentioned that, in terms of the progress that

has been made in understanding the dopaminergic system via
the introduction of new technologies, novel approaches can
lead to challenges of previously existing views of the system.
For example, a combination of anatomical techniques with
electrophysiological recordings and optogenetics (Chuhma
et al. 2011) initially raised doubts as to the existence of
projections from striatal neurons to dopaminergic neurons in
the SNc (Somogyi et al. 1981; Bolam and Smith 1990).

Fig. 3 Summary of the projections of
neurons in the ventral mesencephalic
dopaminergic complex. (a) Neurons in the

ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic
complex projecting to (b) different
telencephalic regions. Neurons and their

respective terminal fields are color coded
(adapted from Fallon and Loughlin 1995
and Gerfen 2004).

© 2016 The Authors. Journal of Neurochemistry published by John Wiley & Sons Ltd on behalf of
International Society for Neurochemistry, J. Neurochem. (2016) 139 (Suppl. 1), 8--26

14 D. M. Vogt Weisenhorn et al.



However, this controversy was soon laid to rest following the
introduction of another new technology, namely, monosy-
naptic circuit tracing with glycoprotein-deleted rabies viruses
(for review, see Callaway and Luo 2015). The technique was
developed by Wickersham et al. (2007a,b), and since this
time, has been applied to overcome the limitations of
conventional neuroanatomical tracing techniques. One major
limitation was the impossibility (or highly labor-intensive
way via electronmicroscopical studies) of unambiguously
assigning synaptic inputs to specific neurons, that is,
distinguishing between inputs to dopaminergic and non-
dopaminergic neurons in the SNc. The technique developed
by Wickersham et al. (2007a,b) combines the Cre/loxP gene
expression system with rabies-virus-based trans-synaptic
retrograde tracing. This method can be extended using
specific combinations of genetic and tracing approaches to
identify dopaminergic neurons that project to a specific site.
This technique also allows the concomitant identification of
the inputs to these neurons from the rest of the brain, which is
known as the ‘cell-type-specific tracing of the relationship
between input and output’, or cTRIO method (Schwarz et al.
2015). Furthermore, in combination with optical clearing and
light-sheet microscopy, it is possible to generate whole-brain
maps of direct inputs to the neurons of the ventral
mesencephalic dopaminergic complex (Watabe-Uchida et al.
2012; Beier Kevin et al. 2015; Lerner et al. 2015; Menegas
et al. 2015). These maps in general verified the different
inputs to the ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex
that were established using simple neuroanatomical tracing
techniques. In addition, these novel methods proved that
these inputs indeed terminate on dopaminergic neurons. The
inputs specifically to the dopaminergic neurons of the SNc
(those succumbing to cell death during PD) were recently
studied by Lerner et al. (2015). These authors specifically
looked into the reciprocal connection of the SNc with the
striatum and verified the existence of a topographically
organized connection. In addition, using optogenetic tech-
niques, it was shown that the input from more lateral portions
of the dorsal striatum is much stronger than from medial
portions. This distinction might be important in the context
of PD. Specifically, the more lateral aspect of the striatum is
affected in PD as a result of its innervation by the ventral-
lateral aspect of the SNc, in which dopaminergic neurons are
lost. Thus, multi-technological approaches in animal models
(reviewed in Lerner et al. 2016) are now essential given how
they improve our understanding of the ongoing disease
process in specific dopaminergic neuronal circuits. Such
protocols are especially important with respect to the
selective degeneration of the affected circuit; this damage
initiates in the ventral SNc and thereby increases the relative
activity of the medial dopaminergic cell groups (discussed in
Reyes et al. 2013a). Understanding these ‘diseased’ cir-
cuitries might also lead to insights into the pathophysiology
of co-morbid diseases, such as apathy (Pagonabarraga et al.

2015), and unwanted side effects of current L-3,4-dihydrox-
yphenylalanine therapies, such as impulsive–compulsive
behaviors (Pirritano et al. 2014). Although this review
primarily addresses the connectome between the dopamin-
ergic neurons of the ventral mesencephalon (with a focus on
the SNc) and the striatum, these neurons have widespread
connections (afferents and efferents) throughout the brain,
including feed-forward and feedback connections to other
components in the basal ganglia. These pathways add further
complexity to the composition and function of the ventral
mesencephalic complex.
Taken together, the neuroanatomical studies presented

strongly suggest the existence of subtypes of dopaminergic
neurons in ventral mesencephalic regions, not only in terms
of their localization, but also their connectomes. These
differences are attributable in part to heterogeneity among the
neurons of the VTA (A10 group) and the SN (A9 group).
However, it is increasingly evident that heterogeneity also
exists within these anatomical structures, which is reflected
in the finding of dopaminergic populations with distinct
neurotransmitter and molecular identity.

Diversity of neurons in the ventral mesencephalic
dopaminergic complex

Diverse neurotransmitter content

Awareness of the diversity of dopaminergic neurons in the
ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex has increased
in recent years. In addition to insights into neuroanatomical
diversity (e.g., their morphology, localization and both
efferent and afferent connections), electrophysiological and
optogenetic studies have substantiated the existence of
diverse dopaminergic neurons in this complex. These studies
clearly showed that distinct dopaminergic populations
mediate distinct behaviors. In addition, these previous studies
confirmed that subpopulations of dopaminergic neurons
might also be distinguished based on distinct co-release of
neurotransmitters, such as glutamate and/or GABA. This
form of signaling is referred to as multiplexed neurotrans-
mission (Tritsch et al. 2012; Zhang et al. 2015b; Root et al.
2014; El Mestikawy et al. 2011; reviewed in Trudeau et al.
2014; Barker et al. 2016; Tritsch et al. 2016). Concerning
the capability of co-release of glutamate by dopaminergic
neurons, it must be noted that between 5% and 20% of
dopaminergic neurons in the VTA express vesicular gluta-
mate transporter-2. In the SNc, only a small fraction in the
lateral portion exhibits this double labeling (Yamaguchi
et al. 2007, 2011, 2015). These findings are in close
agreement with recent optogenetic studies showing that
glutamate-mediated synaptic currents can be easily detected
in the ventral striatum but only rarely in the dorsal striatum
(Stuber et al. 2010; Tecuapetla et al. 2010). In contrast,
GABA-mediated synaptic currents can be readily detected in
the dorsal striatum, indicative of GABA activity in
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dopaminergic neurons of the SNc. Interestingly, with the
exception of a small fraction of dopaminergic neurons, these
neurons do not express GABA synthetic enzymes nor the
vesicular GABA transporter (vGAT), implicating non-
canonical GABA synthesis and packaging (Tritsch et al.
2012, 2016). Concerning the latter possibility, a recent study
revealed that VMAT2 is necessary for the GABAergic
transmission from dopaminergic neurons, thus raising the
possibility that dopamine and GABA are not only co-
released, but also co-packaged into dopaminergic vesicles in
SNc neurons (Tritsch et al. 2012). This finding has been
substantiated by Kim et al. (2015), who also demonstrated a
novel GABA synthesis pathway mediated by aldehyde
dehydrogenase 1a1 (ALDH1a1). This enzyme is highly
expressed in the dopaminergic neurons in the SNc (see
below) and is necessary for the co-release of dopamine and
GABA.
The high degree of complexity of this multiplexed

neurotransmission of dopaminergic neurons is also reflected
by the fact that even though glutamate can be released from a
dopaminergic axon, it is normally not released at the same
site or from the same synaptic vesicles as dopamine (Zhang
et al. 2015b). This ‘differential spatial release’ might be one
explanation why the modulatory effect of glutamate and/or
GABA co-release differs dramatically between the ventral
and dorsal striatum and target cells (i.e., inhibitory spiny
stellate cells and cholinergic interneurons) as well as between
forebrain targets of dopaminergic neurons (Chuhma et al.
2011, 2014; Mingote et al. 2015). Thus, research into
multiplexed neurotransmission adds another layer of com-
plexity onto the diversity of dopaminergic neurons, extend-
ing the diversity to the synaptic connections by which
dopaminergic neurons elicit diametrically opposite responses
from different target neurons. The functional significance of
this multiplexed neurotransmission is an intense focus of
research given that it is very likely involved in the
transmission of precise temporal signals and dramatically
enhances the dynamic range of the dopaminergic signals
necessary to regulate diverse behavior, for example, addic-
tion. Toward this end, Kim et al. (2015) showed that
ALDH1a1, the enzyme responsible for the production of
GABA in dopaminergic neurons, also modulates alcohol
intake and preference behavior. Thus, the functional signif-
icance of the co-release of GABA and DA from dopamin-
ergic neurons may be found, at least in part, in the fine-tuning
and regulation of the development of addictive behavior.
Notably, with respect to the functional diversity of

dopaminergic neurons, researchers have primarily focused
on the dopaminergic neurons in the VTA (e.g., Lammel et al.
2008, 2011, 2012; Stamatakis et al. 2013). Only recently has
the functional diversity between dopaminergic neurons of the
SNc been appreciated (Matsumoto and Hikosaka 2009;
Lerner et al. 2015; reviewed in Roeper 2013). However, this
dopaminergic population urgently requires further study,

given that the diverse functions and/or molecular identity of
these neurons might explain their selective vulnerability in
PD.

Diverse gene expression

Electrophysiological and optogenetic studies have revealed
the diversity of dopaminergic neurons at the functional level.
These results were paralleled by an increasing number of
reports on differential gene and protein expression being
used to distinguish between the VTA and SNc as well as
neuronal populations within these regions. These reports
therefore describe neuronal diversity at the molecular level
and provide the first insights into the molecular character-
istics that could underlie the selective vulnerability of
dopaminergic neurons in the SNc in PD (reviewed in
Anderegg et al. 2015; Brichta and Greengard 2014; Veen-
vliet and Smidt 2014; Double et al. 2010; Korotkova et al.
2004). Thus, there is now an extensive body of literature
describing the differential gene expression between different
dopaminergic populations. However, it must be noted that
despite the functional differences of the dopaminergic
neurons in the ventral mesencephalon, the gene expression
signatures of these populations are extremely similar, that is,
97–99% of the genes expressed in the ventral mesencephalic
complex are expressed in both the VTA and the SN (Grimm
et al. 2004; Chung et al. 2005; Greene et al. 2005).
However, the remaining 1–3% might play essential roles in
determining the differential vulnerability of dopaminergic
neurons in the SNc. These studies, together with a wealth of
immunohistochemical data, revealed that the differentially
expressed genes (generally between the VTA and SNc) could
roughly be grouped as follows: genes implicated in neuronal
dopamine biology [e.g., Slc6a3 (DAT), DRD1, DRD2 and
ALDH1a1], neuronal activity [e.g., KCNJ6 (GIRK2),
KCNN3, calcium-binding proteins], neuronal survival (e.g.,
brain-derived neurotrophic factor; glial cell line derived
neurotrophic factor) and transcription factors (specifically
those implicated in the specification and differentiation of
dopaminergic neurons (e.g., PITX3, OTX2, SOX6). Specif-
ically, the latter set might underlie the distinct molecular
phenotypes of dopaminergic neurons. Two notes of caution
must be made. First, the list of known differentially
expressed genes is highly biased. Specifically, it is generally
genes that are implicated in dopaminergic neuronal biology/
function that have been analyzed in terms of their expression
patterns. Second, although regional expression differences
have been reported for certain genes, these differences do not
exhibit an ‘all or nothing’ pattern; rather, there are
differences in expression levels that have been described in
the literature as either ‘strong’ versus ‘weak’ expression or as
‘enrichment of gene expression’. Therefore, it is highly
important to determine whether the terminology of, for
example, ‘enrichment’ is indeed because of a general higher
expression in all dopaminergic neurons of the given region or
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is because of only a subset of neurons in this region
expressing the specific gene. This latter situation was
observed for the expression of engrailed genes in both the
VTA and SN (Simon et al. 2001). Thus, the technical
progress, made primarily in the last year, in terms of applying
single-cell transcriptomics to neurons (Tang et al. 2009;
Macosko et al. 2015; Usoskin et al. 2015; Zeisel et al.
2015) will be crucial for revealing the transcriptomes of
single dopaminergic neurons. These data will allow the
identification of molecularly defined subtypes. The next step
will be to evaluate and explore the relationship between the
molecular signature of a specific subtype with its location,
morphology, connectivity and excitability. Indeed, such an
approach has proved to be successful in the cortex,
correlating excitability with molecular signatures of neuronal
subtypes (Fuzik et al. 2015). In addition, the advent of retro-
TRAP technology now allows for correlations between
specific molecular subtypes and its connection patterns
(Ekstrand et al. 2014; Nectow et al. 2015) (Fig. 4).
Concerning the dopaminergic system, a first step was

made toward single-cell transcriptome analysis in a study of
the expression of just 96 selected genes (Poulin et al. 2014).
These genes are known to be involved in dopaminergic
biology/function throughout the ventral mesencephalic
dopaminergic complex. This analysis revealed (by hierarchi-
cal clustering) two primary molecularly defined clusters of
dopaminergic neurons (DA1 and DA2). These clusters were
again subdivided into two (DA1A/1B) and four subtypes of
dopaminergic neurons (DA2A-D) (Poulin et al. 2014; Ander-
egg et al. 2015). Interestingly, the two main clusters
separated the dopaminergic neurons within the SN from
those in the VTA. In addition, subsequent subdivision of
these primary clusters into six subtypes revealed that these
populations can be assigned to distinct neuroanatomical
regions in the ventral mesencephalic dopaminergic complex.
Thus, the two subtypes (DA1A and DA1B), which are both
characterized by their expression of the Sox6 transcription
factor, are restricted to the SNc and the dorsolateral aspect of
the VTA, that is, the PBP (as defined by Fu et al. 2012). This
result is consistent with the requirement of this transcription
factor in the development of these dopaminergic populations
(Panman et al. 2014). The DA1A subtype is predominantly
found in the SNc, which represents the most vulnerable
dopaminergic neurons in the context of PD. Interestingly,
this subtype expresses the highest levels of the ion channel
Kcnj6 (Girk2), which has been proposed to confer a specific
vulnerability to SNc dopaminergic neurons in toxin models
of PD (Liss et al. 2005). In addition, the unique expression
of Otx2 in DA2 (primarily DA2B and DA2C) (Anderegg et al.
2015) again is consistent with previous studies (Di Salvio
et al. 2010b). Specifically, this transcription factor is
proposed to antagonize the vulnerability of neurons to MPTP
(Di Salvio et al. 2010a). However, this single-cell study also
described some findings that were contradictory to previous

reports. For example, the subtype DA1A, which is primarily
found in the SNc and is lost upon MPTP treatment (Poulin
et al. 2014), is also characterized by the expression of
ALDH1a1. At first glance, this result is in sharp contrast to
earlier studies, in which ALDH1a1 was assigned a neuro-
protective function based on its oxidation of a potential
neurotoxic metabolite of dopamine (DOPAL), which pro-
motes the formation of a-synuclein oligomers (reviewed in
Cai et al. 2014a). Thus, cell death induced by a-synuclein
oligomerization is prevented by ALDH1a1. In contrast, cell
death induced by other neurotoxins such as MPP+ and
glutamate was unaffected by the loss of ALDH1a1 (Liu et al.
2014). Thus, ALDH1a1 might preferentially protect against
the a-synuclein-mediated loss of mesencephalic dopaminer-
gic neurons, which represents one of the proposed mecha-
nisms of neuronal cell death in PD. In addition, the presence
of such a neuroprotective mediator in highly susceptible
dopaminergic populations might be insufficient to prevent
the effects of additional pathogenic events during disease
progression. Furthermore, the primary role of ALDH1a1 in
this dopaminergic neuronal population might not be neuro-
protection, but rather the generation of GABA via a non-
canonical synthesis pathway, as described earlier (Kim et al.
2015).
In addition to confirming the existing data on differential

gene expression across the ventral mesencephalic dopamin-
ergic complex, this single-cell study and those that follow
will form the basis for hypotheses concerning the specific
vulnerability of SNc neurons. An example in this respect is
the predominant expression of Fzd1 in the primary cluster
DA2A-D (primarily neurons in the VTA) (Poulin et al. 2014).
Fzd1 is a Wnt1 receptor that has been shown to be
instrumental for the development of dopaminergic neurons
(Prakash et al. 2006, reviewed in Wurst and Prakash 2014).
Interestingly, the pharmacological or genetic ectopic activa-
tion of the Wnt-signaling pathway in the adult mesen-
cephalon has been shown to protect dopaminergic neurons
from both cytotoxic insults (L’Episcopo et al. 2011a,b) and
from degeneration upon loss of the transcription factor En-1.
The latter effect is most likely a result of the reactivation of a
gene cascade that is active during development (Zhang et al.
2015a). A neuroprotective role of the Wnt1 pathway is at first
glance counterintuitive given that this ligand is not expressed
in the adult mesencephalon. However, Wnt1 becomes
expressed in reactive astrocytes upon injury of this region
(reviewed in L’Episcopo et al. 2014). Thus, it is tempting to
speculate that dopaminergic neurons within DA1 (specifically
subtype DA1A) are more vulnerable to toxic insults (and
perhaps to the PD disease process) given that they do not
express Fzd1. Interestingly, En1, Wnt1, Otx2, Aldh1a1 and
Sox6 are all implicated in the development of the respective
subtypes of dopaminergic neurons (Bodea and Blaess 2015;
Veenvliet and Smidt 2014). Thus, it is possible that one role
of these genes in dopaminergic neurons is to protect the
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respective subpopulation upon injury by reactivating devel-
opmental programs (Zhang et al. 2015a).
Another interesting facet of PD biology that should be

addressed is the expression of genes known to be associated
with genetic forms of PD. Over the last decade, several genes
have been implicated and associated with the pathoetiology
of the disease (reviewed in Verstraeten et al. 2015; van Brug

et al. 2015). Expression studies have shown that these genes
are rather ubiquitously expressed throughout the brain, most
even in glial populations (Petersen et al. 1999; Stichel et al.
2000; Bader et al. 2005; Blackinton et al. 2007; Pham et al.
2010; Giesert et al. 2013). The study by Poulin et al. (2014)
confirmed that neither the expression of a-synuclein, Parkin,
DJ-1, Pink1, Atp13a2 nor Lrrk2 in neurons of the ventral

Fig. 4 The functional principle of retro-TRAP (translating ribosome
affinity purification utilizing viral retrograde tracing). (a) Transgenic mice
are generated that over-express an anti-GFP nanobody fused (anti-
GFP VHH) to the ribosomal subunit Rpl10a. This construct is under the

control of the pan-neuronal human synapsin promoter (hSYN), and the
mice are injected stereotactically with a retrograde tracing virus (canine
adenovirus 2) expressing GFP (CAV-GFP) into the desired projection

region. Neurons projecting to virus-transduced target cells (green)
receive the GFP trans-synaptically (yellow), while those projecting to
non-transduced cells (gray) remain GFP negative (red). (b) As these

cells (red) lack the expression of GFP (2), affinity purification of GFP will
only result in purification of RNA from double-positive neurons (yellow,

3), which comprise the GFP-nanobody–ribosome-RNA complex. (c)
Advances in specificity allows for the combination of retro-TRAP with
cell-type-specific Cre-driver mouse lines. For this, an adeno-associated
virus bearing a Cre-dependent anti-GFP nanobody fusion protein (anti-

GFP VHH) must be injected into the desired target region of a Cre-driver
mouse line. The expression of the nanobody fusion protein is restricted
to Cre-positive neurons in the injection area. After the subsequent

injection of the retrograde tracing virus (CAV-GFP) into the projection
area, RNA can be affinity purified exclusively from neurons with the
desired molecular characteristics (Cre-dependent), from a certain

region (AAV injection dependent), or with certain connectivity properties
(CAV injection dependent) (adapted from Ekstrand et al. 2014).
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mesencephalon is restricted to a specific dopaminergic
subpopulation. One of the only significant findings in this
regard was a high expression of a-synuclein in subtypes
DA1A and DA2C. Thus, it is unlikely that the expression of
mutated forms of PD-associated genes underlies the selective
vulnerability of dopaminergic neurons in the SNc. This
hypothesis is also supported by the promiscuous involvement
of these genes in numerous essential cellular mechanisms.
However, their dysfunction might enhance a pre-existing bias
in sensitivity to neurodegeneration, a proposal that is in
agreement with the multiple hit hypothesis of PD (Sulzer
2007).
Taken together, the technology that is now available to

identify molecular signatures at the single-cell level, in
combination with electrophysiology, tracing technologies
and optogenetics, will allow for the full characterization of
dopaminergic neuron subtypes in the ventral mesencephalic
complex. This careful characterization must be followed by
functional studies to reveal the relevance of single genes or
gene networks in terms of dopaminergic cell-type-specific
functions and vulnerability in PD (i.e., whether these genes
confer susceptibility or neuroprotection to the respective
dopaminergic neuron).

Further diversification

Adding to the complexity of molecularly diverse dopamin-
ergic neuronal population in the ventral mesencephalic
complex is the increasing evidence that, in addition to gene
expression, other cellular and biochemical characteristics are
differentially regulated within the complex. For example,
post-transcriptional modifications that regulate the activity of
specific gene products might differ between different pop-
ulations of DA neurons. One prominent example is the
glycosylation of Slc6a3 (indicative of the active form of the
transporter), the expression of which has been shown to be
higher in the SNc than in the VTA (Afonso-Oramas et al.
2009; Di Salvio et al. 2010a). Another possibility is diversity
concerning bioenergetic parameters. Indeed, it has recently
been shown that SNc neurons are near their maximal
capacity at basal state respiration, exhibiting a close to
three-fold higher cellular respiration rate compared to VTA
neurons. This elevated respiration was shown to be because
of SNc dopaminergic neurons having more complex axons
and a higher density of axonal mitochondria than VTA
neurons. Thus, coming back to neuroanatomical features, it
can be speculated that this specific morphology might
underlie the vulnerability of SNc neurons in that their
increased basal energy demands might generate higher
oxidative stress (Pacelli et al. 2015). It would also be
interesting to know whether the differentially expressed gene
deleted in colorectal cancer (DCC), an axon guidance
molecule expressed at high levels in SNc dopaminergic
neurons (Osborne et al. 2005; Reyes et al. 2013b), is
involved in the generation and maintenance of the elaborate

axonal arborization of these neurons. It is known that DCC
regulates the guidance of SNc and VTA dopaminergic axons
to the striatum via its interaction with netrin (Li et al. 2014).
However, if there is a bias of DCC expression during
development (or of other guidance molecules implicated in
dopaminergic neuron axon pathfinding; Prestoz et al. 2012)
between neurons that project to the dorsal and ventral
striatum remains to be determined.
In this context, the question arises of whether the diversity

of dopaminergic neurons is genetically programmed. An
extensive body of work has been dedicated to unravel the
molecular mechanism involved in the specification, differ-
entiation and maintenance of dopaminergic neurons in the
ventral mesencephalon. These studies have led to the
identification of signaling and transcriptional networks that
control the specification of a general dopaminergic fate
during development (recently reviewed in Arenas et al.
2015; Wurst and Prakash 2014). In contrast, how the diverse
dopaminergic subtypes in the ventral mesencephalic complex
are established during brain development is only starting to
be unraveled. The state-of-the art in this research field was
recently excellently reviewed by Veenvliet and Smidt (2014)
as well as Bodea and Blaess (2015). These authors stated that
both genetic and experience-dependent processes are
involved. Specifically, the latter supports the notion that
epigenetic modifications, expression of non-coding RNA and
miRNAs, all of which having been implicated in the
pathogenesis of PD (reviewed in Feng et al. 2015), might
also display regional variations within the ventral mesen-
cephalic dopaminergic complex. Thus, diversity of dopamin-
ergic neurons and the subtype specific vulnerability of
dopaminergic neurons in PD might be determined by these
factors as well.
Taken together, the technological advancements in recent

last years have allowed the field to begin to characterize
single neurons in their specific brain microenvironments.
These efforts will certainly increase our understanding of the
function of neurons in the ventral mesencephalic dopamin-
ergic complex in health and disease. Still, it remains an open
question of whether single-cell studies will reveal even more
diversity in the dopaminergic neurons than is currently
known. We may be forced to acknowledge that every neuron
represents a singular, unique entity. This hypothesis is
supported by recent omics studies in the brain. It has been
shown that transcriptomes of neurons in particular are highly
dynamic and exhibit a high number of genes with bimodal on
or off expression (Lovatt et al. 2014; Dueck et al. 2015).
The dynamism of neuronal transcriptomes is thought to
depend in part on the developmental stage, neuronal activity,
connectivity and tissue environment. In addition, it is by now
established that single neurons might have different gen-
omes. Genomes of individual cells can vary in terms of
duplications, deletions and single nucleotide variants, which
are highly likely to affect the transcriptome (Kaushal et al.
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2003; McConnell et al. 2013; Cai et al. 2014b; Lodato et al.
2015). These differences are thought to accumulate over time
and might be introduced by mobile elements (transposons)
within the genome, which can change their own position
(reviewed in Erwin et al. 2014). In addition, the transcrip-
tome can be changed by the epigenome, which again has
been proven to be highly dynamic in neurons (Guo et al.
2014). Thus, it may ultimately be determined that each
dopaminergic neuron is molecularly unique. This dynamic
molecular variability, however, might form the underlying
mechanisms for higher level functioning of neural circuits
(Dueck et al. 2016).

The need for new tools

As described earlier, recent advances in our understanding of
the functionality of the dopaminergic neurons in the ventral
mesencephalon have been made by applying new technolo-
gies, such as monosynaptic tracings, optogenetics and single-
cell transcriptomics. However, these technologies all heavily
rely on the availability of genetically modified mice to
address and/or manipulate the different subtypes of dopamin-
ergic neurons in this region. In this context, conditional
mutagenesis such as the Cre-LoxP system has been the
primary tool (Rajewsky et al. 1996). This system is based on
the interaction of a Cre recombinase (expressed in Cre-driver
mice) with so-called loxP sites, which are recognized by the
Cre recombinase and can be introduced into any DNA
sequence. The key factor determining the specificity of this
system is the choice of the promotor under which the Cre
recombinase (Cre) is expressed. When Cre is expressed
under a specific neuronal subtype promoter, the genetic
manipulation (i.e., the conditional knockout of a gene and/or
the activation/inhibition of a reporter) only takes place in this
specific neuronal cell population (this process is termed
conditional mutagenesis). In addition to introducing this
spatial dimension into the genetic manipulation, a temporal
dimension can be introduced using a tamoxifen-inducible
Cre (CreERT2). Thus, Cre can be activated in a temporally
specific manner at any time during development into
adulthood. In this way, the cell-type-specific function of
genes can be elucidated and the functional manipulation of
molecularly defined cell types is possible. However, the
results of these studies are difficult to interpret when using
promoters of genes that are expressed in different subtypes of
dopaminergic neurons, such as Sox6 (see above). In addition,
as the genetic manipulation induced by Cre is a discrete (i.e.,
all-or-nothing) event, low expression of Cre can still
introduce the desired genetic manipulation, rendering a
distinction between cells with high and low marker gene
expression impossible. Another confounding factor is that
many Cre-driver lines are based on the expression of Cre
under the control of promoters within a transgene that has
been randomly integrated into the genome. These Cre-driver

lines often suffer from unspecific expression of the recom-
binase in multiple off-target cell types. This situation can
confound the results of the highly sophisticated new
technologies that are used to determine cell-type-specific
function. Therefore, it will be necessary to (i) restrict the
usage of Cre-lox systems to Cre-driver lines that have been
extensively characterized with respect to their cellular
expression patterns; (ii) extend the availability of existing
Cre-driver lines in defined genetic backgrounds (to control
for genetic background effects); (iii) extend Cre technology
toward intersectional Cre expression if specific neuronal
populations can only be distinguished by distinct combina-
tion(s) of gene expression patterns (i.e., drive Cre expression
using two different promotors with overlapping expression);
and/or (iv) combine Cre with Flp- or Dre-recombinase
technology (reviewed in Pupe and Wallen-Mackenzie 2015;
Branda and Dymecki 2004). Thus, new and highly charac-
terized recombinase driver lines are necessary to resolve the
specific function of neuronal subtypes in the ventral mesen-
cephalon. Indeed, generating new Cre-driver lines to expand
tissue- and cell-type-specific conditional mutagenesis is one
of the major tasks of the EUCOMMTools Consortium in the
framework of the International Knockout Mouse Consortium
(IKMC: http://www.mousephenotype.org) (Rosen et al.
2015). This consortium provides the scientific community
with approximately 200 Cre-driver lines that express Cre
under cell-type-specific promoters. The consortium also
offers powerful genetic tools, such as cell visualization and
gene manipulation cassettes. The latter are tailored to be
introduced in IKMC alleles (also in combination with
clustered regularly interspaced short palindromic repeats
(CrispR) technology), allowing fast and reliable generation
of transgenic mouse lines. Thus, this genetic IKMC toolbox
is an ideal resource for the types of multifaceted functional
studies necessary to unravel the functional diversity of
various neuronal populations (e.g., subtypes of dopaminergic
neurons in the ventral mesencephalon) and/or for generating
new animal models for PD.
Taken together, these new tools will further increase our

understanding of the function of the ventral mesencephalic
dopaminergic neurons in the context of both health and
disease. However, it must be noted that although mouse
models are highly valuable and important in delineating
molecular mechanisms underlying PD pathology, they
cannot recapitulate every aspect of PD observed in primates
and humans (for review, see Pickrell et al. 2013; Smith et al.
2012; Dehay et al. 2016; Hatami and Chesselet 2015;
Gubellini and Kachidian 2015; Dawson et al. 2010). This
limitation might be because of species differences, specifi-
cally with regard to the vulnerability of dopaminergic
neurons in PD. There are numerous potential reasons for
these differences, including the short life span of mice,
species-specific molecular characteristics and differences in
the neuronal circuits in dopaminergic neurons in the ventral
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mesencephalon. Thus, being able to dissect cell-type-specific
function in primates is of utmost importance with respect to
understanding PD pathology. It might soon be possible to
realize this goal with the advent of genome editing using
CrispR/Cas9 technology. Using this technique, in vivo
genome editing is no longer limited to mice (Niu et al.
2014; Chen et al. 2015; Tu et al. 2015). Therefore, it is
possible that, similar to genetic mouse models, primate
models can be generated to express recombinases or
optogenetic tools for dissecting cell-type-specific functions.
Although it is very tempting to use such technologies in
primates to advance our understanding of the functionality
and diversity of dopaminergic neurons in the ventral
mesencephalon, the highest ethical standards must be
applied. Each genetic manipulation in primates must be
carefully judged with respect to whether the benefit of the
thereby newly acquired knowledge still outweighs the ethical
concerns.

Conclusion

In summary, considering the timeline of the discovery and
description of the dopaminergic neurons in the ventral
mesencephalon, it becomes evident that the notion of ‘the’
dopaminergic neuron in this region must be abandoned.
Instead we must acknowledge that dopaminergic neurons in
the ventral mesencephalon are highly diverse based on their
localization, molecular identity, connectome and behavioral
relevance. It has long been known that only a specific subtype
of dopaminergic neurons succumb to cell death in PD. The
precise knowledge of the biology, function and molecular
identity of this vulnerable dopaminergic subtype will help us
to understand the molecular consequences of harmful genetic
and/or environmental events that lead to the outbreak of the
disease. Therefore, precisely defining this dopaminergic
subtype offers a great potential for new disease-modifying
interventions or refining existing ones, which is the ultimate
deliverable of past and ongoing research in this field.

Acknowledgments and conflict of interest
disclosure

We thank Prof. T. Gasser, Drs K. Ganea, L. Garett and A. Zimprich,
and P. Dirscherl, L. Ernst, A. Hummel, A. Romanov and C. Stautner
for discussions and highly valuable input. The authors’ work is
supported by funds from the Bayerische Staatsministerium f€ur
Bildung und Kultus, Wissenschaft und Kunst within the Bavarian
Research Network ‘Human Induced Pluripotent Stem Cells’
(ForIPS), the Helmholtz Portfolio Theme ‘Supercomputing and
Modelling for the Human Brain’ (SMHB), the German Federal
Ministry of Education and Research (BMBF) through the Integrated
Network MitoPD (Mitochondrial endophenotypes of Morbus
Parkinson), under the auspices of the e:Med Program, and the
German Science Foundation [Collaborative Research Centre (CRC)

870; the DFG grant ‘DJ-1 Linked Neurodegeneration Pathways in
New Mouse Models of Parkinson’s Disease’ (WU 164/5-1)].

The authors have no conflict of interest to declare.

References

Afonso-Oramas D., Cruz-Muros I., Alvarez de la Rosa D. et al. (2009)
Dopamine transporter glycosylation correlates with the
vulnerability of midbrain dopaminergic cells in Parkinson’s
disease. Neurobiol. Dis. 36, 494–508.

Amemori K. and Graybiel A. M. (2012) Localized microstimulation of
primate pregenual cingulate cortex induces negative decision-
making. Nat. Neurosci. 15, 776–785.

Anden N. E., Carlsson A., Dahlstroem A., Fuxe K., Hillarp N. A. and
Larsson K. (1964) Demonstration and mapping out of nigro-
neostriatal dopamine neurons. Life Sci. 3, 523–530.

Anderegg A., Poulin J.-F. and Awatramani R. (2015) Molecular
heterogeneity of midbrain dopaminergic neurons – Moving
toward single cell resolution. FEBS Lett. 589, 3714–3726.

Arenas E., Denham M. and Villaescusa J. C. (2015) How to make a
midbrain dopaminergic neuron. Development 142, 1918–1936.

Bader V., Ran Zhu X., Lubbert H. and Stichel C. C. (2005) Expression
of DJ-1 in the adult mouse CNS. Brain Res. 1041, 102–111.

Baker H., Joh T. H. and Reis D. J. (1980) Genetic control of number of
midbrain dopaminergic neurons in inbred strains of mice:
relationship to size and neuronal density of the striatum. Proc.
Natl Acad. Sci. USA 77, 4369–4373.

Barker D. J., Root D. H., Zhang S. and Morales M. (2016) Multiplexed
neurochemical signaling by neurons of the ventral tegmental area.
J. Chem. Neuroanat. 2016; 73, 33–42.

Beier Kevin T., Steinberg Elizabeth E., DeLoach Katherine E. et al.
(2015) Circuit architecture of VTA dopamine neurons revealed by
systematic input-output mapping. Cell 162, 622–634.

Bentivoglio M. and Morelli M. (2005) Chapter I The organization and
circuits of mesencephalic dopaminergic neurons and the
distribution of dopamine receptors in the brain, in Handbook of
Chemical Neuroanatomy (Dunnett M. B. A. B. S. B. and H€okfelt
T., eds), Vol. 21, pp. 1–107. Elsevier Science, USA.

Bereczki D. (2010) The description of all four cardinal signs of
Parkinson’s disease in a Hungarian medical text published in 1690.
Parkinsonism Relat. Disord. 16, 290–293.

Bertler �A., Carlsson A. and Rosengren E. (1958) A method for the
fluorimetric determination of adrenaline and noradrenaline in
tissues. 1. Acta Physiol. Scand. 44, 273–292.

Bj€orklund A. and Dunnett S. B. (2007) Dopamine neuron systems in the
brain: an update. Trends Neurosci. 30, 194–202.

Blackinton J. G., Anvret A., Beilina A., Olson L., Cookson M. R. and
Galter D. (2007) Expression of PINK1 mRNA in human and
rodent brain and in Parkinson’s disease. Brain Res. 1184, 10–16.

Blocq P. and Marinesco G. (1892) Sur un cas de tremblement
parinsonien h�emipl�egique symptomatique d’une tumeur du
p�edoncule c�er�ebral. C R Soc. Biol. 5, 105–111.

Bodea G. O. and Blaess S. (2015) Establishing diversity in the
dopaminergic system. FEBS Lett. 589, 3773–3785.

Bolam J. P. and Smith Y. (1990) The GABA and substance P input to
dopaminergic neurones in the substantia nigra of the rat. Brain Res.
529, 57–78.

Braak H., Tredici K. D., R€ub U., de Vos R. A. I., Jansen Steur E. N. H.
and Braak E. (2003) Staging of brain pathology related to sporadic
Parkinson’s disease. Neurobiol. Aging 24, 197–211.

Branda C. S. and Dymecki S. M. (2004) Talking about a revolution: the
impact of site-specific recombinases on genetic analyses in mice.
Dev. Cell 6, 7–28.

© 2016 The Authors. Journal of Neurochemistry published by John Wiley & Sons Ltd on behalf of
International Society for Neurochemistry, J. Neurochem. (2016) 139 (Suppl. 1), 8--26

Diversity matters in Parkinson’s Disease 21



Brichta L. and Greengard P. (2014) Molecular determinants of selective
dopaminergic vulnerability in Parkinson’s disease: an update.
Front. Neuroanat., 8, 152 (eCollection).

Brimblecombe K. R. and Cragg S. J. (2015) Substance P weights striatal
dopamine transmission differently within the striosome-matrix
axis. J. Neurosci. 35, 9017–9023.

Brissaud E. (1893) Nature et pathog�enie de la maladie de Parkinson,
Lecon sur les maladies nerveuses (Salpêtriere, 1893–1894), Vol. 1,
pp. 488–501. Masson, Paris.

der van Brug M. P., Singleton A., Gasser T. and Lewis P. A. (2015)
Parkinson’s disease: from human genetics to clinical trials. Sci.
Transl. Med., 7, 205 ps220.

Burdach K. F. (1822) Vom Baue und Leben des Gehirns. KF Burdach,
Leipzig.

Cai H., Liu G., Sun L. and Ding J. (2014a) Aldehyde Dehydrogenase 1
making molecular inroads into the differential vulnerability of
nigrostriatal dopaminergic neuron subtypes in Parkinson’s disease.
Transl. Neurodegener. 3, 27.

Cai X., Evrony G. D., Lehmann H. S., Elhosary P. C., Mehta B. K.,
Poduri A. and Walsh C. A. (2014b) Single-cell, genome-wide
sequencing identifies clonal somatic copy-number variation in the
human brain. Cell Rep. 8, 1280–1289.

Callaway E. M. and Luo L. (2015) Monosynaptic circuit tracing with
glycoprotein-deleted rabies viruses. J. Neurosci. 35, 8979–8985.

Carlsson A. (1959) The occurence, distribution and physiological role of
catecholamines in the nervous system. Pharmacol. Rev. 11, 490–
493.

Carlsson A., Lindqvist M. and Magnusson T. O. R. (1957) 3,4-
dihydroxyphenylalanine and 5-hydroxytryptophan as reserpine
antagonists. Nature 180, 1200.

Carlsson A., Lindquist M., Magnusson T. and Waldeck B. (1958) On the
presence of 3-hydroxytyramine in brain. Science 127, 471.

Carlsson A., Falck B. and Hillarp N. A. (1962) Cellular localization of
brain monoamines. Acta Physiologica Scandinavica Supplement
56, 1–28.

Charcot J. M. (1892) Oeuvres Compl�etes, Buereaux du Progr�es M�edical,
Paris.

Chen Y., Zheng Y., Kang Y. et al. (2015) Functional disruption of the
dystrophin gene in rhesus monkey using CRISPR/Cas9. Hum. Mol.
Genet. 24, 3764–3774.

Chuhma N., Tanaka K. F., Hen R. and Rayport S. (2011) Functional
connectome of the striatal medium spiny neuron. J. Neurosci. 31,
1183–1192.

Chuhma N., Mingote S., Moore H. and Rayport S. (2014) Dopamine
neurons control striatal cholinergic neurons via regionally
heterogeneous dopamine and glutamate signaling. Neuron 81,
901–912.

Chung C. Y., Seo H., Sonntag K. C., Brooks A., Lin L. and Isacson O.
(2005) Cell type-specific gene expression of midbrain
dopaminergic neurons reveals molecules involved in their
vulnerability and protection. Hum. Mol. Genet. 14, 1709–1725.

Cowan W. M., Gottlieb D. I., Hendrickson A. E., Price J. L. and
Woolsey T. A. (1972) The autoradiographic demonstration of
axonal connections in the central nervous system. Brain Res. 37,
21–51.

Crittenden J. R. and Graybiel A. M. (2011) Basal Ganglia disorders
associated with imbalances in the striatal striosome and matrix
compartments. Front. Neuroanat. 5, 59.

Dahlstr€om A. and Fuxe K. (1964) Evidence for the existence of
monoamine-containing neurons in the central nervous system. I.
Demonstration of monoamines in the cell bodies of brain stem
neurons. Acta Physiologica Scandinavica Supplement 232, 1–55.

Damier P., Hirsch E. C., Agid Y. and Graybiel A. M. (1999a) The
substantia nigra of the human brain. I. Nigrosomes and the nigral

matrix, a compartmental organization based on calbindin D(28K)
immunohistochemistry. Brain, 122 (Pt 8), 1421–1436.

Damier P., Hirsch E. C., Agid Y. and Graybiel A. M. (1999b) The
substantia nigra of the human brain. II. Patterns of loss of
dopamine-containing neurons in Parkinson’s disease. Brain, 122
(Pt 8), 1437–1448.

Dawson T. M., Ko H. S. and Dawson V. L. (2010) Genetic animal
models of Parkinson’s disease. Neuron 66, 646–661.

Dehay B., Vila M., Bezard E., Brundin P. and Kordower J. H. (2016)
Alpha-synuclein propagation: new insights from animal models.
Mov. Disord. 31, 161–168.

Di Salvio M., Di Giovannantonio L. G., Acampora D., Prosperi R.,
Omodei D., Prakash N., Wurst W. and Simeone A. (2010a) Otx2
controls neuron subtype identity in ventral tegmental area and
antagonizes vulnerability to MPTP. Nat. Neurosci. 13, 1481–1488.

Di Salvio M., Di Giovannantonio L. G., Omodei D., Acampora D. and
Simeone A. (2010b) Otx2 expression is restricted to dopaminergic
neurons of the ventral tegmental area in the adult brain. Inter. J.
Develop. Biol. 54, 939–945.

Double K. L., Reyes S., Werry E. L. and Halliday G. M. (2010) Selective
cell death in neurodegeneration: why are some neurons spared in
vulnerable regions? Prog. Neurobiol. 92, 316–329.

Dueck H., Khaladkar M., Kim T. K. et al. (2015) Deep sequencing
reveals cell-type-specific patterns of single-cell transcriptome
variation. Genome Biol. 16, 122.

Dueck H., Eberwine J. and Kim J. (2016) Variation is function: are
single cell differences functionally important?: testing the
hypothesis that single cell variation is required for aggregate
function. BioEssays 38, 172–180.

Edinger L. (1911) Vorlesungen €uber den Bau der nerv€osen
Zentralorgane des Menschen und der Tiere: f€ur €Arzte und
Studierende, Vol. 1. FCW Vogel, Leipzig.

Ehringer H. and Hornykiewitcz O. (1960) Verteilung von noradrenalin
und dopamin (3-Hydroxytyramin) im Gehirn des menschen und ihr
Verhalten bei Erkrankungen des extrapyramidalen systems.
Klinisch. Wochenschrift 38, 1236–1239.

Ekstrand M. I., Nectow A. R., Knight Z. A., Latcha K. N., Pomeranz L.
E. and Friedman J. M. (2014) Molecular profiling of neurons based
on connectivity. Cell 157, 1230–1242.

El Mestikawy S., Wallen-Mackenzie A., Fortin G. M., Descarries L. and
Trudeau L. E. (2011) From glutamate co-release to vesicular
synergy: vesicular glutamate transporters. Nat. Rev. Neurosci. 12,
204–216.

Erwin J. A., Marchetto M. C. and Gage F. H. (2014) Mobile DNA
elements in the generation of diversity and complexity in the brain.
Nat. Rev. Neurosci. 15, 497–506.

Falck B., Hillarp N.-�A., Thieme G. and Torp A. (1962) Flourescence of
catecholamines and related compounds condensed with
formaldehyde. J. Histochem. Cytochem. 10, 348–354.

Fallon J. H. and Loughlin S. E. (1995) Substantia nigra, in The Rat
Nervous System, (Paxinos G., ed.), pp. 215–236. Academic Press,
San Diego.

Fallon J. H. and Moore R. Y. (1978a) Catecholamine innervation of the
basal forebrain. III. Olfactory bulb, anterior olfactory nuclei, olfactory
tubercle and piriform cortex. J. Comp. Neurol. 180, 533–544.

Fallon J. H. and Moore R. Y. (1978b) Catecholamine innervation of
the basal forebrain. IV. Topography of the dopamine projection
to the basal forebrain and neostriatum. J. Comp. Neurol. 180,
545–580.

Fallon J. H., Koziell D. A. and Moore R. Y. (1978) Catecholamine
innervation of the basal forebrain. II. Amygdala, suprarhinal cortex
and entorhinal cortex. J. Comp. Neurol. 180, 509–532.

Fearnley J. M. and Lees A. J. (1991) Ageing and Parkinson’s disease:
substantia nigra regional selectivity. Brain 114(Pt 5), 2283–2301.

© 2016 The Authors. Journal of Neurochemistry published by John Wiley & Sons Ltd on behalf of
International Society for Neurochemistry, J. Neurochem. (2016) 139 (Suppl. 1), 8--26

22 D. M. Vogt Weisenhorn et al.



Feng Y., Jankovic J. and Wu Y. C. (2015) Epigenetic mechanisms in
Parkinson’s disease. J. Neurol. Sci. 349, 3–9.

Fink R. P. and Heimer L. (1967) Two methods for selective silver
impregnation of degenerating axons and their synaptic endings in
the central nervous system. Brain Res. 4, 369–374.

Forel A. (1877) Untersuchungen €uber die Haubenregion und ihre oberen
Verkn€upfungen im Gehirne des Menschen und einiger S€augetiere.
Archive f€ur Psychiatrie, 7, 393–495.

Forel A. (1907) Gesammelte hirnanatomische Abhandlungen mit einem
Aufsatz zur Aufgabe der Neurobiologie. Reinhardt, M€unchen.

Friedman A., Homma D., Gibb Leif G., Amemori K.-I., Rubin Samuel
J., Hood Adam S., Riad Michael H. and Graybiel Ann M. (2015) A
corticostriatal path targeting striosomes controls decision-making
under conflict. Cell 161, 1320–1333.

FuY., YuanY., Halliday G., Rusznak Z., Watson C. and Paxinos G. (2012)
A cytoarchitectonic and chemoarchitectonic analysis of the dopamine
cell groups in the substantia nigra, ventral tegmental area, and
retrorubral field in the mouse. Brain Struct. Funct. 217, 591–612.

Fuzik J., Zeisel A., Mate Z., Calvigioni D., Yanagawa Y., Szabo G.,
Linnarsson S. and Harkany T. (2015) Integration of
electrophysiological recordings with single-cell RNA-seq data
identifies neuronal subtypes. Nat. Biotech. 34, 175–183.

Geisler S. and Zahm D. S. (2005) Afferents of the ventral tegmental area
in the rat-anatomical substratum for integrative functions. J. Comp.
Neurol. 490, 270–294.

Gerfen C. R. (2004) Basal ganglia, in The Rat Nervous System, (Paxinos
G., ed.), pp. 455–508. Elsevier, Amsterdam.

German D. C. and Manaye K. F. (1993) Midbrain dopaminergic neurons
(nuclei A8, A9, and A10): three-dimensional reconstruction in the
rat. J. Comp. Neurol. 331, 297–309.

Giesert F., Hofmann A., Burger A. et al. (2013) Expression analysis of
Lrrk1, Lrrk2 and Lrrk2 splice variants in mice. PLoS ONE 8,
e63778.

Goetz C. G. (1986) Charcot on Parkinson’s disease. Mov. Disord. 1, 27–
32.

Gray H. (1918) Anatomy of the Human Body. Lea & Febiger,
Philadelphia; Bartleby.com, 2000. www.bartleby.com/107/.

Greene J. G., Dingledine R. and Greenamyre J. T. (2005) Gene
expression profiling of rat midbrain dopamine neurons:
implications for selective vulnerability in parkinsonism.
Neurobiol. Dis. 18, 19–31.

Greffard S., Verny M., Bonnet A. M., Beinis J. Y., Gallinari C., Meaume
S., Piette F., Hauw J. J. and Duyckaerts C. (2006) Motor score of
the Unified Parkinson Disease Rating Scale as a good predictor of
Lewy body-associated neuronal loss in the substantia nigra. Arch.
Neurol. 63, 584–588.

Grimm J., Mueller A., Hefti F. and Rosenthal A. (2004) Molecular basis
for catecholaminergic neuron diversity. Proc. Natl Acad. Sci. USA
101, 13891–13896.

Gubellini P. and Kachidian P. (2015) Animal models of Parkinson’s
disease: an updated overview. Rev. Neurol. (Paris) 171, 750–761.

Guo J. U., Su Y., Shin J. H. et al. (2014) Distribution, recognition and
regulation of non-CpG methylation in the adult mammalian brain.
Nat. Neurosci. 17, 215–222.

Haber S. N. (2014) The place of dopamine in the cortico-basal ganglia
circuit. Neuroscience 282, 248–257.

Haber S. N., Fudge J. L. and McFarland N. R. (2000) Striatonigrostriatal
pathways in primates form an ascending spiral from the shell to the
dorsolateral striatum. J. Neurosci. 20, 2369–2382.

Hardman C. D., Henderson J. M., Finkelstein D. I., Horne M. K.,
Paxinos G. and Halliday G. M. (2002) Comparison of the basal
ganglia in rats, marmosets, macaques, baboons, and humans:
volume and neuronal number for the output, internal relay, and
striatal modulating nuclei. J. Comp. Neurol. 445, 238–255.

Hassler R. (1938) Zur Pathologie der Paralysis agitans und des
postenzephalitischen Parkinsonismus. J. Psychol. Neurol. 48,
387–455.

Hatami A. and Chesselet M. F. (2015) Transgenic rodent models to
study alpha-synuclein pathogenesis, with a focus on cognitive
deficits. Curr. Top. Behav. Neurosci. 22, 303–330.

Hattori T. (1993) Conceptual history of the nigrostriatal dopamine
system. Neurosci. Res. 16, 239–262.

H€okfelt T., M�artensson R., Bj€orklund A., Kleinau A. and Goldstein M.
(1984)Distributionalmapsof tyrosine-hydroxylase-immunoreactive
neurons in the rat brain, in Handbook of Chemical Neuroanatomy
(Bj€orklund A. and H€okfelt T., eds), Vol. 2: Classical Transmitters
in the CNS, Part I, pp. 277–379. Elsevier, Amsterdam.

Holmes G. M. (1901) The nervous system of the dog without a forebrain.
J. Physiol. 27, 1–25.

Hornykiewitcz O. (1963) Die topische Lokalisation und das Verhalten
von Naradrenalin und dopamin (3-Hydroxytyramin) in der
Substantia nigra des normalen und des parkinsonkranken
Menschen. Wien. Klin. Wochenschr. 75, 309–312.

Hornykiewitcz O. (1992) From dopamine to Parkinson’s disease: a
personal research record, in The Neurosciences: Paths of Discovery
II, (Adelman S. A. ed.). Birkh€auser, Basel.

Huber G. C., Crosby E. C., Woodburne R. T., Gillilan L. A., Brown J. O.
and Tamthai B. (1943) The mammalian midbrain and isthmus
regions. J. Comp. Neurol. 78, 129–530.

Joel D. and Weiner I. (2000) The connections of the dopaminergic
system with the striatum in rats and primates: an analysis with
respect to the functional and compartmental organization of the
striatum. Neuroscience 96, 451–474.

Kaushal D., Contos J. J., Treuner K. et al. (2003) Alteration of gene
expression by chromosome loss in the postnatal mouse brain. J.
Neurosci. 23, 5599–5606.

Kim J.-I., Ganesan S., Luo S. X., Wu Y.-W., Park E., Huang E. J., Chen
L. and Ding J. B. (2015) Aldehyde dehydrogenase 1a1 mediates a
GABA synthesis pathway in midbrain dopaminergic neurons.
Science 350, 102–106.

Kordower J. H., Olanow C. W., Dodiya H. B., Chu Y., Beach T. G.,
Adler C. H., Halliday G. M. and Bartus R. T. (2013) Disease
duration and the integrity of the nigrostriatal system in Parkinson’s
disease. Brain 136, 2419–2431.

Korotkova T. M., Ponomarenko A. A., Brown R. E. and Haas H. L.
(2004) Functional diversity of ventral midbrain dopamine and
GABAergic neurons. Mol. Neurobiol. 29, 243–259.

Lammel S., Hetzel A., Hackel O., Jones I., Liss B. and Roeper J. (2008)
Unique properties of mesoprefrontal neurons within a dual
mesocorticolimbic dopamine system. Neuron 57, 760–773.

Lammel S., Ion D. I., Roeper J. and Malenka R. C. (2011) Projection-
specific modulation of dopamine neuron synapses by aversive and
rewarding stimuli. Neuron 70, 855–862.

Lammel S., Lim B. K., Ran C., Huang K. W., Betley M. J., Tye K. M.,
Deisseroth K. and Malenka R. C. (2012) Input-specific control of
reward and aversion in the ventral tegmental area. Nature 491,
212–217.

LaVail J. H. and LaVail M. M. (1972) Retrograde axonal transport in the
central nervous system. Science 176, 1416–1417.

Lees A. J., Tolosa E. and Olanow C. W. (2015) Four pioneers of L-dopa
treatment: Arvid Carlsson, Oleh Hornykiewicz, George Cotzias,
and Melvin Yahr. Mov. Disord. 30, 19–36.

L’Episcopo F., Serapide M. F., Tirolo C., Testa N., Caniglia S., Morale
M. C., Pluchino S. and Marchetti B. (2011a) A Wnt1 regulated
Frizzled-1/beta-Catenin signaling pathway as a candidate
regulatory circuit controlling mesencephalic dopaminergic
neuron-astrocyte crosstalk: therapeutical relevance for neuron
survival and neuroprotection. Mol. Neurodegener. 6, 49.

© 2016 The Authors. Journal of Neurochemistry published by John Wiley & Sons Ltd on behalf of
International Society for Neurochemistry, J. Neurochem. (2016) 139 (Suppl. 1), 8--26

Diversity matters in Parkinson’s Disease 23

Bartleby.com
www.bartleby.com/107/


L’Episcopo F., Tirolo C., Testa N. et al. (2011b) Reactive astrocytes and
Wnt/b-catenin signaling link nigrostriatal injury to repair in 1-
methyl-4-phenyl-1,2,3,6-tetrahydropyridine model of Parkinson’s
disease. Neurobiol. Dis. 41, 508–527.

L’Episcopo F., Tirolo C., Caniglia S., Testa N., Morale M. C., Serapide
M. F., Pluchino S. and Marchetti B. (2014) TargetingWnt signaling
at the neuroimmune interface for dopaminergic neuroprotection/
repair in Parkinson’s disease. J. Mol. Cell Biol. 6, 13–26.

Lerner T. N., Shilyansky C., Davidson T. J. et al. (2015) Intact-brain
analyses reveal distinct information carried by SNc dopamine
subcircuits. Cell 162, 635–647.

Lerner Talia N., Ye L. and Deisseroth K. (2016) Communication in
neural circuits: tools, opportunities, and challenges. Cell 164,
1136–1150.

Lewis D. A., Sesack S. R., Levey A. I. and Rosenberg D. R. (1998)
Dopamine axons in primate prefrontal cortex: specificity of
distribution, synaptic targets, and development. Adv. Pharmacol.
(San Diego, Calif.), 42, 703–706.

Lewy F. H. (1912) Paralysis agitans. I. Pathologische Anatomie, in
Handbuch der Neurologie, (Lewandowsky M. ed.), Vol. III. 920–
933. Springer, Berlin.

Li J., Duarte T., Kocabas A., Works M., McConnell S. K. and Hynes M.
A. (2014) Evidence for topographic guidance of dopaminergic
axons by differential Netrin-1 expression in the striatum. Mol. Cell
Neurosci. 61, 85–96.

Liss B., Haeckel O., Wildmann J., Miki T., Seino S. and Roeper J.
(2005) K-ATP channels promote the differential degeneration of
dopaminergic midbrain neurons. Nat. Neurosci. 8, 1742–1751.

Liu G., Yu J., Ding J. et al. (2014) Aldehyde dehydrogenase 1 defines
and protects a nigrostriatal dopaminergic neuron subpopulation. J.
Clin. Invest. 124, 3032–3046.

Lodato M. A., Woodworth M. B., Lee S. et al. (2015) Somatic mutation
in single human neurons tracks developmental and transcriptional
history. Science 350, 94–98.

Lovatt D., Ruble B. K., Lee J. et al. (2014) Transcriptome In Vivo
Analysis (TIVA) of spatially defined single cells in intact live
mouse and human brain tissue. Nat. Methods 11, 190–196.

Luys J. (1865) Recherches sur le syst�eme c�er�ebro-spinal, sa structure,
ses fonctions et ses maladies, Bailli�ere et Fils, Paris.

Ma T. P. (1989) Identification of the substantia nigra pars lateralis in the
macaque using cytochrome oxidase and fiber stains. Brain Res.
480, 305–311.

Ma S. Y., R€oytt€a M., Rinne J. O., Collan Y. and Rinne U. K. (1997)
Correlation between neuromorphometry in the substantia nigra and
clinical features in Parkinson’s disease using disector counts. J.
Neurol. Sci. 151, 83–87.

Macosko Evan Z., Basu A., Satija R. et al. (2015) Highly parallel
genome-wide expression profiling of individual cells using
nanoliter droplets. Cell 161, 1202–1214.

Manyam B. V. (1990) Paralysis agitans and levodopa in “Ayurveda”:
ancient Indian medical treatise. Mov. Disord. 5, 47–48.

Matsuda W., Furuta T., Nakamura K. C., Hioki H., Fujiyama F., Arai R.
and Kaneko T. (2009) Single nigrostriatal dopaminergic neurons
form widely spread and highly dense axonal arborizations in the
neostriatum. J. Neurosci. 29, 444–453.

Matsumoto M. and Hikosaka O. (2009) Two types of dopamine neuron
distinctly convey positive and negative motivational signals.
Nature 459, 837–841.

McConnell M. J., Lindberg M. R., Brennand K. J. et al. (2013) Mosaic
copy number variation in human neurons. Science 342, 632–637.

Menegas W., Bergan J. F., Ogawa S. K., Isogai Y., Umadevi
Venkataraju K., Osten P., Uchida N. and Watabe-Uchida M.
(2015) Dopamine neurons projecting to the posterior striatum form
an anatomically distinct subclass. eLife, 4, e10032.

Meynert T. (1884) Psychiatrie: Klinik der Erkrankungen des
Vorderhirns begr€undet auf dessen Bau, Leistungen und
Ern€ahrung : 1. H€alfte. (Bogen 1-18). W. Braum€uller, Wien.

Mingazzini G. (1889) Sur la fine structure de la substantia nigra
Soemmeringi. Archives Italliennes de Biologie 12, 93–98.

Mingote S., Chuhma N., Kusnoor S. V. and Field B. (2015)
Functional connectome analysis of dopamine neuron
glutamatergic connections in forebrain regions. J. Neurosci. 35,
16259–16271.

Monakow C. (1895) Experimentelle und pathologisch-anatomische
Untersuchungen €uber die Haubenregion, den Sehh€ugel und die
Regio subthalamica, nebst Beitr€agen zur Kenntniss fr€uh
erworbener Gross- und Kleinhirndefekte. Archiv f. Psychiatrie.
27, 386–478.

Moore R. Y. (1970) Brain Lesions and Amine Metabolism, in
International Review of Neurobiology, (Carl C. P. and John R.
S. eds.), Vol. 13, pp. 67–91. Elsevier, Amsterdam.

Moore R. Y. and Heller A. (1967) Subcortical systems participating in
the control of caudate nucleus dopamine content, in Progress in
Neurogenetics, (Barbeau A. and Brunette J. R., eds.), pp. 276–282.
Excerpta Medica Foundation, Amsterdam.

Muthane U., Ramsay K. A., Jiang H., Jackson-Lewis V., Donaldson D.,
Fernando S., Ferreira M. and Przedborski S. (1994) Differences in
nigral neuron number and sensitivity to 1-methyl-4-phenyl-1,2,3,6-
tetrahydropyridine in C57/bl and CD-1 mice. Exp. Neurol. 126,
195–204.

Nandhagopal R., Kuramoto L., Schulzer M. et al. (2011) Longitudinal
evolution of compensatory changes in striatal dopamine processing
in Parkinson’s disease. Brain 134, 3290–3298.

Nauta W. J. H. (1993) Some early travails of tracing axonal pathways in
the brain. J. Neurosci. 13, 1337–1345.

Nauta W. J. H. and Gygax P. A. (1954) Silver impregnation of
degenerating axons in the central nervous system: a modified
technique. Stain Technol. 29, 91–93.

Nectow A. R., Ekstrand M. I. and Friedman J. M. (2015) Molecular
characterization of neuronal cell types based on patterns of
projection with Retro-TRAP. Nat. Protoc. 10, 1319–1327.

Nelson E. L., Liang C. L., Sinton C. M. and German D. C. (1996)
Midbrain dopaminergic neurons in the mouse: computer-assisted
mapping. J. Comp. Neurol. 369, 361–371.

Niu Y., Shen B., Cui Y. et al. (2014) Generation of gene-modified
cynomolgus monkey via Cas9/RNA-mediated gene targeting in
one-cell embryos. Cell 156, 836–843.

Oades R. D. and Halliday G. M. (1987) Ventral tegmental (A10) system:
neurobiology. 1. Anatomy and connectivity. Brain Res. Rev. 12,
117–165.

Osborne P. B., Halliday G. M., Cooper H. M. and Keast J. R. (2005)
Localization of immunoreactivity for deleted in colorectal cancer
(DCC), the receptor for the guidance factor netrin-1, in ventral tier
dopamine projection pathways in adult rodents. Neuroscience 131,
671–681.

Pacelli C., Giguere N., Bourque M. J., Levesque M., Slack R. S. and
Trudeau L. E. (2015) Elevated Mitochondrial Bioenergetics and
Axonal Arborization Size Are Key Contributors to the
Vulnerability of Dopamine Neurons. Curr. Biol. 25, 2349–2360.

Pagonabarraga J., Kulisevsky J., Strafella A. P. and Krack P. (2015)
Apathy in Parkinson’s disease: clinical features, neural substrates,
diagnosis, and treatment. Lancet Neurol. 14, 518–531.

Pan W. X., Mao T. and Dudman J. T. (2010) Inputs to the dorsal striatum
of the mouse conserve the parallel circuit architecture of the
forebrain. Front. Neuroanat. 4, 147 (eCollection).

Panman L., Papathanou M., Laguna A. et al. (2014) Sox6 and Otx2
control the specification of substantia nigra and ventral tegmental
area dopamine neurons. Cell Rep. 8, 1018–1025.

© 2016 The Authors. Journal of Neurochemistry published by John Wiley & Sons Ltd on behalf of
International Society for Neurochemistry, J. Neurochem. (2016) 139 (Suppl. 1), 8--26

24 D. M. Vogt Weisenhorn et al.



Parent M. and Parent A. (2006) Relationship between axonal
collateralization and neuronal degeneration in basal ganglia. J.
Neural. Transm. Supplementum, 70, 85–88.

Parent M. and Parent A. (2010) Substantia nigra and Parkinson’s
disease: a brief history of their long and Intimate relationship. Can.
J. Neurol. Sci. 37, 313–319.

P�ariz F. P. (1690) Pax corporis, az az az emberi testnek belsT
nyavaly�ainak okair�ol, f�eszkeirTl ‘s azoknak orvosl�as�anak
m�odgy�ar�ol val�o tracta. (“Pax corporis, i.e., a teaching of the
causes, sources and the methods of treatment of the internal
diseases of the human body”). N�emethi Mih�aly, Kolozsv�ar,
Hungary.

Parkkinen L., O’Sullivan S. S., Collins C., Petrie A., Holton J. L.,
Revesz T. and Lees A. J. (2011) Disentangling the relationship
between lewy bodies and nigral neuronal loss in Parkinson’s
disease. J. Parkinson’s Dis. 1, 277–286.

Petersen K., Olesen O. F. and Mikkelsen J. D. (1999) Developmental
expression of alpha-synuclein in rat hippocampus and cerebral
cortex. Neuroscience 91, 651–659.

Pham T. T., Giesert F., Rothig A. et al. (2010) DJ-1-deficient mice show
less TH-positive neurons in the ventral tegmental area and exhibit
non-motoric behavioural impairments. Genes Brain Behav. 9, 305–
317.

Pickrell A. M., Pinto M. and Moraes C. T. (2013) Mouse models of
Parkinson’s disease associated with mitochondrial dysfunction.
Mol. Cell Neurosci. 55, 87–94.

Pirritano D., Plastino M., Bosco D., Gallelli L., Siniscalchi A. and De
Sarro G. (2014) Gambling disorder during dopamine replacement
treatment in Parkinson’s disease: a comprehensive review. BioMed
Res. Inter. 2014, 728038.

Poulin J.-F., Zou J., Drouin-Ouellet J., Kim K. Y., Cicchetti F. and
Awatramani R. B. (2014) Defining midbrain dopaminergic neuron
diversity by single-cell gene expression profiling. Cell Rep., 9,
930–943.

Prakash N., Brodski C., Naserke T. et al. (2006) A Wnt1-regulated
genetic network controls the identity and fate of midbrain-
dopaminergic progenitors in vivo. Development 133, 89–98.

Prestoz L., Jaber M. and Gaillard A. (2012) Dopaminergic axon
guidance: which makes what? Front. Cell. Neurosci. 6, 32
(eCollection).

Pupe S. and Wallen-Mackenzie A. (2015) Cre-driven optogenetics in the
heterogeneous genetic panorama of the VTA. Trends Neurosci. 38,
375–386.

Rajewsky K., Gu H., Kuhn R., Betz U. A., Muller W., Roes J. and
Schwenk F. (1996) Conditional gene targeting. J. Clin. Invest. 98,
600–603.

Ramon Y. and Cajal S. (1899-1904) Textura del sistema nervioso del
hombre y de los vertebrados, Moya, Madrid.

Reyes S., Fu Y., Double K., Thompson L., Kirik D., Paxinos G. and
Halliday G. M. (2012) GIRK2 expression in dopamine neurons of
the substantia nigra and ventral tegmental area. J. Comp. Neurol.
520, 2591–2607.

Reyes S., Cottam V., Kirik D., Double K. L. and Halliday G. M. (2013a)
Variability in neuronal expression of dopamine receptors and
transporters in the substantia nigra. Mov. Disord. 28, 1351–1359.

Reyes S., Fu Y., Double K. L. et al. (2013b) Trophic factors differentiate
dopamine neurons vulnerable to Parkinson’s disease. Neurobiol.
Aging 34, 873–886.

Roeper J. (2013) Dissecting the diversity of midbrain dopamine neurons.
Trends Neurosci. 36, 336–342.

Root D. H., Mejias-Aponte C. A., Zhang S., Wang H. L., Hoffman A. F.,
Lupica C. R. and Morales M. (2014) Single rodent mesohabenular
axons release glutamate and GABA. Nat. Neurosci. 17, 1543–
1551.

Rosen B., Schick J. and Wurst W. (2015) Beyond knockouts: the
International Knockout Mouse Consortium delivers modular and
evolving tools for investigating mammalian genes. Mamm.
Genome 26, 456–466.

Sano T. (1910) Betrag zur vergleichenden Anatomie der substantia nigra,
des Corpus Luysii und der Zona incerta. Mschr. Psychiat. Neurol.
27 und 28.

Schwarz L. A., Miyamichi K., Gao X. J. et al. (2015) Viral-genetic
tracing of the input-output organization of a central noradrenaline
circuit. Nature 524, 88–92.

Sider D. and McVaugh M. (1979) Galen on tremor, palpitation, spasm,
and rigor. Trans. Stud. Coll. Physicians Phila. 1, 183–210.

Simon H. H., Saueressig H., Wurst W., Goulding M. D. and O’Leary D.
D. (2001) Fate of midbrain dopaminergic neurons controlled by the
engrailed genes. J. Neurosci. 21, 3126–3134.

Smith G. A., Isacson O. and Dunnett S. B. (2012) The search for genetic
mouse models of prodromal Parkinson’s disease. Exp. Neurol. 237,
267–273.

Soemmering S. T. V. (1791) Vom Baue des menschlichen K€orpers:
Hirnlehre und Nervenlehre. Vol. 5. Varrentrap & Werner,
Frankfurt, Germany.

Somogyi P., Bolam J. P., Totterdell S. and Smith A. D. (1981)
Monosynaptic input from the nucleus accumbens–ventral striatum
region to retrogradely labelled nigrostriatal neurones. Brain Res.
217, 245–263.

Stamatakis A. M., Jennings J. H., Ung R. L. et al. (2013) A unique
population of ventral tegmental area neurons inhibits the lateral
habenula to promote reward. Neuron 80, 1039–1053.

Stichel C. C., Augustin M., Kuhn K., Zhu X. R., Engels P., Ullmer C.
and Lubbert H. (2000) Parkin expression in the adult mouse brain.
Eur. J. Neurosci. 12, 4181–4194.

Stuber G. D., Hnasko T. S., Britt J. P., Edwards R. H. and Bonci A. (2010)
Dopaminergic terminals in the nucleus accumbens but not the dorsal
striatum corelease glutamate. J. Neurosci. 30, 8229–8233.

Sulzer D. (2007) Multiple hit hypotheses for dopamine neuron loss in
Parkinson’s disease. Trends Neurosci. 30, 244–250.

Tang F., Barbacioru C., Wang Y. et al. (2009) mRNA-Seq whole-
transcriptome analysis of a single cell. Nat. Methods 6, 377–382.

Tecuapetla F., Patel J. C., Xenias H. et al. (2010) Glutamatergic
signaling by mesolimbic dopamine neurons in the nucleus
accumbens. J. Neurosci. 30, 7105–7110.

Tr�etiakoff C. (1919) Contribution �a l’�etude de l’anatomiepathologique
du locus niger de Soemmering avec quelques d�eductions relatives
�a la pathog�enie des troubles du tonus musculaire et de la maladie
de Parkinson. Jouve, Paris.

Tritsch N. X., Ding J. B. and Sabatini B. L. (2012) Dopaminergic
neurons inhibit striatal output through non-canonical release of
GABA. Nature 490, 262–266.

Tritsch N. X., Granger A. J. and Sabatini B. L. (2016) Mechanisms and
functions of GABA co-release. Nat. Rev. Neurosci. 17, 139–145.

Trudeau L. E., Hnasko T. S., Wallen-Mackenzie A., Morales M.,
Rayport S. and Sulzer D. (2014) The multilingual nature of
dopamine neurons. Prog. Brain Res. 211, 141–164.

Tsai C. (1925) The optic tracts and centers of the opossum. Didelphis
virginiana. J. Comp. Neurol. 39, 173–216.

Tu Z., Yang W., Yan S., Guo X. and Li X. J. (2015) CRISPR/Cas9: a
powerful genetic engineering tool for establishing large animal
models of neurodegenerative diseases. Mol. Neurodegener. 10, 35.

Usoskin D., Furlan A., Islam S. et al. (2015) Unbiased classification of
sensory neuron types by large-scale single-cell RNA sequencing.
Nat. Neurosci. 18, 145–153.

Veenvliet J. and Smidt M. (2014) Molecular mechanisms of
dopaminergic subset specification: fundamental aspects and
clinical perspectives. Cell. Mol. Life Sci. 71, 4703–4727.

© 2016 The Authors. Journal of Neurochemistry published by John Wiley & Sons Ltd on behalf of
International Society for Neurochemistry, J. Neurochem. (2016) 139 (Suppl. 1), 8--26

Diversity matters in Parkinson’s Disease 25



Verstraeten A., Theuns J. and Van Broeckhoven C. (2015) Progress in
unraveling the genetic etiology of Parkinson disease in a genomic
era. Trends Genet. 31, 140–149.

Vicq d’Azyr F. (1786) Trait�e d’Anatomie et de Physiologie avec des
Plances Color�ees. Didot, Paris.

Watabe-Uchida M., Zhu L., Ogawa Sachie K., Vamanrao A. and Uchida
N. (2012) Whole-brain mapping of direct inputs to midbrain
dopamine neurons. Neuron 74, 858–873.

Wickersham I. R., Finke S., Conzelmann K. K. and Callaway E. M.
(2007a) Retrograde neuronal tracing with a deletion-mutant rabies
virus. Nat. Methods 4, 47–49.

Wickersham I. R., Lyon D. C., Barnard R. J., Mori T., Finke S.,
Conzelmann K. K., Young J. A. and Callaway E. M. (2007b)
Monosynaptic restriction of transsynaptic tracing from single,
genetically targeted neurons. Neuron 53, 639–647.

Wurst W. and Prakash N. (2014) Wnt1-regulated genetic networks in
midbrain dopaminergic neuron development. J. Mol.Cell. Biol. 6,
34–41.

Yamaguchi T., Sheen W. and Morales M. (2007) Glutamatergic neurons
are present in the rat ventral tegmental area. Eur. J. Neurosci. 25,
106–118.

Yamaguchi T., Wang H. L., Li X., Ng T. H. and Morales M. (2011)
Mesocorticolimbic glutamatergic pathway. J. Neurosci. 31, 8476–
8490.

Yamaguchi T., Qi J., Wang H. L., Zhang S. and Morales M. (2015)
Glutamatergic and dopaminergic neurons in the mouse ventral
tegmental area. Eur. J. Neurosci. 41, 760–772.

Yetnikoff L., Lavezzi H. N., Reichard R. A. and Zahm D. S. (2014) An
update on the connections of the ventral mesencephalic
dopaminergic complex. Neuroscience, 282c, 23–48.

Zeisel A., Munoz-Manchado A. B., Codeluppi S. et al. (2015) Brain
structure. Cell types in the mouse cortex and hippocampus revealed
by single-cell RNA-seq. Science 347, 1138–1142.

Zhang J., Gotz S., Vogt Weisenhorn D. M., Simeone A., Wurst W. and
Prakash N. (2015a) A WNT1-regulated developmental gene
cascade prevents dopaminergic neurodegeneration in adult En1
(+/-) mice. Neurobiol. Dis. 82, 32–45.

Zhang S., Qi J., Li X., Wang H.-L., Britt J. P., Hoffman A. F., Bonci A.,
Lupica C. R. and Morales M. (2015b) Dopaminergic and
glutamatergic microdomains in a subset of rodent
mesoaccumbens axons. Nat. Neurosci. 18, 386–392.

© 2016 The Authors. Journal of Neurochemistry published by John Wiley & Sons Ltd on behalf of
International Society for Neurochemistry, J. Neurochem. (2016) 139 (Suppl. 1), 8--26

26 D. M. Vogt Weisenhorn et al.


