
study comparative research. This workshop will provide an
example of some of the opportunities and practical challenges
to conducting such research. Professors Tea Lallukka and
Vittal Katikireddi will act as discussants and the potential for
collaboration across European cohorts will be explored.
Key messages:
� Co-ordinated analysis of multiple UK longitudinal datasets

to inform the COVID-19 response has been achieved and
this approach could be extended across Europe.
� Existing health inequalities may be exacerbated during the

pandemic as disadvantaged groups experience greater
disruption.
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Like other health systems worldwide, the UK, the National
Health Service (NHS) has faced major disruptions due to high
Covid-19 burden and repeated lockdown measures. These
disruptions can have both short and long-term health impacts.
The NHS provides free healthcare and prioritises equity of
delivery, but despite this, inequalities in access to health care
remain and it is plausible that pandemic-related disruptions
affect different groups disproportionally, thus widening health
inequalities. This paper investigates associations between well-
established axes of health inequality (sex, age, social class,
education and ethnicity) and self-reported health care disrup-
tions (medication access, procedures, or appointments) in over
65,000 participants across eleven longitudinal studies in the
UK. Participants reported disruptions from March 2020
through to as late as January 2021. We obtained study-specific
estimates using logistic regression models and combined them
in a random-effects meta-analysis. Analyses were adjusted for
sex, age and ethnicity where relevant. Between 10.1%
(Millennium Cohort Study) and 31.8 % (Understanding
Society) of study participants reported experiencing health
care disruptions. Results show that females (OR: 1.27 [95%CI:
1.15,1.4]; I2=56%), older participants (e.g. OR: 1.39
[1.13,1.72]; I2=77% for 65-75y vs 45-54y), and non-white
ethnic minorities (OR: 1.17 [1.02,1.34]; I2=0% vs white) were
more likely to report healthcare disruptions. Those in a more
disadvantaged social class (e.g. OR: 1.18 [1.08, 1.21]; I2=0%
for manual/routine vs managerial/professional) were also more
likely to report healthcare disruptions, but no clear differences
were observed for education. Our findings highlight inequities
in healthcare disruptions, which, if unaddressed, could
contribute to the maintenance or widening of existing health
inequalities.
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Disruptions related to the COVID-19 pandemic and its
associated virus suppression measures have affected many
worldwide but those already suffering from psychological
distress may have been especially vulnerable. We investigated
associations between pre-pandemic psychological distress and
disruptions to healthcare, economic activity, housing, and
cumulative disruptions. Data were from 59,482 participants in
12 UK longitudinal adult population surveys with both pre-
pandemic and COVID-19 surveys. Participants self-reported
disruptions since the start of the pandemic to: healthcare
(medication access, procedures, or appointments); economic
activity (negative changes in employment, income or working
hours); and housing (change of address or household
composition). Logistic regression models were used to estimate
associations between pre-pandemic standardised psychological
distress scores and disruption outcomes. Findings were
synthesised using a random effects meta-analysis with
restricted maximum likelihood. Approximately one to two
thirds of study participants experienced some form of
disruption during the pandemic. One standard deviation
higher pre-pandemic psychological distress was associated
with: increased odds of any healthcare disruption (odds ratio:
1.30 [95% CI: 1.20-1.40]; I2: 65%); increased odds of
experiencing any economic disruption (1.11 [1.03-1.16]; I2:
61%); no associations with housing disruptions; and increased
likelihood of experiencing a disruption in at least two domains
(1.25 [1.18-1.32]; I2: 38%) or one domain (1.11 [1.07-1.16];
I2: 32%) compared to no disruptions. Associations did not
differ by sex, ethnicity, education, or age. Individuals suffering
from psychological distress pre-pandemic may need additional
support to manage stressful life disruptions. Considering
mental ill-health was already unequally distributed in the UK
population, this may exacerbate existing inequalities related to
sex, ethnicity, education and age.
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The recent Covid-19 pandemic, and its mitigations, are
expected to have long-term consequences on the health and
health behaviours. In an effort to reduce the effect of lockdown
on the economy, the UK government launched their
Coronavirus Job Retention Scheme (commonly known as
furlough) in March 2020, which entitled employees who were
unable to work to 80% of their monthly pay up to a cap of
£2,500. We investigated the association between changes in
economic activity and health behaviours of the working-age
participants of eight longitudinal studies, during the early
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