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Key Summary Points

This letter was written in response to
‘‘Gabapentinoid Benefit and Risk
Stratification: Mechanisms Over Myth’’ as
a large body of evidence exists supporting
the potential for gabapentinoid abuse that
was overlooked in the named article.

This letter was written to bridge the
knowledge gap not addressed by the
authors related to the significant, original
research evidence that supports
gabapentinoid abuse.

The authors argue that gabapentinoids are
overwhelmingly safe, which may be true
for some populations, but not all.

DIGITAL FEATURES

This article is published with digital features,
including a summary slide, to facilitate under-
standing of the article. To view digital features
for this article go to https://doi.org/10.6084/
m9.figshare.12994247.

To the Editor,
We recently read with concern the article

entitled ‘‘Gabapentinoid benefit and risk strati-
fication: mechanisms over myth,’’ published by
McAnally and colleagues [1]. While we agree
that gabapentinoids have important therapeu-
tic roles and represent a relatively low-risk
option for many patients, we believe this paper
fails to accurately characterize the significant
body of evidence identifying misuse/abuse
associated with these medications. In particular,
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the assertions that gabapentinoids are ‘‘remark-
ably safe’’ and that the literature is ‘‘sensation-
alized’’ and fraught with ‘‘liberal conjecture’’ [1]
is a personal opinion, and an inaccurate repre-
sentation of the current literature. We concur
that the mechanism of these medications (both
therapeutically and abuse-related) is not fully
elucidated. However, significant evidence exists
from many different sources describing misuse/
abuse that cannot be overlooked. A simple
search of MEDLINE yields more than 100 arti-
cles describing original research into
gabapentinoid misuse, abuse or overdose, with
the vast majority finding evidence that this is
indeed occurring, and the problem is growing.
Furthermore, recent evidence of their misuse
potential has led the UK to re-classify both
gabapentinoids as controlled substances [2].
Several US states have taken congruent mea-
sures for gabapentin, with the US Food and
Drug Administration (FDA) considering similar
regulation [3, 4].

The authors downplay the potential for
misuse/abuse by stating there is little docu-
mented evidence of true physiologic addiction
to the gabapentinoids in the literature [1].
While this may be true, the evidence clearly
shows that these medications can produce
desirable effects that may motivate a person to
misuse or abuse them. A plethora of studies of
persons misusing/abusing gabapentinoids
describe pleasurable effects, including euphoria,
marijuana-like highs, alcohol-like intoxication,
improved sociability, increased energy and
other effects akin to medications commonly
abused, whereas many others describe concur-
rent use with opioids or other psychoactive
compounds as a means to enhance their desir-
able effects as primary motivations for use [5, 6].
Blinded studies have identified that gabapenti-
noids produce similar drug-liking effects to
diazepam [7] and tetrahydrocannabinol (the
psychoactive component of cannabis) [8] in
patients with a history of substance use disor-
der. The authors also state that studies indicate
that the ‘‘vast majority of misuse events appear
to occur in an attempt to ameliorate opioid
withdrawal symptoms’’ [1], which is simply not
borne out in the current literature. Several
studies have assessed motivators for

gabapentinoid use. One found attenuation of
opioid withdrawal symptoms as the most com-
mon reason, endorsed by 67% of respondents,
but found abuse indicators such as synergism
with other substances (52%), recreation (47%)
and curiosity (41%) reported in similar magni-
tude [9]. Another found that gabapentin made
the respondent feel intoxicated in 76% of cases,
while also helping to relieve pain (76%), with-
drawal (70%), anxiety (63%), sleep problems
(69%) and low mood (58%) [10]. While we agree
relief of withdrawal symptoms is a common
reason for use, more than half of respondents
endorse other abuse or misuse indicators as key
reasons for use [9, 10].

The authors also discount or fail to include
pertinent epidemiologic data. For instance,
while they note that 600 cases of gabapentinoid
misuse reported to the US FDA Adverse Event
Reporting System (FAERS) is low, there is no
mention of a similar study of the European
Medicine Agency (EMA) database which repor-
ted nearly 12,000 cases from 2004–2015, with
more than 75% of those reported having
occurred from 2012–2015 [11]. Additionally, in
one of the largest studies of gabapentinoid
abuse to date, US commercial insurance claims
data revealed that gabapentin and pregabalin
displayed similar patterns of abuse liability
compared to benzodiazepines and Z-hypnotics
[12]. The authors cited this study but criticized
the methodology of this article, namely the use
of Lorenz-1 curves as an economic measure of
inequity of distribution of income and goods.
However, this methodology is prevalent in
pharmacovigilance research as a means of elu-
cidating non-medical use or abuse of medica-
tions [13–15].

The authors also describe that the benefits of
gabapentinoid therapy far outweigh the risks
[1]. While we concur this is true for many
patients, it may not be the case for all. As
mentioned, gabapentin is primarily used off-la-
bel, but outside of neuropathic pain conditions,
very few off-label indications have strong evi-
dence to support its efficacy [16]. However,
studies describing increased patient harm asso-
ciated with gabapentinoids, particularly when
used alongside opioids, have proliferated. This
is especially concerning given that as many as
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50–60% of patients prescribed gabapentinoids
may also be prescribed opioids [4, 17, 18]. As the
US continues to experience record numbers of
opioid overdose fatalities, such risks of additive
therapies cannot be ignored. While the authors
did provide limited acknowledgement of the
increased risk among patients concurrently
using opioids and gabapentinoids, they failed to
expand on the relevant evidence in this area.
Large-scale, population-based studies have
recently identified that gabapentinoids, when
used concomitantly with opioids, significantly
increase all-cause, drug-related and respiratory
depression-related hospital utilization [19, 20],
risk of neonatal opioid withdrawal [21, 22] and,
most concerning, risk of opioid-related mortal-
ity [18, 23–27]. Such studies prompted the FDA
to add new warnings of respiratory depressant
effects to the gabapentinoid product labeling
and call for manufacturers to conduct clinical
trials regarding their abuse potential [28].

We acknowledge the important role
gabapentinoids play in treating a variety of
medical conditions and are not calling for
sweeping reductions in their use. When used
appropriately under the guidance of healthcare
professionals, these represent relatively safe
medication options for most patients. However,
there is significant evidence that these medica-
tions are being misused outside of medical rec-
ommendations [5, 6, 9, 10], often in excess of
FDA recommended doses [12], and obtained
from non-regulated sources [5]. As pharmacist
clinicians, it is our professional responsibility to
understand and educate healthcare profession-
als and the public alike on the delicate balance
of safety/efficacy of pharmacologic treatments.
There is sufficient evidence to warrant caution
when prescribing gabapentinoids, and this
caution should be heightened among patients
with an opioid use disorder or those who con-
currently use high-dose opioids, especially with
other central nervous system depressants. This
article, while communicating several useful
points, more properly should be labeled as a
commentary as opposed to a literature review.
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