
Communication in medicine: 

a core curriculum^j 
Editor Communication skills are 

central to our effectiveness as 

doctors. The Royal College of 

Physicians' report on the subject of 
doctor-patient communication is 
therefore a significant contribution 

underlining the importance of the 

development of skills in this area 

by young doctors1. In addition, it 

adds more detail to the Core 

curriculum for SHOs-. The challenge 
for all of us involved in the educa- 

tion and training of doctors is to 

develop effective ways of imple- 
menting such recommendations 
and policies. 
We are in our fourth year of 

evaluating the benefits of linking 
an established SHO rotation in 

hospital medicine based at New- 
castle General Hospital to a 

general practice post with the 
Northumbria Vocational Training 
Scheme for General Practice. This 

rotation provides young doctors, 
who are either intent on a career 

in hospital medicine or undecided 
about a career pathway, with an 

opportunity to sample and learn 
from general practice. Trainees 
undertake three posts each of four 

months' duration, one of which is 

in an established training practice. 
A curriculum is fashioned in the 

general practice post to suit indi- 
vidual trainee needs with an 

emphasis on communication skills, 
team-work, prescribing, record 

keeping and the psychological and 
social aspects of patients' 
problems3. Communication skills 
are taught initially at a two day resi- 
dential course which uses a small 

group format to introduce various 

models of the consultation with the 
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help of videotape. This is followed- 

up in the practice by regular video- 

taping of the trainee's consulta- 
tions which are then analysed 
during protected teaching sessions. 
Helpful feedback allows trainees to 

gain insight into their own perfor- 
mance and identifies the areas 

which need improvement. The 

development of communication 
and consultation skills is seen by 
the trainees as one of the most 

important benefits of the general 
practice post and useful in their 
future careers. 

Patients deserve doctors who see 

the importance of communication 
and who have been shown to have 

acquired the appropriate skills. 
Our experience confirms that 

opportunities exist for the educa- 
tion and training of doctors in 

hospital specialties and general 
practice to be combined in a 

complementary manner to the 
ultimate benefit of patients4 "'. 
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