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Abstract
Introduction
An important but often overlooked component of caring for cancer patients is survivorship care, provided
after the completion of active treatment in order to facilitate transition into the next surveillance phase. A
survivorship program was developed to deliver a one-on-one education session on healthy lifestyle
behaviours and available resources to help patients transition to their post-treatment life. This study reports
the outcome of this pilot survivorship care program provided to breast cancer patients completing radiation
therapy. Program delivery format and content were evaluated for effectiveness, applicability, and feasibility. 

Methods and materials
Between March 2017 and August 2018, 124 breast cancer patients, nearing completion of their curative
intent radiation treatments, participated in this centre-specific survivorship program. The survivorship
program entailed a one on one education session delivered to breast cancer patients within the last two
weeks of their radiation treatment. Participants were provided a Microsoft PowerPoint presentation,
information pamphlet, and evaluation form to provide feedback on materials and presentation. Survivorship
education sessions were delivered by study staff or staff scheduled in the Pre-Radiotherapy Patient
Assessment role. Follow-up phone calls were conducted post-session delivery to determine the ongoing
applicability of survivorship material. Staff was also given an evaluation form upon completion of the trial to
measure the session feasibility.

Results
Of the 124 participants in the study, 69 (56%) provided feedback. Results showed that 98% of participants
felt the information provided either confirmed what they were already doing (44%) or encouraged them to
consider a lifestyle change (54%). Additionally, 70% reported feeling more confident after completing the
session. Staff survey results reported that 87.5% agreed or strongly agreed that these sessions were
beneficial and valuable to patients

Conclusions
Delivering one-on-one education sessions to individual participants focusing on healthy lifestyle
measures garnered a positive response from participants, increasing their confidence and knowledge for
making lifestyle changes. While staff survey results pointed strongly in favour of continuing with the
survivorship sessions, it was shown that the methods of delivery trialed in this study were not feasible to be
implemented on a larger scale. With some workflow modification, implementing a survivorship care
program in our cancer centre is a possible and important aspect of a patient’s treatment journey.

Categories: Radiation Oncology, Quality Improvement
Keywords: cancer, survivorship, radiation therapy, education

Introduction
There are numerous aspects to providing care to individuals with breast cancer, from delivering active
treatment to offering social support. A significant but often overlooked component of caring for breast
cancer patients is survivorship care, provided after the completion of active treatment in order to facilitate
transition into the next surveillance phase [1]. Cancer’s burden, which includes physical and psychosocial
issues, does not end when active treatment is completed. Some long-term issues patients may face include
ongoing pain, fatigue, lymphedema, heart disease, difficulty sleeping, weight gain, sexual dysfunction,
stress, and financial issues [2]. Providing survivorship care, particularly education about healthy lifestyle
behaviours, allows for the individualization of the treatment delivery model to the specific needs of
individual patients while affording patients the resources needed to successfully transition to life post-
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treatment.

More and more people are living longer after a cancer diagnosis and treatment. The Canadian Cancer Society
reported that at the beginning of 2009, there were more than 800 000 Canadians who had had a cancer
diagnosis in the last 10 years [3]. Breast cancer makes up about 25% of all new cancer cases amongst
Canadian women and about 87% of breast cancer patients are expected to live at least five years post
diagnosis [4]. One in 8 Canadian women is expected to be diagnosed with breast cancer in their life [5]. As
the prevalence of cancer grows in Canada, so does the need to have a comprehensive survivorship strategy.

There is overwhelming evidence that the current state of survivorship care is falling short to meet the needs
of patients. In 2018, the Canadian Partnership Against Cancer (CPAC) published a report titled Living With
Cancer- a Report on the Patient Experience [6]. Presenting patients’ experiences with their cancer journey,
this report highlights many gaps in survivorship care across Canada. According to CPAC, about 67.7% of
patients face physical, emotional and practical challenges after treatment completion [6]. Most cancer
survivors need someone to talk to about concerns, and more information about how to address them [6].
Often, patients are not able to get help and if they do, 34% of them wait more than three months to receive it
[6]. Many times, information received is not useful [6]. Thus, it is evident that more comprehensive care is
required for cancer survivors and we must do better to serve Canadians. 

In 2006, the Institute of Medicine recommended that every cancer patient receive an individualized
survivorship care plan that includes guidelines for monitoring and maintaining their health [1]. Radiation
therapy is well-positioned to offer survivorship education to breast cancer patients since it is often the last
step in active treatment before patients are transitioned into the survivorship phase of their cancer journey
[7]. Additionally, radiation therapists see breast cancer patients everyday for 3-5 weeks and are able to build
good rapport based on trust and understanding. At our centre, a patient follow-up call is completed one-
week post-radiation treatment, and survivorship care has been anecdotally identified as a gap in care when
gathering feedback. Currently, there is no individual survivorship education provided to breast cancer
patients when completing radiation therapy treatment at our centre. This study reports the outcomes of a
pilot survivorship care program, designed to deliver a one on one education session on healthy lifestyle
behaviours and available resources to help patients transition to their post-treatment life, provided to
breast cancer patients completing radiation therapy. Program delivery format and content was evaluated for
effectiveness, applicability and feasibility. 

Materials And Methods
Program and material development
Considerations given to the survivorship program model included ease of implementation, integration into
current department workflow, and delivery of education session. Survivorship sessions were scheduled near
the completion of radiation treatment courses since this often marks the end of active treatment for breast
cancer. Survivorship education was also provided immediately after radiation therapy appointments to
prevent extra visits for patients.

The survivorship program was developed utilizing multi-disciplinary collaboration. Staff dieticians, social
workers, a nurse practitioner and two Radiation Oncologists were consulted regarding survivorship topics,
materials, and content. Survivorship topics and content was also based on recommendations and findings
from other published sources [1-2,8-14]. Additionally, the material was generalized to be applicable to all
breast cancer stages.

Materials developed for the study included a Microsoft PowerPoint presentation and an information
pamphlet (Appendix A). Material content covered exercise, nutrition, stress relief, smoking cessation,
changes to sexuality, available community resources, patient programs offered at our centre, and disease
surveillance post-treatment. Prior to implementation, the information pamphlet was reviewed by two
current breast cancer patients, the Regional Lead for Person-Centred Care and two Radiation Oncologists.

Implementation
Between March 2017 and August 2018, a convenience sample of 124 female breast cancer patients, treated
in the curative setting, nearing completion of their radiation treatments agreed to participate in this centre-
specific survivorship care program. Inclusion criteria were female breast cancer patients stages 0-III, within
two weeks of the end of radiation treatment. No exclusion criteria were utilized. 

The survivorship program entailed a one-on-one education session given to breast cancer patients within
the last two weeks of their radiation treatment. Sessions were approximately 20 minutes in length and were
provided by eight participating radiation therapists, each of whom was trained to deliver the sessions.
During each session, patients were presented with a Microsoft PowerPoint presentation and provided a
study-specific education pamphlet that summarized the material reviewed. After each session, participants
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were given an opportunity to ask any questions. Survivorship education sessions were delivered using two
workflows, conducted by either study staff or staff scheduled in our Pre-Radiotherapy Patient Assessment
role, which has been previously reported (Unpublished abstract: Smith S, Culhane J, Woo R. Implementation
of a Pre-radiation Therapy Patient Assessment Role at the Stronach Regional Cancer Centre (SRCC). 10th
Annual Radiation Therapy Conference; June 2014).

At the end of the education sessions, patients were given a study-specific evaluation form to complete and
submit to study staff. This form was developed based on a study published by Trask et al. and included
questions to evaluate the session content, delivery method, and participant experience [15]. Participants
were asked to rate how well the session met the objectives stated in the beginning, how comfortable they felt
incorporating what they learned in their everyday lives and if they learned any helpful tips with regards to
healthy living. Participants were also asked to evaluate the strengths/weaknesses of the survivorship session
and provide feedback for session improvement. Questions were a mix of close-ended questions with a Likert
scale for agreement/disagreement (1= Strongly Disagree, 5= Strongly Agree), as well as a number of open-
ended questions. See Appendix B for patient evaluation form. 

In addition, patients received a follow-up phone call 4-12 weeks post-session delivery to evaluate the
ongoing applicability of the survivorship education materials. If the participant was not able to be reached,
two attempts were made, two to four weeks apart. Patients were asked several pre-defined open-ended
questions, including whether they had made any changes to their lifestyle as a result of the survivorship
session, the most useful parts of the session, and the effectiveness of the session delivery method. 

Finally, the staff involved in the delivery of the education sessions was given a study-specific evaluation
form to complete. This evaluation assessed staff experience in regards to the session, how well the session
was received by patients, the workload associated with conducting the sessions, and the feasibility of
incorporating a survivorship education session into daily department workflow. Evaluation design was
similar to the patient evaluation form, consisting of close-ended questions with a Likert scale for
agreement/disagreement (1 = Strongly Disagree, 5 = Strongly Agree) and several open-ended questions
(Appendix C). 

After a discussion with the local Research Ethics Board (REB) this project was deemed to be a quality
improvement initiative to identify and meet an existing gap in care and an exemption from REB approval
was provided. All participants involved in the research gave verbal consent to participate. Study involvement
was voluntary, and participants were informed of the option to withdraw consent at any time.

Results
Overall, 124 patients, aged 32-87 with stage 0 to III breast cancer, participated in the study. There was a
response rate of 56% for the participant evaluation forms administered at the time of session delivery
(69/124). Four evaluation forms were incomplete when returned; however the completed responses were still
included in results. In addition, 56 follow up phones calls were completed 4-12 weeks after the completion
of treatment (45% response rate). One hundred percent of staff (8/8) completed staff evaluation forms at
study completion. 

Participant evaluation
Patients were asked if they learned helpful tips about each topic discussed during the survivorship session
and to rate each section using a 5-step Likert scale. See Figure 1 for results. Overall, results show that
participants learned helpful tips for making lifestyle changes, namely healthy eating, exercise, stress
management, and community resources that can be accessed. Eighty-five percent of participants
agreed/strongly agreed that they learned helpful tips regarding healthy eating, 83% for exercise, 93% for
stress relief, and 95% for community resources. In addition, 98% of participants surveyed felt the
information provided either confirmed what they were already doing (44%) or prompted them to make or
consider a change to their lifestyle (54%) (Figure 2). Participants were also asked if they faced any barriers to
making lifestyle changes. Many stated that there were no barriers and barriers that were identified include
stubbornness, old habits, willingness to change, and lack of time. Eighty-four percent of participants
agreed/strongly agreed that the information provided was applicable to them and 82% agreed/strongly
agreed that the learning method used was effective. Furthermore, 70% reported feeling more confident in
themselves since completing the educational activity.
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FIGURE 1: Survivorship education topics (n = 69)
Study participants were asked if they learned helpful tips about each of these topics: healthy eating, exercise,
stress relief, and community resources. 

FIGURE 2: Commitment to change (n = 69)
Participants were asked to rate their commitment to making lifestyle changes after receiving the survivorship
education. 

With regards to the open-ended questions, comments made regarding the survivorship program include “it
was an excellent transition,”, and “knowing support is available.” Participants commented that the most
useful part of the survivorship sessions was “learning how to improve my health and life” and the comfort of
knowing that “support programs, people, etc. are available to me.” One participant wrote that it was helpful
“knowing that what I already was doing was my best for my health.” They appreciated that the survivorship
sessions brought them “ease of mind with what to do after” and “the sense that you are still being thought
of and cared for.” Another commented that “the presentation and booklet are very helpful and very
encouraging. Thank you for the emotional support in addition to the treatments.” Many patients noted that
the survivorship sessions confirmed what they were already doing. “The meeting was useful/ helpful. I used
it as a reminder/reinforcement of how I already lead my life.” 

Follow-up calls
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Participants who completed the survivorship sessions received a follow-up phone call 4-12 weeks after
completion of treatment to determine the ongoing applicability of the survivorship sessions. At the end of
the phone call, participants were given an opportunity to bring forth any pending questions/concerns. Out of
the 124 patients involved in the study, 56 received follow-up calls. Several patients were unavailable or
unreachable when calls were placed. Overall, 26 of the 56 patients (46%) had made lifestyle changes since
completing the sessions. Most changes made included an improved diet and increased exercise (Figure 3).

FIGURE 3: Patient-reported lifestyle changes made after the completion
of survivorship sessions (n = 56)

Of those 30 patients (54%) who had not made changes, 21 patients stated it was because they were already
doing what was recommended. Other reasons for not making any changes included patient-specific factors,
such as too much pain or illness, being busy, or difficulties after returning to work. Three patients reported
that although they had not made any changes yet, they plan to make them in the future. See Figure 4 for the
results. 

FIGURE 4: Patient-reported reasons for not making any lifestyle
changes after attending the survivorship education session (n = 56)

In addition, patients were asked whether the format of the sessions was appropriate. Of the 56 participants
called, 54% preferred one-on-one sessions to group sessions, 23% stated either one-on-one or group
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sessions would be beneficial, and 18% stated they would have preferred group sessions. Finally, 98% of
patients stated that these sessions would be beneficial to others, with 2% stating they were not sure.

Staff evaluation
Of the eight staff involved in survivorship session delivery, 100% returned a staff evaluation form at study
completion. Of the evaluations provided by the eight participating staff, seven (87.5%) agreed/strongly
agreed that the sessions were useful to patients, and seven (87.5%) found value in continuing the education
sessions. In addition, five (62.5%) staff felt that the sessions were able to be completed in a timely manner.

Discussion
This study focused on one Regional Cancer Centre’s experience when incorporating survivorship care into
the breast cancer patient population. These sessions provided patients with an opportunity to learn about
how to better care for themselves going forward, ask any questions they may have, and feel more in control
of their new normal post-treatment. 

Results from this study pointed out in favour of incorporating survivorship care into the standard of practice
for breast cancer patients receiving radiation treatment. Participants responded well to the information
provided and generally felt more confident in their abilities to transition to a healthful life post treatment as
a result of these sessions. Being diagnosed and treated for cancer can leave one feeling hopeless and at a
loss of control over one’s own life [16]. These sessions allowed patients to regain some control over their
situation and provided them with the tools they needed to move forward in their cancer journey. 

Another study objective was to identify whether the delivery format utilized was most effective for patient
learning. It has been previously reported that one-on-one patient education is effective in improving the
quality of life for patients with heart failure [17]. Group education sessions have shown to have low
attendance due to factors such as additional travel to the clinic, convenience, work conflict, or anxiety due to
disease, treatment, or other factors [18]. In this study, most participants stated that the delivery method
utilized was an effective method for this type of information and that it is the delivery format of choice.
Many participants expressed that this format is more personable and gave them the opportunity to ask
questions they may not have been comfortable asking during a group session. Due to the “three methods of
learning for each session- see, listen, read”, participants noted that this format compelled them to be
attentive and ensure understanding of the content.

In addition, the results of this study show that survivorship education helped increase patient confidence in
themselves. At the time of session delivery, nearly all participants identified that they would consider
making lifestyle changes if they were not already following our recommendations. At the time of follow- up
calls one to three months after the completion of treatment, approximately half of participants had made
changes to their lifestyle. The majority of those who had not made changes were already practicing what was
recommended. These results are in line with statistics reported in the literature, namely that between 30%
and 60% of patients are expected to make lifestyle changes after cancer diagnosis [16,19]. 

Incorporating community resources into survivorship resources provides patients an opportunity to utilize
support programs available to them outside of the cancer centre. Chan et al. highlight the importance of
providing this opportunity considering many cancer patients try to avoid triggering negative memories of
their past cancer experience, and returning to the cancer centre can be one of them [20].

Interestingly, when asked if there were any barriers to making lifestyle changes, many participants stated
that there were no barriers. Barriers that were identified include stubbornness, old habits, willingness to
change and lack of time. At the start of the study, it was expected that socio-economic barriers, such as
access to healthy food or affordability of healthy food options/ exercise programs would play a bigger role
than was actually identified from study results, as these have been previously cited as challenging [21,22].

While staff survey results pointed strongly in favour of continuing with the survivorship sessions, it was
shown that the two methods of delivery trialed in this study were not feasible to be implemented on a larger
scale. Staff found that it was difficult incorporating these sessions into very busy, unpredictable schedules
and coordinating all of the survivorship sessions. Unstructured timing and scheduling of the sessions was
one of the challenges faced by staff when striving to complete them. In addition, a lack of staff, space and
time resources available proved to be a barrier for the trialed workflows. More detailed results on the staff
evaluation are discussed in an accompanying paper (Unpublished data: Malam S, Lawrence B, Bradley C, et
al. The Challenges with Implementing Survivorship Care into a Radiation Medicine Program: One Cancer
Centre’s Experience; 2019).

Study limitations
There were a number of limitations to this study. First, the pilot included only one format for education
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delivery. The feasibility and response to group sessions were not tested. Participant preference for delivery
format was partly based on perceptions of what they thought a group session would be like. In addition, not
all participants returned an evaluation form at session completion. Moreover, due to time and staffing
constraints, multiple attempts to reach participants over the phone were not viable in this study. Thus, we
cannot know if the results would have been altered if all participants in the study had provided feedback,
whether written or over the phone. The responses were also kept anonymous; therefore we cannot be certain
that 45% of participants who were reached in the follow-up phone calls were not fully encompassed in the
56% of participating survey respondents. Furthermore, any lifestyle changes made post-treatment may not
be directly due to the survivorship program and could be due to a multitude of other contributing factors.
Finally, there were some logistical limitations that may have affected the effectiveness of the study, such as
language barriers and scheduling conflicts among some participants. 

Future directions
Future directions for this study include implementing the survivorship program into the department. The
plan would be to initially target breast cancer patients completing radiation treatment, with the plan to
eventually roll out to all patients receiving dose radiation therapy with a curative intent. The information
pamphlet and presentation will require some revision, as current content is tailored specifically for breast
cancer patients. More general follow-up information will need to be adopted for other cancer sites.
Additionally, appropriate workflow will need to be identified in order to implement this program department
wide. This includes workflow processes for appointment scheduling, location, and staff scheduling in order
to accommodate all of the survivorship sessions. This initiative will also help the cancer centre collaborate
with community programs to help create a seamless transition of care back to the community. A follow-up
paper outlining further details of program implementation feasibility, challenges, and issues are currently in
development as well.

Conclusions
Post-treatment survivorship care is an integral component of cancer care for patients undergoing radiation
therapy. This study evaluated the applicability, effectiveness and feasibility of implementing a simple
survivorship program into one Regional Cancer Centre. Delivering one-on-one education sessions to
individual participants focusing on healthy lifestyle measures, garnered a positive response from
participants, increasing their confidence and knowledge for making lifestyle improvements. Survivorship
care has the ability to improve quality of life for patients post-treatment, which can lend itself to improved
outcomes and overall survival. It enables patients to feel empowered and feel more in control of their lives.
Having the ability to provide these sessions to patients completing their radiation therapy treatments proves
to be an important aspect of a patient’s treatment journey and allows them to embrace their new normal
after cancer. 

Appendices
Appendix A
Life After Treatment- Information Pamphlet

What now?

Congratulations!

You are completing your treatments!

As relieved and excited as you may be about finishing your treatments, you may also be feeling worried and
scared. Unexpected anxiety and uncertainty about the future is very common and perfectly normal when you
finish treatment. You are not alone.

The end of cancer treatment is often a time of transition. One of the most challenging things after treatment
is not knowing what happens next. It is also about finding your new normal.  

To help you with the next steps, we are providing you with information about life after treatment. We explain
how to care for yourself now that you are finished.

It is important to identify your needs and to think about the support you might need as a cancer survivor.
Whatever you identify your needs to be, give yourself time to adapt. Take it ONE DAY AT A TIME.

GOOD HABITS for HEALTH
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Nutrition

The fuel your body uses to fight disease is critical to your overall wellbeing. Choose your food wisely. 

Every bite matters!

The balance of evidence also suggests that a whole food, plant-based diet may help prevent, treat, slow, and
even reverse cancer progression. See Table 1 below for nutrition guidelines. 

Nutrition Guidelines

Focus on eating mostly plant foods in their whole unprocessed form (i.e vegetables, nuts, seeds, beans, sprouts, lentils, and fruit)

Limit or avoid red meat, processed meats, trans fats (ex. Doughnuts, fried fast food, cookies, pies, margarine)

Limit or avoid charred and high-salted foods

Eat healthy fats (i.e avocados, nuts, seeds, extra virgin olive oil) and AVOID flours and sugars

Consider fruits, legumes, whole grains, vegetables as carbohydrate sources

Drink 6-8 glasses of water per day (avoid juice and sodas)

Read labels and try to purchase foods with ingredients you know

Try to avoid foods with artificial colours/flavours/sweeteners (i.e aspartame, Splenda) and additives 

TABLE 1: Nutrition Guidelines

Exercise

Existing data strongly suggests that exercise is safe and doable during and after cancer treatment. It can also
improve physical functioning, fatigue, and many aspects of quality of life. Many studies have shown that
physically active cancer survivors have a lower risk of cancer recurrences and improved survival compared
with those who are not active.

Also, in cancer survivors, exercise has been shown to improve

·          heart health

·          muscle strength

·          body composition

·          fatigue

·          anxiety

·          depression

·          self-esteem

·          happiness

·          quality of life

The goal is to find a way to add some kind of movement into your daily routine. Some movement is much
better than no movement at all.

Examples of exercise can include walking, exercise bike, treadmill, household chores, yoga, and tai chi. See
Table 2 below for some exercise guidelines.
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Exercise Guidelines

Start SLOW

Try exercising during the time of day when you feel as though you have the most energy

Try to do some form of exercise every day

Vary activities to include strength, flexibility, and aerobic activities

Drink plenty of fluids prior to, during and after workouts

TABLE 2: Exercise Guidelines

Tips to stay motivated:

•      try to establish a routine

•      find someone who can participate with you

•      write out a plan of action

•      journal your activities and progress or make a chart

Talk with your doctor prior to starting any workout routine.

Stress relief

While some may think that chronic stress is just “part of life”, there’s strong evidence that shows we should
take it more seriously. Research shows that long periods of high stress is not good for your health. It
increases our chances of getting colds, slows wound healing, decreases immune function, and raises blood
pressure and cholesterol levels.

It is important to increase our stress awareness by paying attention to our symptoms. These can include
depression, stomach and/or chest pains, rapid heartbeat, and insomnia. Recognizing your stress levels can
help you be proactive towards finding ways to lower them. Some helpful ways to manage stress are listed in
Table 3 below. 
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Helpful Ways to Manage Stress

Get regular follow-up screening

Exercise regularly

Avoid smoking/tobacco

Eat a healthy diet

Have a good network of family and friends.  Talk to those in your support system of your concerns.

Meditation and/or prayer

Massage

Nature walks

Pets

Hobbies, music, reading

Distractions like comedy movies

TABLE 3: Helpful Ways to Manage Stress

The thought of cancer recurring may sometimes feel completely out of our control but all situations have
controllable and uncontrollable aspects. It’s true that to some extent, you have no control over whether or
not your cancer recurs, but you can have some control over the situation by managing your stress.

Gradually, this effort will help lower your stress levels. Most cancer survivors also report that the fear of
recurrence fades with time.

Smoking cessation

Tobacco smoke negatively hurts every part of the body. Even if someone else in your life smokes and not
you, the smoke still harms your body. If you do smoke, quitting is one of the best things you can do to for
your health. Even reducing the number of cigarettes you have each day is a great start. Although you are
finished your radiation treatments, it is never too late to quit. By quitting, you can lower your risk of things
like getting a new cancer or having your cancer come back.

If you are thinking of quitting, there are many programs and resources available to help. Ask any of your
health care practitioners for more information. For example, we can send a letter to your family doctor or
pharmacist to let them know that you would like more support to quit. We can also give you a list of
pharmacies in your area that offer quit counselling and support. If you are finished treatment and would still
like support, you can always talk to your family doctor or your local pharmacist. The Canadian Cancer
Society also offers a comprehensive counseling service to help you quit.

Canadian Cancer Society Smokers’ HelpLine

Phone: 1-877-513-5333

Website: smokershelpline.ca

Changes in sexuality

Cancer and its treatment may affect your sexual function and feelings. If you and/or your partner have any
questions or concerns, please speak to your Radiation Oncologist or Oncology Nurse.

Please visit the Patient and Family Resource Centre in the lobby of the Stronach Regional Cancer Centre for
additional information and resources related to your treatment.

Please refer to the Canadian Cancer Society Book: Cancer and Sexuality.
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A good online resource is Interventions to Address Sexual Problems in People with Cancer guideline at
www.cancercare.on.ca/psoguidelines

If you would like to read more guides on how to cope with side effects please refer to
www.cancercare.on.ca/symptoms

Support groups

Many cancer survivors find it very useful to attend support or wellness groups in their local communities
after finishing cancer treatments. Benefits can include reduced stress, improved recovery and an overall
better sense of wellbeing. There are a number of support groups available to you, both at the SRCC as well as
in your own communities. Below, you will find a few of the many resources that you can take advantage of.

Stronach Regional Cancer Centre

The Stronach Regional Cancer Centre runs a free cancer survivorship program called Pathways to Wellness.
The program consists of six two hour weekly sessions designed to provide education and strategies to
manage stress and anxiety, improve nutrition, maximize physical activity and manage health concerns after
a cancer diagnosis. For more information and to register contact Debbie Walsh 905 895-4521 ext. 6627.

Also, the Patient Resource Library on the Main Level in the Lobby can be very useful in providing you with
useful information. Here you will find a wide variety of educational materials which may be of great help to
you.

Canadian Cancer Society

The Canadian Cancer Society has a lot of information regarding local support groups/ programs throughout
the Greater Toronto Area. You can find local support groups/ programs by typing in your postal code here:
http://info.cancer.ca/CSD/searchCon.aspx?id=3172&Lang=E&sri=N.

Doane House Hospice

Doane House Hospice is located in Newmarket and runs a number of wellness groups for cancer survivors,
such as art therapy, caregiver support, and mind-body connection.

Phone: 905-967-0259

Website: http://www.doanehospice.org/

Email: info@doanehospice.org

Hospice King-Aurora

Hospice King-Aurora is located in Aurora and serves the Aurora, Richmond Hill and Markham areas. Free
programs available include yoga, meditation and Picking up the Pieces specifically for cancer survivors.

Phone: 905-727- 6815

Website: http://www.hospicekingaurora.com/

Email: admin@hospicekingaurora.ca

Disease surveillance

Surveillance after Breast Cancer

You will see your Radiation Oncologist for a Follow-up visit 4-6 weeks after finishing your radiation
treatment. After this, you will be followed by members of your Health Care Team. Typically, this can be a
family doctor, medical oncologist, or other medical practitioner.

Appendix B
Survivorship Post-Radiation Therapy: Patient Evaluation Form
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Please help us to improve this survivorship session by completing this evaluation form. Your help is greatly
appreciated as we work to improve the care we provide for our patients at the Stronach Regional Cancer
Centre.

1.      I learned helpful tips about

a.      Healthy eating.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

b.      Exercise.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

c.       Stress Relief.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

d.      Community Resources.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

2.      The information was applicable to me.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

3.      I am more confident in myself since completing this educational activity.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

4.      Commitment to change (select one):

a.       I will make changes as a result of this educational activity.

b.      I am considering a change.

c.       This educational activity confirms what I am already doing.

d.      I am not yet convinced that any change is needed.

e.       I feel there may be barriers for making changes.

 

5.      What information from this educational activity do you plan to use?

___________________________________________________________________

6.         What barriers are there to making changes?
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___________________________________________________________________

7.         This was an effective method to learn.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

8.         Please list what was most useful regarding the survivorship session.

___________________________________________________________________

9.         Please list any suggestions for improving the survivorship session. 

___________________________________________________________________

10.     Is there any more information that you would have liked to know about/ any additional comments.

___________________________________________________________________

Appendix C
Survivorship Post-Radiation Therapy: Staff Evaluation Form

Please help us to improve this survivorship session by completing this evaluation form. Your help is greatly
appreciated as we work to improve the care we provide for our patients at the Stronach Regional Cancer
Centre.

1.      I was able to complete the survivorship sessions in a timely manner.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

2. The survivorship sessions were easily incorporated within my schedule.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

3.  I feel as though the sessions were useful to the patients

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

4. I believe that there is value in continuing on with these sessions in the future.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

5. My workflow in PRPA was not negatively impacted by the sessions.

1                                     2                               3                                  4                               5

Strongly Disagree                   Neither Agree/ Disagree                                Strongly Agree

 

1.      What worked well in the trial of the survivorship session.
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___________________________________________________________________

2.      Please list any suggestions for improving the survivorship session or barriers in moving forward. 

___________________________________________________________________

3.      Do you see the survivorship sessions being feasible going forward on a larger scale (ie: all breast
patients/all patients)?

___________________________________________________________________

Additional Information
Disclosures
Human subjects: Consent was obtained by all participants in this study. Southlake Regional Health Centre
Research Ethics Board issued approval 0079-1718. The Southlake Regional Health Centre Research Ethics
Board (SRHC REB) acknowledges receipt of your documents related to the above study. It has been
determined by the REB Chair that this study does not constitute research involving humans as defined under
Article 2.5 of the Tri Council Policy Statement (TCPS2 2014) - Ethical Conduct for Research Involving
Humans, and therefore does not fall under the scope of REB review and approval, however regular
administrative and /or other approvals as required by SRHC policy/procedures should be sought as
appropriate. The SRHC Research Ethics Board is organized and operates in accordance with the Tri-Council
Policy Statement on Ethical Conduct of Research Involving Humans (TCPS2 2014); Canadian General
Standards Board (CGSB) 191.1-2013; Clinical Trials Ontario (CTO) REB Qualification Standards, the
International Conference on Harmonisation (ICH) Good Clinical Practice Guidelines (GCP); Part C, Division
5 of the Food and Drug Regulations of Canada; Part 4 of the Natural Health Product Regulations; Medical
Devices Regulations, and the provisions within the Ontario Personal Health Information Protection Act
(PHIPA) and all other applicable laws and regulations. The SRHC REB is registered with the U.S. Department
of Health and Human Services (DHHS) Office for Human Research Protection (OHRP). Animal subjects: All
authors have confirmed that this study did not involve animal subjects or tissue. Conflicts of interest: In
compliance with the ICMJE uniform disclosure form, all authors declare the following: Payment/services
info: All authors have declared that no financial support was received from any organization for the
submitted work. Financial relationships: All authors have declared that they have no financial
relationships at present or within the previous three years with any organizations that might have an
interest in the submitted work. Other relationships: All authors have declared that there are no other
relationships or activities that could appear to have influenced the submitted work.

References
1. Institute of Medicine: From Cancer Patient to Cancer Survivor- Lost in Transition. Hewitt M, Greenfield S,

Stovall E (ed): The National Academies Press, Washington, DC; 2006. 10.17226/11468
2. Cutshall SM, Cha SS, Ness SM, et al.: Symptom burden and integrative medicine in cancer survivorship .

Support Care Cancer. 2015, 23:2989-2994. 10.1007/s00520-015-2666-0
3. Canadian cancer statistics 2016 special topic: HPV-associated cancers . (2016). Accessed: January 8, 2019:

http://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer%20information/cancer%20101/Canadian%20cancer%20statistics/Canadian-
C....

4. Canadian cancer statistics: a 2018 special report on cancer incidence by stage . (2018). Accessed: January 24,
2019:
http://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer%20information/cancer%20101/Canadian%20cancer%20statistics/Canadian-
C....

5. Canadian cancer statistics 2019. (2019). Accessed: April 29, 2020:
https://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer%20information/cancer%20101/Canadian%20cancer%20statistics/Canadian-
....

6. Living with cancer: a report on the patient experience . (2018). Accessed: January 14, 2019:
https://s22457.pcdn.co/wp-content/uploads/2019/01/Living-with-cancer-report-patient-experience-
EN.pdf.

7. Breast. (2016). Accessed: April 30, 2020: http://www.bccancer.bc.ca/health-professionals/clinical-
resources/cancer-management-guidelines/breast/breast#6-1-Intr....

8. Being active. Accessed: January 16, 2019: https://www.cancer.ca/en/cancer-information/living-with-
cancer/feeling-your-best/being-active/?region=on.

9. Chlebowski RT, Aragaki AK, Anderson GL, et al.: Low-fat dietary pattern and breast cancer mortality in the
women’s health initiative randomized controlled trial. J Clin Oncol. 2017, 35:2919-2926.
10.1200/JCO.2016.72.0326

10. A national action plan for cancer survivorship: advancing public health strategies . (2004). Accessed: January
28, 2019: https://www.cdc.gov/cancer/survivors/pdf/plan.pdf.

11. Mina DS, Au D, Brunet J, et al.: Effects of the community-based Wellspring cancer exercise program on
functional and psychosocial outcomes in cancer survivors. Curr Oncol. 2017, 24:284-294.

12. Rock CL, Doyle C, Demark-Wahnefried W, et al.: Nutrition and physical activity guidelines for cancer

2020 Malam et al. Cureus 12(5): e8013. DOI 10.7759/cureus.8013 14 of 15

https://dx.doi.org/10.17226/11468
https://dx.doi.org/10.1007/s00520-015-2666-0
https://dx.doi.org/10.1007/s00520-015-2666-0
http://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer information/cancer 101/Canadian cancer statistics/Canadian-Cancer-Statistics-2016-EN.pdf?la=en
http://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer information/cancer 101/Canadian cancer statistics/Canadian-Cancer-Statistics-2016-EN.pdf?la=en
http://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer information/cancer 101/Canadian cancer statistics/Canadian-Cancer-Statistics-2018-EN.pdf?la=en
http://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer information/cancer 101/Canadian cancer statistics/Canadian-Cancer-Statistics-2018-EN.pdf?la=en
https://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer information/cancer 101/Canadian cancer statistics/Canadian-Cancer-Statistics-2019-EN.pdf?la=en
https://www.cancer.ca/~/media/cancer.ca/CW/cancer information/cancer 101/Canadian cancer statistics/Canadian-Cancer-Statistics-2019-EN.pdf?la=en
https://s22457.pcdn.co/wp-content/uploads/2019/01/Living-with-cancer-report-patient-experience-EN.pdf
https://s22457.pcdn.co/wp-content/uploads/2019/01/Living-with-cancer-report-patient-experience-EN.pdf
http://www.bccancer.bc.ca/health-professionals/clinical-resources/cancer-management-guidelines/breast/breast#6-1-Introduction
http://www.bccancer.bc.ca/health-professionals/clinical-resources/cancer-management-guidelines/breast/breast#6-1-Introduction
https://www.cancer.ca/en/cancer-information/living-with-cancer/feeling-your-best/being-active/?region=on
https://www.cancer.ca/en/cancer-information/living-with-cancer/feeling-your-best/being-active/?region=on
https://dx.doi.org/10.1200/JCO.2016.72.0326
https://dx.doi.org/10.1200/JCO.2016.72.0326
https://www.cdc.gov/cancer/survivors/pdf/plan.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/cancer/survivors/pdf/plan.pdf
https://scholar.google.com/scholar?q=intitle:Effects of the community-based Wellspring cancer exercise program on functional and psychosocial outcomes in cancer survivors
https://dx.doi.org/10.3322/caac.21142


survivors. CA Cancer J Clin. 2012, 62:242-274. 10.3322/caac.21142
13. Sagar SM, Lawenda BD: The role of integrative oncology in a tertiary prevention survivorship program . Prev

Med. 2009, 49:93-98. 10.1016/j.ypmed.2009.05.013
14. Schmitz KH, Courneya KS, Matthews C, et al.: American College of Sports Medicine roundtable on exercise

guidelines for cancer survivors. Med Sci Sports Exerc. 2010, 42:1409-1426. 10.1249/MSS.0b013e3181e0c112
15. Trask MA, Marchuk S, Rozon C, et al.: The evaluation of an orientation program of self-care abilities for

patients on hemodialysis. Nephrol Nurs J. 2016, 43:500-534.
16. Patterson RE, Neuhouser ML, Hedderson MM, Schwartz SM, Standish LJ, Bowen DJ: Changes in diet,

physical activity, and supplement use among adults diagnosed with cancer. J Am Diet Assoc. 2003, 103:323-
328. 10.1053/jada.2003.50045

17. Rice H, Say R, Betihavas V: The effect of nurse-led education on hospitalisation, readmission, quality of life
and cost in adults with heart failure. A systemic review. Patient Educ Couns. 2018, 101:363-374.
10.1016/j.pec.2017.10.002

18. Ebbert JA, Donovan KA, Lengacher CA, et al.: Right place, right time: preferences of women with ovarian
cancer for delivery of CAM education. Medicines . 2015, 2:236- 250. 10.3390/medicines2030236

19. Ghelfi F, Tieri M, Gori S, et al.: Do cancer patients change their diet in the e-health information era? A
review of the literature and a survey as a proposal for the Italian population. Food Res Int. 2018, 104:59-68.
10.1016/j.foodres.2017.10.021

20. Chan CMH, Ng CG, Taib NA, Wee LH, Krupat E, Meyer F: Course and predictors of post-traumatic stress
disorder in a cohort of psychologically distressed patients with cancer: a 4-year follow-up study. Cancer.
2017, 124:406-416. 10.1002/cncr.30980

21. Coa KI, Smith KC, Klassen AC, Thorpe Jr RJ, Caulfield LE: Exploring important influences on the
healthfulness of prostate cancer survivors’ diets. Qual Health Res. 2015, 25:857-870.
10.1177/1049732315580108

22. Cho D, Park CL: Barriers to physical activity and healthy diet among breast cancer survivors: a multilevel
perspective. Eur J Cancer Care (Engl). 2018, 27: 10.1111/ecc.12772

2020 Malam et al. Cureus 12(5): e8013. DOI 10.7759/cureus.8013 15 of 15

https://dx.doi.org/10.3322/caac.21142
https://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.ypmed.2009.05.013
https://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.ypmed.2009.05.013
https://dx.doi.org/10.1249/MSS.0b013e3181e0c112
https://dx.doi.org/10.1249/MSS.0b013e3181e0c112
https://scholar.google.com/scholar?q=intitle:The evaluation of an orientation program of self-care abilities for patients on hemodialysis
https://dx.doi.org/10.1053/jada.2003.50045
https://dx.doi.org/10.1053/jada.2003.50045
https://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.pec.2017.10.002
https://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.pec.2017.10.002
https://dx.doi.org/10.3390/medicines2030236
https://dx.doi.org/10.3390/medicines2030236
https://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.foodres.2017.10.021
https://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.foodres.2017.10.021
https://dx.doi.org/10.1002/cncr.30980
https://dx.doi.org/10.1002/cncr.30980
https://dx.doi.org/10.1177/1049732315580108
https://dx.doi.org/10.1177/1049732315580108
https://dx.doi.org/10.1111/ecc.12772
https://dx.doi.org/10.1111/ecc.12772

	Integrating Survivorship Care Into a Radiation Medicine Program
	Abstract
	Introduction
	Methods and materials
	Results
	Conclusions

	Introduction
	Materials And Methods
	Program and material development
	Implementation

	Results
	Participant evaluation
	FIGURE 1: Survivorship education topics (n = 69)
	FIGURE 2: Commitment to change (n = 69)

	Follow-up calls
	FIGURE 3: Patient-reported lifestyle changes made after the completion of survivorship sessions (n = 56)
	FIGURE 4: Patient-reported reasons for not making any lifestyle changes after attending the survivorship education session (n = 56)

	Staff evaluation

	Discussion
	Study limitations
	Future directions

	Conclusions
	Appendices
	Appendix A
	TABLE 1: Nutrition Guidelines
	TABLE 2: Exercise Guidelines
	TABLE 3: Helpful Ways to Manage Stress

	Appendix B
	Appendix C

	Additional Information
	Disclosures

	References


