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Introduction

Foreign body granuloma due to retained surgical sponge is 
also called gossypiboma or textiloma. The condition is usually 
in the field of thoracic or abdominal surgery.1 Reports on 
superficial sites, such as the extremities, the neck or as in our 
case, the breasts, are extremely rare. To our knowledge, only 
two cases of breast gossypiboma have been reported including 
the description of the mammographic and sonographic appear-
ance.2 Gossypiboma usually presents as a palpable mass in the 
breast, but we encountered a physically non-detectable gos-
sypiboma in the breast and the patient had a clinical manifes-
tation of septic shock. 

Case report

The 48-year-old woman came to our emergency department 
(ED) because of shortness of breath associated with con-
sciousness disturbance. Sixteen years ago, she had under-
gone modified radical mastectomy (MRM), chemotherapy, 
and radiotherapy due to right breast cancer. Eight years later, 
she received breast reconstruction. Before she came to ED, 
she had had a motorcycle accident and hurt her right arm 

3 days previously. At home, she had experienced dizziness, 
cold sweating, and shortness of breath. Also, she com-
plained about worsening of right anterior chest pain. At ED, 
her consciousness was disturbed and her initial vital signs 
were measured as follows: blood pressure: 74/46 mmHg, 
heart rate: 72/min, respiratory rate: 22/min, and body tem-
perature: 36.7°. Her laboratory data were reported as fol-
lows: white blood cell count: 17,100/μL and percentage of 
neutrophilic segments: 92.6%, and blood gas: pH: 7.41, 
pCO2: 38 mmHg, pO2: 62 mmHg, and HCO3

− : 24.1 mmol/L. 
Abdomen- and chest-computed tomography (CT) showed a 
57 mm mass lesion with abscess in the right axillary region 
(Figure 1), and percutaneous abscess drainage (PAD) was 
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performed at ED. Because of the low blood pressure, the 
diagnosis of septic shock was considered. After resuscita-
tion, she was sent to the medical intensive care unit (MICU) 
for further care. While there, she still had a fever. The report 
of bacterial culture and PAD culture was oxacillin-sensitive 
Staphylococcus aureus (OSSA). Oxacillin was used, and 
PAD was still turbid. In the upper-outer quadrant of her right 
breast was seen redness and swelling. Nine days later, we 
were consulted and then performed the fasciectomy and 
debridement for her right breast. We found a subcutaneous 
abscess over the right chest wall near the axillary, and a 
large amount of pus with granulation tissue material and a 
foreign body was suspected (Figure 2). After the operation, 
the wound received daily wet dressing for 14 days. When 
her wound had improved, we performed debridement and 
local flap for the defect reconstruction. Postoperative course 

was uneventful. After a 2-month follow-up, the appearance 
was acceptable.

Discussion

The retention of a postoperative foreign body, of which sur-
gical sponges are the most common, is a rare condition. A 
foreign body granuloma caused by a retained surgical sponge 
is called a gossypiboma, cottonballoma, textiloma, or 
gauzeoma. This condition is often in the field of thoracic or 
abdominal surgery. Reports on superficial sites such as the 
extremities, the neck or as is in our case, the breast, is 
extremely rare. To our knowledge, only two cases of gos-
sypiboma of the breast have been reported.2

The clinical presentation of gossypiboma is variable and 
depends on the location of the sponge and the time elapsed 
between operation and detection. Symptoms may appear in 
the postoperative period or even after weeks, months, or 
years. Common symptoms and signs of gossypiboma are 
pain, a palpable mass, abscess formation, and fistula forma-
tion.3 In our case, the symptoms were septic shock.

Two types of foreign body reactions occur in patients with 
retained sponges. The first type is an inflammatory reaction 
with the formation of an abscess that usually leads to early 
detection. The second type is an aseptic reaction to cotton 
material and development of a granuloma, which can lead to 
long asymptomatic periods.4

The diagnosis of gossypiboma is difficult to make defini-
tively because the clinical symptoms are nonspecific and the 
imaging findings are often inconclusive. Plain radiographs 
suggest the diagnosis if the surgical sponge is calcified or 
when a characteristic “whorl-like” pattern is present. 
Ultrasonography (US) images can be classified into two 
groups: solid and cystic. The most frequently described 
image is an echogenic area with an intense, sharply deline-
ated posterior acoustic shadow due to the highly reflective 
fiber texture of the surgical sponge. A less frequent finding is 
a well-delineated cystic mass with a hyperechoic spongiform 
internal structure.5 CT may show air trapped between surgi-
cal sponge fibers, or calcification of cavity walls and con-
trast-enhanced rims, which may not be distinguishable from 
other tumors or abscesses.6 Magnetic resonance imaging 
(MRI) is not recommended because the radiopaque markers 
on surgical gauze are not magnetic or paramagnetic and are 
therefore not visible.

In our case, the patient underwent previous breast surgery 
and a surgical sponge was retained at that time. This retained 
sponge created an aseptic reaction causing adhesion and 
encapsulation, as well as granuloma formation, which led to 
a long asymptomatic period. Eight years later, she was 
involved in a traffic accident and had right chest contusion. 
This attack caused the aseptic encapsulation of granuloma of 
the right axillary region rupture and become inflammed. 
Cytokines were released from neighboring cells and drew 
large numbers of white blood cells to the area. Pus formed 

Figure 1. CT (left picture) showed a mass lesion with abscess 
in the right axillary region, and this was compared with plain 
radiograph. An incorporated radiopaque marker could be found 
(right picture, arrow).

Figure 2. Left picture: foreign body granuloma-like retained 
surgical sponge was noted in the operation. Right picture: Gauze 
removed from the wound.
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due to the infectious process; therefore, she presented a clini-
cal manifestation of septic shock.

A local abscess with infection was first suspected based 
on the patient’s symptoms. PAD was performed for treat-
ment. As the patient’s condition did not improve, a gossypi-
boma would have been considered subsequently when we 
reviewed her radiograph and CT. A characteristic radiopaque 
marker of a “whorl-like” pattern was seen from the patient’s 
plain radiograph and CT. Besides, CT also showed air 
trapped between surgical sponge fibers.

Conclusion

Gossypibomas are uncommon, mostly asymptomatic, and 
difficult to diagnose. Gossypiboma should be included in the 
differential diagnosis of a mass in the breast and in patients 
with previous history of breast surgery. Besides, systemic 
symptoms like septic shock may occur. More importantly, 
when abnormal findings are noted on previous radiographs, 
more attention should be drawn to the phenomenon to assist 
the interpretation.
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