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CURRENT STATE OF THE PROBLEM:  
WHERE WE ARE NOW

Oral management is an important, yet often neglected, 
part of rehabilitation medicine. Oral problems and poor oral 
health affect the decline in oral function resulting from aging 
and disease, lifestyle-related oral diseases, and frailty.1) Fur-
thermore, the quality of life related to oral hygiene among 
nursing home residents in Germany was found to be signifi-
cantly impaired.2) In recent years, as interest in oral manage-
ment as part of rehabilitation has increased, new concepts, 
such as oral frailty,3) oral sarcopenia,4) and hospital-related 
oral problems,5) have been proposed.

Oral health problems are frequently observed in rehabilita-
tion practice. Poor oral health is common among hospital-
ized patients, especially in malnourished older adults and in 
those with physical disabilities or cognitive impairment.6,7) 
More than 80% of hospitalized older patients experience 
oral hygiene problems.6,7) Furthermore, 71% of hospitalized 
rehabilitation patients and 91% of hospitalized acute care 
patients have impaired oral hygiene.1) The deterioration of 
oral health status in hospitalized older patients can be at-
tributed to a variety of factors, including age, physical de-
pendence, cognitive decline, malnutrition, sarcopenia, and 
multimorbidities.1) Another important factor is the lack of 
both knowledge and interest in oral health problems among 
healthcare professionals.

Oral problems have a negative impact on rehabilitation 
outcomes. Among inpatients undergoing convalescent re-
habilitation, oral problems were independently associated 
with activities of daily living (ADLs), length of stay, home 
discharge, and in-hospital mortality after adjusting for age, 

sex, disease severity, nutritional status, comorbidities, and 
physical and cognitive dependence.6,7) Therefore, early de-
tection of oral problems, treatment by dental professionals, 
education on oral management for non-dental professionals 
such as nurses and other medical staff, multidisciplinary oral 
rehabilitation, and medical and dental collaboration are es-
sential.

DIRECTION TO AIM FOR:  
WHERE WE SHOULD GO

Because of the frequent occurrence of oral problems and 
their negative impact on health outcomes, oral management 
is crucial in the daily clinical practice of rehabilitation medi-
cine. Furthermore, oral management is especially important 
in convalescent rehabilitation wards to increase physical 
independence and to facilitate discharge home. This applies 
particularly to patients post-stroke or post-hip fracture, the 
number of which is increasing with the aging population. 
Multidisciplinary oral management in convalescent reha-
bilitation wards should include oral rehabilitation, oral care, 
oral health promotion and education, medical and dental 
collaboration, and the assignment of a dental hygienist (DH) 
to the ward.

Oral rehabilitation is the rehabilitation of oral function and 
has been shown to improve quality of life.8) Oral exercise 
programs that focus on strengthening chewing, saliva-
tion, and swallowing effectively improve oral function.9) 
Prosthetic rehabilitation improves oral health-related qual-
ity of life, oral–facial esthetics, and masticatory function.10) 
Moreover, oral function training combined with nutritional 
supplements improves the nutritional status of malnourished 
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older patients in nursing homes.11) Resistance training of the 
tongue improves tongue pressure and swallowing function in 
patients after stroke.9) Other exercises such as jaw opening, 
self-training of oral function, and Shaker exercises improve 
swallowing function and reduce aspiration pneumonia.1) Oral 
health promotion and education have a beneficial impact on 
patients with oral problems. A 3-month oral function pro-
motion program improved oral function and oral hygiene-
related quality of life in older adults.12)

Medical and dental collaboration is important for reha-
bilitation. Perioperative oral function management by dental 
staff can reduce the risk of postoperative pneumonia and is 
covered by health insurance in Japan. Collaboration between 
dentists and non-dental healthcare providers may improve 
oral health outcomes for people with limited access to oral 
healthcare services. Convalescent rehabilitation wards 
generally do not include full-time dentists, but it is pos-
sible to work with local dental associations to have dentists 
dispatched from nearby dental clinics to provide inpatient 
oral management. However, in rehabilitation medicine, there 
is insufficient knowledge and interest in medical–dental 
collaboration and oral health management. Dentists tend to 
focus on the diagnosis and treatment of oral diseases and 

overlook general health issues. Correspondingly, physicians, 
nurses, and rehabilitation therapists tend not to address the 
oral health problems of their patients. Therefore, there is an 
urgent need to educate rehabilitation medical professionals 
on the importance of oral health care.

HOW TO GET THERE: THE EXPECTED  
ROLE OF DENTAL HYGIENISTS IN  

CONVALESCENT REHABILITATION

Given the increasing need for oral health management in 
rehabilitation medicine, it is important for DHs to be actively 
involved in convalescent rehabilitation. DHs are qualified 
oral healthcare professionals and play a central role in re-
habilitation collaboration. The roles of DHs in convalescent 
rehabilitation include screening and assessment of oral 
health and function; provision of oral health care; oral and 
swallowing rehabilitation; treatment in inter-professional 
collaboration; and patient, family, and staff education and 
counseling (Fig. 1).1) According to a recent study published 
in Japan on patients in convalescent rehabilitation wards, 
oral health care by DHs improves not only oral status, swal-
lowing function, and nutritional status but also ADLs, home 
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Fig. 1.  Dental hygienist-centered multidisciplinary oral management and the expected outcomes for 
patients with oral frailty, oral sarcopenia, and oral problems.



Copyright © 2022 The Japanese Association of Rehabilitation Medicine

discharge rates, and in-hospital mortality.13,14) Furthermore, 
in stroke patients with oral problems at the time of admis-
sion, improvement of oral problems during hospitalization 
in convalescent rehabilitation wards was independently and 
positively associated with improvement in ADLs and dys-
phagia.15)

Based on these findings, early detection of oral problems, 
early oral hygiene management by dentists and DHs, and 
medical and dental cooperation are necessary for convales-
cent rehabilitation. Therefore, DHs are essential for promot-
ing oral health management in convalescent rehabilitation 
wards through multidisciplinary cooperation. However, at 
present, there is no reimbursement for the assignment of 
DHs to convalescent rehabilitation wards in Japan. We hope 
that, in the future, reimbursement for the assignment of DHs 
to these wards will improve the quality of multidisciplinary 
oral management in convalescent rehabilitation, which will 
surely contribute to maximizing the improvement of patient 
outcomes.
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