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Background:
The COVID-19 pandemic is a calamity affecting many aspects.
In particular healthcare services (HCS) are facing a great stress-
test worldwide. The present work aims to explore what were
health needs, beyond COVID, not covered among Italian
citizens, due to fear, lockdown measures and overload of HCS,
also in order to understand if there are specific subgroups of
populations that will need urgent access to health services in
the next future.
Methods:
COCOS (COvid COllateral impactS) is a cross-sectional study
performed during the Italian lockdown between April and May
2020. A forty-nine items online questionnaire was filled by the
respondents. Participation was voluntary and without com-
pensation. Informed consents were obtained. Descriptive,
univariable and multivariable (logistic regression models)
analyses were performed: results are expressed in ORs.
Results:
Totally, 1,515 questionnaires were collected. Median age was
42 years, 65.6% were females. Around 22% declared to suffer
from chronic diseases. Interestingly, 32.4% of the sample faced
a delay of a scheduled Medical Service (MS) by provider
decision, while 25.6% reported that this issue hit a family
member. More than 13% refused to access scheduled MS for
the fear of contagion, and the 6.5% avoided HCS even if
having an acute onset issue: this behavior was associated with
scarce trust in physicians (AdjOR 0.75); alarmingly, 1.5%
avoided Emergency Department when in need and 5% of the
sample took medications without consulting any physician:
patients suffering from chronic conditions resulted to be more
prone to self-medication (AdjOR: 2.16; 95% C.I.: 1.16-4.02).
Conclusions:
COVID-19 immediate effects are just the tip of the iceberg.
Large groups of population suffered delays and interruptions
of medical services, and the most vulnerable were the most
affected. To estimate the effects of the pandemic on non-
COVID-19 patients is required, leading to aimed efforts, to
reduce the backlog that HCS incurred in.
Key messages:
� COVID-19 biggest toll on public health is still to come if not

prevented, due to temporary but widespread suspensions of
scheduled medical services and the avoidance of these for
fear of contagion.
� The most in need are the most vulnerable: older patients and

those with chronic conditions are the most affected by
suspension of medical services and will potentially pay the
greatest cost.
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Background:
Several countries facing the COVID-19 pandemic were not
prepared to manage it. Public health mitigation strategies,
ranging from isolation of infected cases to implementation of
national lockdowns, proved their effectiveness for the out-
breaks control. However, the adjustment of public health
measures is crucial during transition phases to avoid new
outbreaks. To address the need for designing evidence-based
strategies, we performed a systematic review, identifying

healthcare systems approaches, experiences and recommenda-
tions used to manage COVID-19 and other epidemics.
Methods:
PubMed, Web of Science, Scopus and Cochrane were searched
to retrieve eligible studies of any study design, published in
English until April 17th, 2020. Double-blinded screening
process was conducted by titles/abstracts and subsequently
eligible full-texts were read and pertinent data were extracted.
We performed a narrative analysis of each implemented
strategy.
Results:
We included a total of 24 articles addressing the public health
strategies implemented for respiratory viral infections out-
breaks as COVID-19, influenza A H1N1, MERS and SARS. The
identified strategies are ascribable to two main categories:
healthcare systems management at a national level and
healthcare providers strategies at a local level. The key
components of the transition strategies regarded the imple-
mentation of evidence-based contextual policies, intrahospital
management approaches, community healthcare facilities,
non-pharmaceutical interventions, enhanced surveillance,
workplace preventive measures, mental health interventions
and communication plans.
Conclusions:
The identified healthcare systems strategies applied worldwide
to face epidemics or pandemics, are a useful knowledge base to
inform decision-makers about control measures to be used in
the transition phases of COVID-19 and beyond.
Key messages:
� Healthcare systems strategies that can be implemented to

manage pandemics/epidemics transition phases are a useful
knowledge base to inform policy makers about the most
effective solutions to adopt.
� The evidence reporting the healthcare systems management

of respiratory viruses epidemics/pandemics, show the lack of
a common and shared approach and more evidence-based
research is needed.
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Issue:
Early epidemiology established higher risk of morbidity &
mortality amongst infected older individuals or those having
specific chronic diseases, consuming most hospital care. Also
where demand exceeding supply of healthcare, mortality was
very high. As an island nation with one central main hospital,
not overwhelming the healthcare system whilst avoiding total
lockdown was key.
Description:
On the 27-03-2020, the Superintendent of Public Health
enacted the Protection of Vulnerable Persons Order, specifying
that these categories (or subcategories thereof) of persons are
to be granted vulnerable status: age >65; pregnant; persons
suffering from diabetes; immunosuppressed; cancer; end stage
renal failure; respiratory disease; cardiac disease; heart failure.
Such persons were entitled to stay at home, to be granted
special leave from work, entitled to a monthly allowance by
social services. One could go out only to attend to essential or
urgent personal matters, e.g. groceries, medicines, medical
needs, bank etc. with mitigation measures. Exemptions were
only granted to special categories such as healthcare workers,
farmers, or headship positions. In addition, the carers & staff
of most nursing homes voluntarily decided to isolate
themselves inside the homes for periods of 2/3 weeks.
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