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Background
Cancer is often diagnosed at an advanced stage of 
evolution, causing people to require a highly com-
plex approach with qualified and specialized care 
as they have a high prevalence of pain and symp-
toms that are difficult to control, such as fatigue, 
dyspnea, anxiety, and depression.1,2

According to the International Association for the 
Study of Pain, pain is ‘an unpleasant sensory and 
emotional experience associated with actual or 
potential tissue damage’.3 It is a personal experi-
ence influenced by the biological, psychological, 

and social factors of the sick person and by their 
life experiences.

Pain associated with advanced oncologic disease 
occurs in 70–90% of cases, at several stages of the 
disease. It is one of the most frequent reasons for 
a patient’s disability and distress. It leads to a loss 
of quality of life and a perspective of finitude, 
requiring an interdisciplinary approach with qual-
ified and specialized care.4–6

When it is not alleviated, pain can generate physi-
cal, emotional, social, and spiritual symptoms; 
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harm cognitive functions, activities of daily living 
and sleep; and cause overall distress, defined by 
Cicely Saunders as ‘total pain’, which is the cen-
tral theme of the literature review below.7,8

Methods
This is an integrative literature review that syn-
thesizes results of studies on pain related to can-
cer, using primary methods of experimental and 
non-experimental research.9

The review was based on the steps and processes 
reported by the PRISMA standards for system-
atic reviews.10 The authors followed these steps: 
selection of the guiding question; definition of eli-
gibility criteria; definition of relevant information 
from the studies; evaluation of findings; interpre-
tation; and synthesis of the information found.11

The Patient, Intervention, Context (PICo) research 
strategy was used to guide the development of the 
investigation question and definition of criteria of 
inclusion and exclusion,12 with the following guid-
ing question: ‘What is the evidence available in the 
literature that addresses the evaluation of pain/total 
pain and the symptoms of patients with advanced 
cancer and/or in palliative treatment?’

The collection of material was performed through 
consultations on the electronic databases 
PubMed, Embase, Cinahl, Lilacs, and Web of 
Science. The electronic search strategy used a 
combination of search terms involving the 
descriptors or keywords ‘Total Pain’, ‘Cancer 
Pain’, ‘Pain’, ‘Symptom Assessment’, ‘Pain 
Measurement’, ‘Pain Evaluation’, ‘Neoplasms’, 
‘Cancer’, ‘Tumor’, ‘Palliative Care’, ‘Hospice Care’, 
and ‘Terminal Care’, which were combined 
through Boolean connectors ‘OR’ and ‘AND’.

The previously defined inclusion criteria were pri-
mary studies indexed in the databases, conducted 
with human beings aged 18 or older, whose main 
proposal was the assessment and management of 
pain or total pain and the symptoms of cancer 
patients. The authors excluded studies relating to 
surgical procedures and/or pharmacological treat-
ments (even with a palliative intent), studies of sec-
ondary source, theses, letters, and editorials.

The reference manager Mendeley was used to 
organize the imported studies and to exclude 
duplicates, and the application Rayyan™ – soft-
ware developed by the Qatar Computing Research 

Institute – was employed for the careful selection 
and inclusion of studies in the final sample.13 
Two reviewers participated in the selection pro-
cess of the sample in an independent and blind 
way, and performed the initial screening of arti-
cles using the title and abstract. All potentially 
relevant studies were read in full and evaluated 
independently by a third reviewer, and diver-
gences were solved through discussion and con-
sensus among evaluators.

Next, the authors proceeded with the extraction 
and synthesis of data from the selected articles 
using an instrument of evaluation,11 covering the 
following domains: title; authors’ names; year of 
publication; the publishing journal and its impact 
factor; the objective of the study; the methodo-
logical procedure; the main outcomes; and the 
level of evidence.

For the methodological evaluation, a hierarchical 
classification of levels of evidence was used.14 
According to this classification, Levels I and II 
indicated strong evidence (Level I was composed 
of systematic reviews or meta-analysis of relevant 
controlled randomized clinical trials, and Level II 
was composed of well-designed controlled rand-
omized clinical trials); Levels III–V indicated 
moderate evidence (Level III was composed of 
clinical trials with no randomization, Level IV 
was composed of cohort or case-control studies, 
and Level V involved systematic reviews of quali-
tative descriptive studies); and Levels VI and VII 
indicated insufficient evidence (Level VI was 
composed of qualitative or descriptive studies and 
Level VII was composed of authorities’ opinions 
and/or reports of specialist committees).

A qualitative synthesis of the data was performed 
(as shown below), which demonstrated that most 
of the evaluated studies had a mixed nature and 
that there were significant methodological differ-
ences between them.

Results
We identified 2745 articles through consulta-
tion of the five electronic databases mentioned 
above, of which 472 were excluded because of 
duplicates, 2235 were excluded for not meet-
ing pre-established inclusion criteria, and 
another 16 studies were excluded after full 
reading. Therefore, 21 articles were included 
in the final sample of this review, as demon-
strated in Figure 1.
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As a result of the process of content analysis, the 
21 selected studies were categorized into two the-
matic units (Tables 1 and 2):

•• Unit 1: The multidimensionality of pain in 
cancer (N = 13)

•• Unit 2: Overall evaluation and manage-
ment of pain by the multidisciplinary team 
(N = 8)

Unit 1: the multidimensionality of pain  
in cancer (N = 13)
Advanced stage cancer is associated with a decline 
in the person’s health status. It may cause pain of 
varying nature, degree, and intensity, in addition 
to complex physical and psychosocial concerns, 
which should be comprehensively evaluated. 
Psychological distress, when not properly identi-
fied and treated, may lead to severe consequences, 
such as depression, hopelessness, and a decrease 
in cognitive function.

The coexistence of physical, psychological, and 
cognitive problems faced by oncologic patients 
with pain must be globally assessed and may 
require therapeutic interventions for mood disor-
ders, cognitive difficulties, and pain. This evalua-
tion engages professionals in the search of an 
optimized way of looking at the complexity of 

pain through specific combinations of pharmaco-
logical options and other therapeutic options.16,17

Distinct patterns of pain can be observed in the 
reports of interviewed patients in terms of com-
plexity, severity, transience, and degree of control 
noticed about pain, emphasizing that the experi-
ence of pain is not static but dynamic, and related 
to the progression of disease, to the impact of 
treatments to prolong life and to the beliefs and 
previous experiences of patients and their 
caregivers.17

The prevalence of pain may be strongly and inde-
pendently associated with emotional distress, 
becoming a complex experience and difficult to 
control. Pain is seen by patients as unbearable 
and a cause of suffering in their lives because it 
makes them sadder and more desperate, causing 
distress, anguish, and concern.18,19

Although the control of symptoms is a common 
focus of palliative care in most settings, mental 
health has only recently gained the same impor-
tance. Since every person has their own way of 
getting back to normal life or coming closer to 
death, their problems and anxieties, feelings, and 
desires require a unified and unique intervention 
aimed at relieving the suffering of both patients 
with active cancer and cancer survivors.16,18 Being 

Records identified through research on databases: 
     N = 2745
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Figure 1.  Search mechanism of the integrative review, from PRISMA FlowDiagram15 (Brazil, 2021).
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able to identify the occurrence and prevalence of 
end-of-life needs based on the patient is key to 
offering ideal palliative care.

Pain and symptoms may confound treatment and 
interfere with a patient’s general quality of life and 
their emotional, spiritual, and social issues.20–22 
There is a relationship between psychological pain 
and the mechanisms of spiritual coping. A study 
has shown that hope is more closely related to the 
psychosocial elements of the experience of pain 
than to the intensity of pain. Patients may keep a 
sensation of hope even when pain and other symp-
toms of cancer progress according to their affec-
tive-cognitive, psychosocial, and spiritual 
resources and their resilience.23,24

The needs and social relationships are more 
important for patients than physiological needs, 
which supports the ‘feeling of belonging’ as a pri-
mary human need, the importance of which might 
increase closer to death.20 In terms of social dis-
tress, a study carried out in Japan showed that 
there were differences between men and women; 
while women were more likely to suffer from psy-
chosocial issues, such as changes in appearance, 
family problems, and sexual matters, men pre-
sented greater spiritual pain as a feeling of use-
lessness, loneliness, and hopelessness.25

Social pain is often related to practical issues of 
everyday life. Financial difficulties relating to 
social issues are mainly identified in studies per-
formed in countries where there are difficulties in 
accessing free public healthcare. They are associ-
ated with worse physical, psychological, social, 
and spiritual results and less quality of coordina-
tion and capacity of response to healthcare (that 
is to say, greater pain and total suffering), as well 
as less meaning, less peace, and lower levels of 
hope. Interventions to relieve financial problems 
can help reduce the levels of the general problems 
of patients.26,27

One of the reasons why the pain of cancer patients 
is not well controlled may be the fact that physi-
cians are not aware of their patients’ pain. Many 
medical oncologists do not ask their patients rou-
tinely about pain, and the evaluation of pain is 
rarely mentioned in medical records.18 Patients 
use their own vocabulary to communicate their 
needs at end of life; however, there are few scripts 
for family conversations that allow people with 
terminal diseases to express clearly what they are 
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experiencing and what their needs or worries are, 
limiting the delivery of ideal palliative care.20

Therefore, the findings of this review validate the 
importance of palliative care in the management 
of patients’ pain, distress, and quality of life. 
Human suffering because of pain and advanced 
oncologic disease are characterized by separation 
distress, fatigue, sadness, fear of suffering, feel-
ings of uselessness, fear of pain, and insomnia.28

The studies of this unit restate the importance of 
a global view of pain and symptoms, totally vali-
dating the distress of patients in physical, spirit-
ual, social, and emotional dimensions, with the 
need for individualized and humanized care pro-
vided by a team trained to deal with the total pain 
of oncologic patients.

Unit 2: overall evaluation and management of 
pain by the multidisciplinary team (N = 8)
To alleviate the pain, it must be well evaluated. 
Pain in cancer is subjective; it can be acute or 
chronic and, when it persists, it may indicate dis-
ease progression. Unassessed pain cannot be 
treated. Given the difficulties in understanding 
and describing it and its subjectivity, it is often 
underdiagnosed and undertreated, contributing 
to the loss of quality of life of the affected 
person.

Pain and symptoms must be evaluated according 
to the characteristics of each patient, and such 
information must be recorded and available to all 
team members. Healthcare providers must be 
alert to patients’ symptoms and pain, taking a 
holistic view that goes beyond drug treatment.29

Evaluating pain is a difficult task that is often not 
performed because of lack of knowledge by the 
team or because of its complexity. Inappropriate 
evaluation and insufficient knowledge among 
physicians of the management of pain and the 
prescription of opiates have been major barriers 
to the effective treatment of pain in cancer. 
Recognizing this difficulty and conducting a com-
prehensive and multidimensional evaluation by 
the interdisciplinary team may contribute to opti-
mize the management of pain and relieve the pain 
of cancer patients.30,31

Some studies analyzed in this review used multi-
dimensional instruments aiming at a more com-
plete evaluation, for example, the Brief Pain 

Inventory, the Palliative Outcome Scale (POS2), 
and the Edmonton Symptom Assessment System 
(ESAS), together with semi-structured interviews 
and unidimensional instruments, such as the 
Visual Analog Scale (VAS). Despite the low level 
of evidence of these qualitative studies (such as 
those involving case reports), they have been 
included in this review because they revealed 
important aspects for reflection about patients’ 
total pain.

The awareness that the expression of pain in can-
cer may affect other dimensions (including emo-
tional, cognitive and social dimensions) reveals 
new possibilities of management to professionals, 
preventing unnecessary procedures and promot-
ing a more careful screening for treatment.30–32

A multiprofessional team is necessary for the 
management of pain. A multidisciplinary 
approach can alleviate severe pain effectively, 
providing multimodal treatment, detecting and 
managing the side effects of treatment, and 
addressing underlying psychosocial distress.

Three case studies of patients with cancer pre-
senting pain and distress, and who were treated 
with multidisciplinary approach, were reported 
by Mori et al.33 In all three cases, support coun-
seling was offered by the members of the pallia-
tive care team with the aim of allowing patients 
and their families to express their emotional dis-
tress in order to reduce the expression of symp-
toms and to help them differentiate their 
experiences from pain and suffering. Another 
case study reported that a patient with complex 
oncologic pain, refractory to therapy with oral 
and intrathecal opioids, got better after the inter-
disciplinary intervention of palliative care.34 His 
daily equivalent dose of morphine decreased by 
94% over a period of 10 days, and he had better 
control of pain and function. These authors high-
light the importance of addressing and treating 
psychosocial distress that contributes to the 
expression of total pain.

As seen before, psychological and social factors 
and family suffering may contribute to the 
increase of pain. A patient’s personal beliefs in 
relation to analgesics may also influence the man-
agement of pain, particularly when it comes to 
adherence to medication. Lin et al.30 showed that 
approximately two-thirds of patients expressed 
apprehension about treatment with opioids, 
including the fear of dependence and side effects.
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Ineffective communication between physician and 
patient may be a barrier to effective pain manage-
ment and may lead to a patient’s low satisfaction, 
causing feelings of anxiety, frustration, helpless-
ness, and anger. Collaborative communication, 
however, and information sharing and regular 
screening of a patient’s psychosocial and spiritual 
needs provided by the multidisciplinary team can 
help patients and their family increase satisfaction 
and efficacy in the control of pain.30,31,35

Advanced cancer patients are polysymptomatic 
and need a specialized team and a holistic 
approach to help them with the complex load of 
symptoms. Specific clinical interventions for 
patients with cancer at the end-of-life stage are 
needed as they come closer to death. In addition 
to complementary and integrative interventions 
that can be experimented with as effective tools in 
patients suffering a lot from their symptoms, it is 
possible to offer benefits without presenting any 
conceivable damage.31,36

Discussion
The present review had as its central theme the 
need to present an overview of scientific produc-
tion referring to the evaluation of total pain in 
cancer, the data of which have been synthesized 
in Tables 1 and 2.

In terms of the study characteristics, seven were 
published in journals in the field of palliative care, 
five in the field of pain and symptoms, four in the 
field of oncology, three in the multidisciplinary 
field, and two in the field of nursing. Regarding 
where they were published, seven were published 
in the United States, one in Canada, two in the 
United Kingdom, one in Australia, one in Brazil, 
one in Chile, one in Greece, one in India, one in 
Japan, one in Malaysia, one in Singapore, one in 
Sweden, one in Taiwan, and one in Turkey. The 
period of publication of the selected articles com-
prised the years 2002–2020.

In relation to methodological designs, there were 
11 observational studies (eight cross-sectional, 
two retrospective, and one cohort); nine descrip-
tive studies (four case studies, two qualitative, 
two descriptive, and one multicentric); and one 
study of mixed methods.

The levels of evidence of the selected studies var-
ied between Level IV and Level VI, classified as 
moderate and insufficient according to Melnyk 

and Fineout-Overholt,14 and the mean of the 
impact factors of the journals where the studies 
were published was 3.019. This information 
demonstrates the need for studies based on more 
stringent methods.

In summary, the included research studies 
showed methodological limitations, such as a 
small casuistic, lack of blinding and randomiza-
tion. The studies did not offer research questions 
that justified or guided the methodology and pro-
vided few explanations of the processes and steps 
they followed to ensure results were reliable.

The main outcomes of this review evidenced the 
scarcity of research on the theme of total pain and 
reinforced the importance of evaluating pain in a 
global way from a perspective of integrality, 
together with an interdisciplinary team, especially 
in patients in oncologic palliative care. They indi-
cated the importance of looking at the multidi-
mensionality of pain and signaled the need to 
expand interventions to other patients with inter-
ventions based on the concept of total pain. They 
also pointed to the need for the development of 
further research with more methodological rigor 
on the care of oncologic patients in palliative care.

The contents suggested that the process of illness 
in general comes with pain, whether physical, 
emotional, social, or spiritual. The intensity of this 
pain varies from person to person and depends on 
several factors: sex, age, ethnicity, culture, and 
social support, and not only on the type of nocic-
eptive stimulus. The painful experience is indi-
vidual and unique for the person who feels it and 
is intrinsically related to conceptions of pain and 
its management acquired through past experience 
in society and modified by the previous knowledge 
of existing or presumed damage.3,37

The pain of people with cancer may have numer-
ous causes relating to primary tumors, metastasis, 
treatment, or even concomitant disorders.38 The 
pain of people with cancer has multiple dimen-
sions. In addition to physical distress, psychologi-
cal, social, and spiritual factors and family suffering 
may be related to the increase of pain, such as 
anguish and the uncertainty of a cure; the fear of 
treatment, hospitalization, or death; and difficul-
ties bonding with the health team.30 All these 
things affect quality of life and social interactions.

In this regard, to be effectively controlled, pain 
must be understood in all its complexity 
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and multidimensionality, recognizing that the 
physical, emotional, social, and spiritual compo-
nents are mutually affected and cause a signifi-
cant impact on all domains of an individual’s life.

This multidimensionality shapes the concept of 
‘total pain’ proposed by Cicely Saunders in 1964, 
which is connected to the narrative and biography 
of every person and presupposes the need to lis-
ten to their history and understand their experi-
ence in a subjective and multifaceted way.39,40

Being able to understand and evaluate the total 
pain of a patient with a chronic disease is of para-
mount importance as part of the plan of care of a 
patient in palliative care. Over the last decades, 
knowledge, concepts, and therapeutic interven-
tions for the management of the pain in oncologic 
patients have evolved considerably. However, 
according to the International Society of Nurses 
Care (ISNCC),41 oncologic pain continues to be a 
prevailing symptom experienced by patients; once, 
in accordance with the estimation of WHO, of the 
five million people who die from cancer every year, 
four million people die with not controlled pain. 
Although approximately 90% of cases of pain in 
the oncologic patient can be effectively controlled, 
doing so still represents a challenge to health pro-
fessionals, making this suffering unnecessary.42

Understanding, evaluating, and recognizing the 
‘total pain’ of patients with a chronic disease is 
fundamental. Drug options are hardly effective to 
relieve pain if they are used in an isolated way; 
thus, it is necessary to unite pharmacological and 
non-pharmacological intervention, aiming at 
associations and full care for the multiple dimen-
sions of pain. ‘The physical pain is never alone: 
with it, the reminiscences of other pains experi-
enced by the individual become present’.43

The studies included in this review evidenced the 
importance of the effective participation of a mul-
tiprofessional team for the control of pain of peo-
ple with cancer. Understanding their health 
status, a good relationship with professionals and 
recognition of their suffering significantly improve 
the symptoms and distress experienced by them.

Various multidimensional instruments for evalu-
ating quality of life include questions for the eval-
uation of physical, emotional, spiritual, and social 
dimensions, but are not specific for the evaluation 
of pain. The implementation of an instrument for 

multidimensional pain assessment can be one 
way to sensitize the professionals who provide 
care, demanding knowledge, sensitivity, will-
power, and dedication, since it produces changes 
in the attitude and behavior of the multiprofes-
sional team.44 There are pain-specific unidimen-
sional assessments, but they should be considered 
within a set of other evaluations carried out with 
the patient, with caution not to overload profes-
sionals even more with different evaluation and 
intervention requirements.

With advances in technology, health services are 
becoming increasingly computerized. It is neces-
sary for information to be integrated and made 
available in an accessible format, simplifying and 
aiming to facilitate the work of professionals and, 
in consequence, benefiting the care provided to 
the patient.

Conclusion
This integrative literature review has highlighted 
the importance of knowledge in approaching of 
the total pain of oncologic patients, both in terms 
of scientific research and in terms of the optimiza-
tion of clinical practice in palliative care. However, 
we have observed that the concept of total pain is 
still little studied and applied in clinical practice, 
despite scientific advances in relation to the 
assessment of pain.

The findings evidence the importance of evaluat-
ing pain in oncologic patients in their various con-
texts and suggest an approach involving combined 
management of pain, symptoms, and emotional 
distress is necessary for the relief of these people’s 
suffering. The evaluation of pain of people in pal-
liative care must be done in a simple and satisfac-
tory way, aiming to clearly understand the date of 
onset, the duration, and the level of pain and the 
factors associated with it.

The multidisciplinary team must establish  
coordinated therapeutic goals and projects aim-
ing at the best management of symptoms, consid-
ering pain and suffering together and seeking 
measures to relieve the pain of these patients 
effectively. The use of multidimensional ques-
tionnaires can help identify the components of 
total pain and apply therapeutic resources defined 
according to the needs of each patient, in an inte-
grated manner and respecting their wishes and 
life history.
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It is fundamental that the team should look atten-
tively at the patient’s subjectivity and that they 
should have knowledge and training in the use of 
instruments for assessing pain to identify the fac-
tors associated with the pain situation and to pro-
mote actions complementary to the drug 
treatment for the appropriate and effective man-
agement and control of total pain.

Limitations of the study
The present review was based on searches per-
formed on five of the main international data-
bases, resulting in the discovery of relevant studies 
on the central theme of the study. It enabled the 
development of a synthesis of scientific knowl-
edge about the subject of pain in cancer, allowed 
the detection of gaps in the knowledge produced 
and offered relevant recommendations for better 
management of total pain in oncologic patients, 
in addition to the validation of the importance of 
a full and multidimensional evaluation.

Nevertheless, the selected publications did not 
present robust levels of scientific evidence, and 
the methodology applied in each article did not 
offer results that could be generalized. Therefore, 
the studies should be interpreted with caution, 
which limits the extension of these results.
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