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Endoscopic submucosal dissection (ESD) is a minimally 
invasive and advanced procedure for treating early gastric 
cancer, premalignant epithelial lesions, and superficial gastro-
intestinal lesions. The use of ESD was first reported in Japan in 
the late 1990s. Since then, it has become popular worldwide. 
This procedure is markedly superior to endoscopic mucosal 
resection, as ESD can achieve adequate and en bloc removal 
of tumors >20 mm to achieve R0 resection and has a lower 
recurrence rate.1

Despite this intrinsic superiority, ESD also requires techni-
cal proficiency and carries a risk of perforation and bleeding, 
especially with relatively inexperienced endoscopists.2 The in-
cidence and volume of treatment of diseases indicated for ESD 
are affected by the availability of skilled endoscopists, which 
affects therapeutic outcomes.3

Factors, such as lesion size and location, degree of submuco-
sal fibrosis, and submucosal invasion determine the difficulty 
of ESD. They can lengthen the required procedural time and 
result in incomplete resection and an increased risk of adverse 

events.4 In terms of location, the middle to upper stomach is 
technically challenging because of the more vascular structure, 
the high incidence of early gastric cancer with submucosal 
invasion, and the retroflexion approach in endoscopic dissec-
tion. Therefore, much research is being conducted to develop 
instruments and techniques to improve the effectiveness of 
ESD, such as the use of endoscopes and traction.5,6 However, 
there are limitations to their broad accessibility.

Although the gastric wall is thicker than other hollow vis-
cous organs, ESD techniques still involve meticulous dissec-
tion and hemostasis. Combining ESD with anesthesia achieves 
optimal conditions for a precise procedure. However, intrave-
nous sedation may be inadequate for a lengthy procedure, and 
a high volume of gastric inflation intraoperatively  may cause 
unexpected aspiration. General anesthesia (GA) is a feasible 
option for high-risk situations. Therefore, in institutions with 
an inadequate number of experienced anesthesiologists, seda-
tion was administered by a non-anesthesiologist as an alter-
native approach. In different contexts, various practices have 
been developed to minimize the risks presented by endoscop-
ic-resection anesthetic methods and to improve the quality of 
the results.7,8

In terms of monitored anesthesia care (MAC) and ESD, 
Chang et al.9 first published the outcomes and adverse events 
of ESD of lesions in the middle to upper stomach, compared 
to the use of GA and MAC. Their study used a propensity 
score analysis based on the pathology before endoscopic 
treatment and the number, size, and location of gastric lesions. 
Similar rates were observed for en bloc resection (GA, 95.7%; 
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MAC, 97.9%; P=0.68) and complete resection (GA, 81.9%; 
MAC, 84.0%; P=0.14), but with no significant difference in 
adverse events (GA, 16.0%; MAC, 8.5%; P=0.18). The overall 
cohort comprised all types of tumors in both the en bloc and 
complete resection groups, and the results were qualified ac-
cording to previously published evidence.10 Logistic regression 
analysis indicated that both GA and MAC did not influence 
the outcomes or adverse events. High-volume centers with 
specialized endoscopists, types of endoscopes, electrosurgical 
knives, and instruments are essential factors and influences. 
Further studies are required to evaluate and confirm the find-
ings in a prospective and large number of participants.

ESD is a challenging, advanced, and minimally invasive 
procedure that provides complete en bloc curative resection of 
superficial stomach lesions with histopathological information 
for proper management. The tailor-made anesthetic method 
for suitable patients in various contexts is ideal for our com-
munity of endoscopists. Although the outcomes of GA and 
MAC do not differ, minimizing gastric inflation, reducing the 
operating time, and achieving a proper sedation level through 
MAC are needed to avoid unexpected aspiration. The learning 
curve for this sophisticated endoscopic procedure still depends 
on patient volume and operator experience.
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