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1 	 | 	 INTRODUCTION

Cardiac	 hydatid	 cysts	 are	 uncommonly	 encountered	 en-
tity	of	hydatid	disease,	even	in	regions	where	hydatid	cysts	
are	endemic.	Most	patients	are	adults	and	asymptomatic.	
Presentation	may	be	with	non-	specific	symptoms	such	as	
dyspnea,	chest	pain,	palpitations,	cough,	and	sometimes	
with	 life-	threatening	 events.	 We	 present	 a	 rare	 case	 of	
a	 9-	year-	old	 girl	 who	 was	 diagnosed	 with	 a	 cardiac	 hy-
datid	cyst	 in	 the	right	ventricle,	and	underwent	surgical	
excision.

Since	 time	 immemorial,	 human	 Echinococcosis	 has	
represented	a	serious	disease	burden	of	global	concern.1,2	
It	 is	 a	 parasitic	 disease	 caused	 by	 the	 infection	 of	 lar-
val	 stages	 of	 tapeworms	 belong	 to	 genus	 Echinococcus	
through	 the	 ingestion	 of	 food	 or	 water	 contaminated	
with	 their	 eggs,	 or	 by	 a	 direct	 contact	 with	 the	 animal	
hosts.	 The	 development	 of	 the	 larvae	 of	 Echinococcus	
Granulosus	in	humans	(as	accidental	intermediate	hosts)	
leads	 to	 Cystic	 Echinococcosis	 (CE)	 (Hydatidosis).1-	3	
It	 is	 a	 hyperendemic	 disease	 in	 different	 regions	 of	 the	
world,	significantly	in	rural	areas.1,4	The	most	frequently	
involved	 organs	 by	 hydatidosis	 are	 liver	 (more	 than	

65%	 of	 cases)	 and	 lungs	 (both	 comprise	 at	 least	 90%	 of	
cases).1,5	 Cardiac	 hydatid	 disease	 is	 rare	 (0.5–	2%	 of	 all	
locations),	 and	 this	 may	 be	 due	 to	 the	 filtration	 of	 the	
embryos	 through	 the	 liver	 and	 lungs,	 and	 to	 the	 fact	
that	 cardiac	 rhythmic	 contractions	 prevent	 the	 cysts	 to	
implant	within	the	cardiac	wall.3,6	Clinical	presentation	
of	 cardiac	 hydatid	 cysts	 is	 quite	 variable	 and	 depends	
on	 the	 age,	 size,	 location,	 and	 integrity	 of	 the	 cyst.	 In	
the	 majority	 of	 cases,	 patients	 are	 asymptomatic.	 Most	
common	 reported	 symptoms	 are	 dyspnea,	 chest	 pain,	
palpitations,	 and	 cough.3,8,9	 On	 the	 other	 hand,	 it	 may	
present	with	life-	threatening	events	such	as	anaphylactic	
shock,	pulmonary	embolism,	acute	coronary	syndrome,	
or	 malignant	 arrhythmias	 due	 to	 subendocardial	 rup-
ture	which	leads	to	the	release	of	cyst	contents	into	the	
blood	stream.2,3,7	In	endemic	geographic	areas,	the	most	
important	issue	regarding	diagnosis	is	clinical	suspicion.	
Transthoracic	echocardiography	(TTE)	is	the	main	diag-
nostic	tool	for	cardiac	hydatid	disease.	Computed	tomog-
raphy	(CT)	and	magnetic	resonance	imaging	(MRI)	may	
provide	additional	diagnostic	information.2,3,7	Surgery	is	
the	treatment	of	choice	in	all	cases	to	achieve	higher	sur-
vival	rates	with	lower	recurrence.1-	10
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Abstract
Reporting	the	rare	cardiac	localization	of	hydatid	disease	in	the	right	ventricle	of	
a	child,	and	underlining	the	importance	of	early	diagnosis	and	treatment	to	avoid	
severe	and	life-	threatening	complications.
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2 	 | 	 CASE PRESENTATION

A	 nine-	year-	old	 girl	 from	 northern	 province	 in	 Syria	
presented	 to	 our	 hospital	 with	 recent	 developing	 ex-
ertional	 dyspnea.	 In	 her	 past	 medical	 history,	 she	 had	
undergone	surgical	resection	of	liver	hydatid	cysts	four	
years	 ago.	 TTE	 showed	 a	 50  ×  55  mm	 heterogeneous	
cystic	mass	localized	in	the	free	wall	of	the	right	ventri-
cle	 outlet	 causing	 moderate	 obstruction	 (Max	 gradient	
across	 right	 ventricular	 outflow	 tract	 was	 40  mm  Hg)	
(Figure  1).	 Routine	 laboratory	 tests	 were	 normal.	
Depending	on	TTE	findings,	the	patient's	demographic	
origin,	 and	 her	 surgical	 history,	 the	 diagnosis	 of	 right	
ventricle	hydatid	cyst	was	established.	After	a	5-	day	oral	
Albendazole	 course,	 surgery	 was	 performed	 through	
median	sternotomy,	and	cardiopulmonary	bypass	(CPB)	
was	prepared.	The	cyst	was	apparent	within	the	wall	of	
the	right	ventricle	outlet	(Figure 2).	The	operating	field	
was	isolated	by	medical	gauze	saturated	with	hypertonic	
saline	solution.	Without	arresting	the	heart,	a	small	in-
cision	 on	 right	 ventricular	 outlet	 was	 carried	 out.	 The	
contents	of	the	cyst	were	aspirated,	and	the	cyst	cavity	
was	 injected	 with	 30%	 saline	 solution.	 Then,	 the	 cyst	
was	 dissected	 and	 enucleated	 (Figure  3).	 The	 residual	
cavity	 of	 the	 cyst	 (Figure  4)	 was	 closed	 by	 direct	 con-
tinuous	 suturing.	 The	 patient	 convalescence	 in	 the	 in-
tensive	 care	 unit	 was	 uneventful	 and	 was	 discharged	
home	 six	 days	 later	 on	 albendazole	 for	 12  weeks.	 The	
patient	was	followed	up	for	2 years.	Serial	examinations	
by	TTE	showed	no	cardiac	recurrence,	and	the	patient	
was	asymptomatic.

3 	 | 	 DISCUSSION

CE	 is	 highly	 prevalent	 in	 southern	 and	 northern	 prov-
inces	of	Syria;	however,	epidemiologic	studies	on	human	
echinococcosis	 are	 still	 not	 available.11	 Our	 patient	 was	

from	 northeastern	 province	 in	 Syria,	 which	 is	 nota-
bly	 endemic	 for	 CE.	 In	 rare	 cases,	 the	 larvae	 reach	 the	
heart	mainly	 through	the	coronary	arteries	and	develop	
into	hydatid	cysts.	Young	adults	are	the	most	frequently	
affected,	 but	 very	 rare	 cases	 of	 cardiac	 hydatid	 cysts	 in	
children	 have	 been	 reported.	 Since	 it	 receives	 the	 most	
blood	supply,	the	left	ventricular	wall	is	most	frequently	
involved	 (55%–	60%),	 whereas	 the	 right	 ventricle	 is	 less	

F I G U R E  1  TTE	image	of	the	cyst	(The	Star)	in	the	right	
ventricle	in	four	chamber	view

F I G U R E  2  Intraoperative	image	showing	the	swelling	in	the	
right	ventricle	outlet	(The	Star)	which	refers	to	the	cyst

F I G U R E  3  Image	of	the	excised	cyst
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involved	 (10%–	15%).	 Our	 case	 is	 a	 rare	 presentation	 of	
cardiac	hydatid	cyst	within	the	right	ventricle	in	a	child.	
It	 has	 been	 reported	 that	 in	 cases	 of	 right	 ventricle	 hy-
datid	 cysts,	 intracavitary	 rupture	 is	 more	 frequent	 and	
may	lead	to	pulmonary	embolization,	pulmonary	hyper-
tension,	and	death.2,3,9,10	To	avoid	these	complications,	it	
is	crucial	to	make	an	urgent	diagnosis	and	investigations.	
High	index	of	suspicion	was	the	key	of	diagnosis	in	our	
case	 (the	 geographic	 origin	 and	 surgical	 history).	 There	
are	 multiple	 laboratory	 tests,	 such	 as	 Casoni's	 intrader-
mal	 test,	 the	 Weinberg	 reaction,	 and	 peripheral	 blood	
eosinophil	 count;	 however,	 they	 are	 not	 reliable	 since	
they	carry	false-	negative	results.7	Electrocardiogram	and	
chest	 radiograph	 are	 not	 specific.7	 TTE	 is	 the	 preferred	
diagnostic	modality	in	detecting	the	cysts	and	their	loca-
tion	 and	 size.3,7	 Other	 highly	 useful	 modalities	 include	
CT	and	MRI,	which	can	be	informative	for	a	better	sur-
gical	approach.3,5,7	The	surgical	excision	combined	with	
Albendazole	 therapy	 is	 still	 the	 gold	 standard	 for	 treat-
ment	of	 cardiac	hydatid	cysts.1-	10	 It	 is	possible	 to	excise	
the	 superficially	 or	 epicardially	 located	 cysts	 without	
the	use	of	CPB;	however,	it	is	more	recommended	to	use	
CPB	 as	 it	 shows	 higher	 safety	 and	 less	 risk	 of	 cyst	 con-
tents	leakage	during	surgery.7,8	In	order	to	reduce	the	cyst	
tension	and	avoid	an	accidental	 rupture,	 the	entire	cyst	
contents	must	be	aspirated.	Moreover,	 the	cyst	must	be	
injected	 with	 protoscolicidal	 agent	 to	 create	 an	 osmotic	
gradient	 that	 kills	 the	 protoscolices	 to	 avoid	 any	 possi-
ble	recurrence	in	case	of	their	spillage	or	locally	invasion	

during	 the	operation.	For	 this	purpose,	packing	 the	op-
erative	field	with	gauze	and	sponges	soaked	in	a	scolicidal	
agent	 is	 performed.	 We	 used	 hypertonic	 saline	 solution	
due	 to	 its	 effectiveness	 and	 relatively	 non-	toxicity.813	
Albendazole	 (400  mg	 twice	 daily)	 should	 be	 prescribed	
at	least	4 days	preoperatively	and	continued	for	12 weeks	
postoperatively.2,3,8,9	The	effectiveness	of	other	therapeu-
tic	 techniques	such	as	puncture,	aspiration,	 injection	of	
a	 scolicidal	 agent,	 reaspiration,	 and	 radiofrequency	 ab-
lation	 in	 the	 treatment	 of	 cardiac	 hydatid	 cysts	 is	 still	
unclear.8

4 	 | 	 CONCLUSION

Cardiac	hydatid	cyst	 is	very	uncommon	disease,	rarely	
affecting	 the	 right	 ventricle	 in	 children.	 The	 clinical	
course	 varies	 widely,	 and	 the	 presentation	 may	 be	 in-
sidious	with	persistent	potential	risk	of	life-	threatening	
events.	 CE	 must	 be	 suspected	 in	 endemic	 areas,	 diag-
nosed	with	appropriate	imaging	techniques,	and	treated	
appropriately.
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